Report Date: 1/1/2014

il Dally DrI"Ing Depth Progrzsegf);%ozr:
ConocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Dopth Ench 406,00mKB
Canadaw Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
( Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2
Tuwli Surface Legal Location MaxWell Job Number License No.
300E7665-10126-45 E-76 65-10 126-45 JOB01@2006 EL 470
Ground Elevation (m) Original KB/RT Elevation (m) Casing Flange Elevation (m) Original Spud Date Days From Spud (days)
268.20 273.40 268.00 12/28/2013 473
Job Category Primary Job Type Actual Start Date End Date Final Job Status Final Report?
DRILLING DRILLING ORIGINAL 12/9/2013 00:00 1/23/2014 23:59 DRILLED Yes
Daily Cost Total (Cost) Cumulative Cost (Cost) Total AFE (Cost) AFE+Supp Amt (Cost) AFE / RFE / Maint.# Estimated Days
75,264.33 2,135,131.45 6,820,300.00 6,820,300.00{ 10351817 34.19
Planned Depth (TMD) (mKB}) Override TVD (mKB) Head Count Personnel Total Hours (hr) Cum Personnel Total Hours (hr)
2,881.00 49.0 560.00 21,401.00
Avg Connection Gas Avg Background Gas Avg Trip Gas Max H2S (ppm)
Road Condition Weather Temperature (°C) Wind
lce/Snow Windy -34|NW 20 kms
-|Ops and Depth @ Morning Report Wellbore
Drill 311mm surface hole to 542m. Last survey at 508m was 0.7°. Original Hole

Last 24hr Summary
No incidents or accidents. 7 - HID, 0 - OBS and 0 - ASA (all closed out)

Wiper trip at 396m, back ream through tight spots. Drill 311mm surface hole from 396m to 490m with accumulated wireline surveys, rig services, connections and
circulation times. Last survey at 508m was 0.7°.

24hr Forecast

Drill 311mm surface hole with accumulated wireline surveys, rig services, connections and circulation times. Wiper trip at 590m+/- (strap out). Drill to 603m TD.
Daily Contacts

Drilling Superintend, Sheldon Vamplew, 403-999-1302; Drilling Engineer, Mike Greener, 403-771-5039; WS Supervisor, Richard Turgeon, 780-387-1706; WS
Supervisor, Dave Opper, 403-863-8205; Rig Manager, Rick Yavis, 780-718-2962; Command Centre, 403-910-0357

|Last Casing String

Conductor, 20.00mKB

Time Log
cestarty el e | e P e G ; Jebt Start Depth End Depth |50 i
Tifre. | End Time | Dur (hr). |- . ‘Phase-* | - Op Code Activity.Code |- T-X: Trbl Code: |- (mKB) (mKBY o | : -.Operation ; : :
90 |01:30 1.50 {SURFAC |DRILL WPRT P 396.00 396.00 | Trip out of hole back ream from 359m to 321m & clean up

hole

01:30 |01:45 0.25|SURFAC |RIGMNT |SVRG P 396.00 396.00 | Rig service function test crown saver

01:45 |03:30 1.75|SURFAC |RIGMNT RGRP T |Rig 396.00 396.00 | Replace broken fan belts in HPU

03:30 |06:30 3.00 |SURFAC |DRILL WPRT P 396.00 396.00 | Trip out of hole back ream from 321m to 120m circ hole clean

106:30 [07:30 1.00|SURFAC |DRILL DRLG P 396.00 396.00 | Circulate pull 4" bag out of rotating head

07:30 {08:00 0.50 |SURFAC |DRILL SFTY P 396.00 396.00 [Crew hand over meeting with rig crews, rig manager, Conoco
reps

08:00 |08:15 0.25|SURFAC |RIGMNT [SVRG P 396.00 396.00 |Rig service crown saver operating properly

08:15 [10:30 2.25|SURFAC |DRILL WPRT P 396.00 396.00 |Wiper trip out of hole pump and back ream to 60m

10:30 |10:45 0.25{SURFAC |RIGMNT SVRG P 396.00 396.00 |Check bit,Clean and prepare floor to trip in

10145 |11:00 0.25|SURFAC |DRILL WPRT P 396.00 396.00 | Trip in the hole to 30m

11:00 |11:15 0.25|SURFAC |RIGMNT SVRG P 396.00 396.00 ! Install 4inc bag into rotating head

11:15 |13:00 1.75|SURFAC |DRILL WPRT P 396.00 396.00 |Wiper trip into the hole to 376m

13:00 |14:30 1.50 [SURFAC [DRILL CIRC P 396.00 396.00 | Ream tight spot at 377m and reamed to bottom

14:30 |16:00 1.50 |SURFAC |DRILL DRLG P 396.00 415.00 |Rotary drill 311mm hole from 396m to 415m

16:00 |16:15 0.25|SURFAC |RIGMNT SVRG P 415.00 415.00 |Rig service crown saver operating properly

16:15 |19:00 2.75SURFAC |DRILL DRLG P 415.00 433.00 |Rotary drill 311mm hole from 415m to 433m

19:00 |19:15 0.25|SURFAC |DRILL SFTY P 433.00 433.00 | Crew hand over meeting with rig crews, rig manager, Conoco
reps

19:15 [23:15 4.00 [SURFAC |DRILL DRLG P 433.00 490.00 {Rotary drill 311mm hole from 433m to 490m

23:15 (00:00 0.75{SURFAC |DRILL SRVY P 490.00 490.00 | Acclumlated time for surveys

Fluid/Mud Chks: Mud Engineer: Ed Thompson

Time Depth (mKB) Density (kg/m?) Funnel Viscosity (s/L) pH PV Override (Pa*s) YP Override (Pa)

15:30 415.00 1,160.0 42 8.0 8.0 3.0
‘|Low Gravity Solids (%) |MBT (kg/m?) Qil Water Ratio Chlorides (mg/L) Calcium {mg/L) Lime (kg/m?) Potassium (mg/L)
9.8 2,100 120
~" stric Stab (V) ECD - Manual Entry (k...|Sand (%) Solids, Corr. (%) T Flowline (°C} HTHP Pressure {kPa) HTHP Filtrate (mL/30...
1,176.0 0.0 10.0 31
‘Al Filtrate (mL/30min) Mud Lost to Surface (m?) Mud Lost to Hole (m?) Daily Mud Field Est (Cost)
11.0 29.80
Cum Mud Lost to Surface (m®) Cum Mud Lost to Hole (m?) Cumulative Mud Cost {Cost)

2,485.08
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. A Report Date: 1/1/2014
C A Daily Drilling Dot proqCPOLH: 24
pth Progress: 94.00m
onocorhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Depth End: 40.00mKEB
Canada ¥ Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
( Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2
.t BOP Drill
Type Days Last Chk (... [|Last Date Days Until Next... |Next Check Date
BOP Dirill 4 12/28/2013 -1 12/31/2013
Days Since Lost Time Incident (days) Days Since Recordable Incident {days)
812.00 812.00
Safety Incidents
“Date 1_ Com Category.
(Drill String: BHA # 1
Bit Run |Drill Bit Length (m) 1ADC Bit Dull TFA (incl Noz) (mm?) BHA ROP (m/hr)
1A 311.0mm, J&L, B181332 0.34 1-2-NO-S-1-0-WT-TD 722 121
Nozzles (mm) String Length (m) OD (mm) Max Rotating Hook L.oad (daN)
15.9/15.9/15.9/12,7 603.00 311.0 55,000
Depth In (mKB) Depth Out (mKB) Avg ROP (m/hr) Depth This Job (m) Total Depth Drilled b...|Job Drill Hrs (hr) Total Drill Hrs (hr)
0.00 603.00 12.1 603.00 603.00 50.00 50.00
Comment
Rotary drill 311mm slick
Drill String Components
R : Item Des ID (mm) ODAmmY s ] e len(m): wCum.Len{m)::
4" HW 70.0 132.0 51 464.80 603.00
X/0-4%H-90 +62:0 162:04: 1 ++:0:80 138:20
6"D.C 60.0 160.0 9 84.00 137.40
Jar: 760} 157.0 A . 473 5340
6"D.C 60.0 160.0 3 27.90 48.67
Bell-sub: - 69.0 232.0 1 0.66 | 29;77
9"D.C 71.0 233.01- 2 18.50 20.11
Bit:sub - ; = 70:0 255:0 1 0.93{ 1.61
31Tmm BT T 72.0 311.0 1 0.34 0.68
| Drilling Parameter: 415.00 - 490.00 mKB
‘ Depth (m) [Cum Drill... |Int ROP (... [Flow Rate...|WOB (daN) |RPM (r... | SPP (kPa) Drill Str Wt (d... |SO Str Wt (daN) |PU Str Wt (daN) | Off-Btm Str W...|Drill Tq
. 490.00 34.25 11.1 2.600 15,000 120 14,500 54,000 53,000 56,000 54,000 6,600.0
Hydraulic Calculations /00w o i v oo i mng s e i ; : i S E L e
Bit Hydraulic Powe...|HP/Area (kW/mm?) % P @ bit (%) Bit Jet Velocity (m/s) | Bit dP (kPa) P Drop Annular (kPa) [Mud Density (kg/m®) |ECD End (kg/m®)
101.5 0.00134 16 60.0 2,342.1 271 1,160.0 1,165.6
Drill String Volume (m®) |Bit to Shoe Volume (m®) |Vol Shoe to Top (m®) Min Casing AV (m/min) |Max Casing AV (m/min) [Min Open Hole AV (m/...|Max Open Hole AV (m/..
1.77 27.89 3.43 15.1 15.1 4.7 104.4
Error
Mud Pump: 1, NATIONAL, 8-P-80
Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)
1 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
‘[Pump Checks
L snaDates Depth(mKB) < o ~QFlow (m3/min): e L R (kPa) : Sfrokes (spm)
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 0.499 5,150 64
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 1.014 17,500 130
Pump Operations
o Al StartDate. : : End Date <:LinerSize {mno)i i irn ks “ PMaxikPa) HVOIIStk OR (m¥/stk)
1/21/2014 1/21/2014 127.0
1/22/2014 1/22/2014 127.0
Mud Pump: 2, NATIONAL, 8-P-80
Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)
2 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
‘|Pump Checks
e it cDate s e :Depth(mKB): : " Q:-Flow{rm*/min) I P:(kPay s Strokes:(spm)::
1/19/2014 00:00 I 2,513.00 0.647 6,855 83
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.897 15,000 115
Pump Operations .
s Start Dats. R e EndiDatei = Linef Size (mm) P Max (kPa): i :VOlSCOR (mfstk)
1/19/2014 1/19/2014 127.0 15,000
1/71/2014 127.0
«er Screens
Mg ool Start Date: -End:Date. i | : SerdziX o SerSzY 2 Note
Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
Number Make Model Diameter (mm)
1|BOS Solutions 5500
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Report Date: 1/1/2014
Report #: 24

y Ml H Dally Drl"lng Depth Progress: 94.00m
ConocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Dopth End: 490.00mKB
Canada ¥ Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
(’ Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2
_itrifuge/Cyclone Checks
lERE Daté: Hrs (fir) RPM:(rpm) :Dens OF (kg/m®). i Q:OF:{L/min) Dens UE: (kg/m®) “EQEUF (Lmin)
'11/19/2014 07:00 2.00 1800 1,000.0 0.400 2,100.0 0.200
Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
Number Make Model Diameter (mm})
2|BOS Solutions 5500
Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks
SR Daté Hrs:(hr) RPM:{rpm) Dens OF:(kg/m?) Q OF(Limin) Dens UF:(kg/m?) Q UF:{L/min)
1/19/2014 13:00 3.00 2000 990.0 0.400 1,700.0 0.200
Fluid / Mud Additive Amounts
. o i ; i Des Gonsumed Cost : Size Units:
Sawdust 10.0 2.980 7.3|SX
Survey Data
s e Daté MD (mKB): 5% Iniel(y Azm.(2) TVD(mKB) "2 Depart (i) NS:(rm): EWV:(m) 2 VSH{m) DLS (2/30m).
1/1/12014 396.00 0.60 0.00 395.98 3.22 3.22 0.00 1.56 0.33
1/1/2014 433.00 0.60 0.00 432.98 3.61 3.61 0.00 1.75 0.00
1/1/2014 461.00 0.60 0.00 460.98 3.90 3.90 0.00 1.89 0.00
1/1/2014 489.00 0.50 0.00 488.98 4.17 417 0.00 2.02 0.11
Formations
L i : 72’ Formation:Name L . Drill Top:MD+{mKB); - Drill Top (TVD){mKB) 2 Prog:Top TVD (mKB): ==+ |
Little Bear 31.00 31.00 31.00
Slater.River:: 76.00 76.00_I 76:00
Arctic Red 800.50 800.46 76.40
Martin:House 938.50 +938:44 '76:40
Imperial 975.50 975.43 76.40
Upper €anol 1,665.00: 1,65853] - 1,653:40
Lower Canol 1,700.72 1,689.07 |: 1,694.40
(
Rpt Template Revised: 8/11/2008 Page 3/3 Report Printed: 4/14/2014




(

Report Date: 1/2/2014

> HIH Dally D""Ing Depth Progregsp’?ﬁ)’ﬁozrﬁ
ConocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Dopth End: 600.00mKB
Canada ¥ Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
- Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2
1 UwI Surface Legal Location MaxWell Job Number License No.
300E7665-10126-45 E-76 65-10 126-45 JOB01@2006 EL 470
Ground Elevation (m) Original KB/RT Elevation (m) Casing Flange Elevation {m) Original Spud Date Days From Spud (days)
268.20 273.40 268.00 12/28/2013 5.73
Job Category Primary Job Type Actual Start Date End Date Final Job Status Final Report?
DRILLING DRILLING ORIGINAL 12/9/2013 00:00 1/23/2014 23:59 DRILLED Yes
Daily Cost Total (Cost) Cumulative Cost (Cost) Total AFE (Cost) AFE+Supp Amt (Cost) AFE | RFE / Maint.# Estimated Days
08,248.78 2,233,380.23 6,820,300.00 6,820,300.00(10351817 34.19
Planned Depth (TMD) (mKB) Override TVD (mKB) Head Count Personnel Total Hours (hr) Cum Personnel Total Hours (hr)
2,881.00 47.0 536.00 21,937.00
Avg Connection Gas Avg Background Gas Avg Trip Gas Max H2S (ppm)
Road Condition Weather Temperature (°C) Wind
Ice/Snow Windy -28|NW 20 kms
.|Ops and Depth @ Morning Report Welibore
Ream/wash to bottom from 569m. Last survey at 571m was 0.5°. Original Hole
Last 24hr Summary

No incidents or accidents. 10 - HID, 0 - OBS and 0 - ASA (all closed out)

Drill 311mm surface hole from 490m to 592m with accumulated wireline surveys, rig services, connections and circutation times. Wiper trip at 592m, back ream
through tight spots. Last survey at 571m was 0.5°.

24hr Forecast
Drill to 603m (TD). Pull out of the hole (Backream through tight spots). Lay down 6" and 9" drill collars, rig up power tongs and run 244.5mm surface casing.

Daily Contacts
Drilling Superintend, Sheldon Vamplew, 403-999-1302; Drilling Engineer, Mike Greener, 403-771-5039; WS Supervisor, Richard Turgeon, 780-387-1706; WS
Supervisor, Dave Opper, 403-863-8205; Rig Manager, Rick Yavis, 780-718-2962; Command Centre, 403-910-0357

Last Casing String
Conductor, 20.00mKB

Time Log
i Tim o 5=k
‘Start:: - . e : e ClePif End Depthi - feais :
Tirne:= | End Time]: Bur (hr) Phase +:0p Code. - | Activity.Cade|. T-X | Trbl Code (MKBY ™ | KBy e Operation
90 |00:16 0.25 |SURFAC |RIGMNT |SVRG P 490.00 490.00 |Rig service function test crown saver
5 |07:15 7.00 |SURFAC |DRILL DRLG P 490.00 555.00 {Rotary drill 311 mm hole from 490 m to 555m
07:15 |07:45 0.50 [SURFAC |DRILL SRVY P 555.00 555.00 | Accumulated time for surveys & connections
07:45 |08:00 0.25{SURFAC |DRILL SFTY P 555.00 555.00 |Crew hand over meeting with rig crews, rig manager, Conoco
reps
08:00 |09:15 1.25|SURFAC |DRILL DRLG P 555.00 564.00 |Rotary drill 311mm hole from 555m to 564m
09:15 |09:30 0.25|SURFAC |RIGMNT |SVRG P 564.00 564.00 | Rig service crown saver operating properly
09:30 |15:15 5.75|SURFAC |DRILL DRLG P 564.00 592.00 [ Rotary drill 311mm hole from 564m to 592m
15:15 [16:00 0.75 |SURFAC |DRILL CIRC P 592.00 592.00 | Circulate hole clean to wiper trip
16:00 |16:15 0.25|SURFAC |RIGMNT [SVRG P 592.00 592.00 | Rig service function test crown saver and motor kills
16:15 |19:00 2.75|SURFAC |DRILL WPRT P 592.00 592.00 |Wiper trip out and pump and back ream
19:00 |19:16 0.25 |SURFAC |DRILL SFTY P 592.00 592.00 | Crew hand over meeting with rig crews, rig manager, Conoco
reps
19:15 |00:00 4.75{SURFAC |DRILL WPRT [P 592.00 592.00 | Trip out of hole back ream from 462m to 223m. Strap out of
hole, Drilling tally = 592.66m. Strap tally = 592,76m. Diff. =
0.10m.
Fluid/Mud Chks: Mud Engineer: Ed Thompson
Time Depth (mKB) Density (kg/m?) Funnel Viscosity (s/L) pH PV Override (Paes) YP Override (Pa)
14:15 589.00 1,170.0 80 8.0 8.0 3.0
Low Gravity Solids (%) |MBT (kg/m?) Qil Water Ratio Chlorides (mg/L) Calcium (mg/L) Lime (kg/m?) Potassium (mg/L)
9.8 2,100 120
Electric Stab (V) ECD - Manual Entry (k...|Sand (%) Solids, Corr. (%) T Flowline (°C) HTHP Pressure (kPa) HTHP Fiitrate (mL/30...
1,176.0 0.0 10.0 31
API Filtrate (mL/30min) Mud Lost to Surface (m?) Mud Lost to Hole (m?) Daily Mud Field Est (Cost)
11.0 1,903.75
Cum Mud Lost to Surface (m?) Cum Mud Lost to Hole (m?) Cumulative Mud Cost (Cost)
4,388.83
Last BOP Drill
Type Days Last Chk (... |Last Date Days Until Next... |Next Check Date
BOP Drill 5 12/28/2013 -2 12/31/2013
3 Since Lost Time Incident (days) Days Since Recordable Incident (days)
813.00 813.00
Safety Incidents
- Dateriia GO Srad : L = W e Categonyss .
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Report Date: 1/2/2014

y illi Daily Dri"ing Depth Pro rel::!);aﬁ)iﬁozri
Conocolzhllllps COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Dopth End: 600.00mKEB
anadaw Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014

Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2

( | String: BHA #1

oit Run | Drill Bit Length (m) IADC Bit Dull TFA (incl Noz) (mm?) BHA ROP (m/hr)
1A 311.0mm, J&L, B181332 0.34 1-2-NO-S-1-0-WT-TD 722 121
Nozzles (mm) String Length (m) OD (mm) Max Rotating Hook Load (daN)
15.9/15.9/15.9/12.7 603.00 311.0 55,000
Depth In (mKB) Depth Out (mKB) Avg ROP (m/hr) Depth This Job (m) Total Depth Drilled b...|Job Drill Hrs (hr) Total Drill Hrs (hr)

0.00 603.00 12.1 603.00 603.00 50.00 50.00
Comment

Rotary drill 311Tmm slick
Drill String Components

SO S S Iterm:Des: : : 3 - ID:(mm): g ‘OB (mm) Jis Len{m): . Sccumien:(m)y
4" HW 70.0 132.0 51 464.80 603.00
XI0 44 H-90 : i T E . ; ; ; 62:0:) o 162.0:) 1 0.80 : 138:20 v
6"D.C 60.0 160.0 9 84.00 137.40
J‘a‘r' G . e S - = "76.0 ; e 157‘0 1: S g3 25340
6"D.C | 60.0 160.0 I 3 27.90 48.67
LBeII ,S.Ub 7 - D , | 69.0: : 232:0.F : 1 066 20.77
9"D.C 71.0 233.0 2 18.50 20.11
Bitsub: =~ : s : : a 70:0.]: - . 255.0 5 1 093 [ =
311mm BIT I 72.0 311.0' 1 0.34 0.68
Drilling Parameter: 555.00 - 592.00 mKB
Cum Depth {m) [Cum Drill... {Int ROP {(... |Flow Rate..|WOB (daN) |RPM (r... | SPP (kPa) Drill Str Wt (d... |SO Str Wt (daN) |PU Str Wt (daN) |Off-Btm Str W...|Drill Tq
592.00 48.25 5.3 2.300 16,000 110 15,100 52,000 49,000 55,000 52,000 4,820.0
Hydraulic Calculations - - i o LR S e L e e
Bit Hydraulic Powe...|HP/Area (kW/mm?) % P @ bit (%) Bit Jet Velocity (m/s) |Bit dP (kPa) P Drop Annular (kPa) |Mud Density (kg/m®) |ECD End (kg/m?®)
70.9 0.00093 12 53.1 1,848.6 26.1 1,170.0 1,174.5
Drill String Volume (m?®) |Bit to Shoe Volume (m?) |Vol Shoe to Top (m?) Min Casing AV (m/min)} |Max Casing AV (m/min) {Min Open Hole AV (m/...|Max Open Hole AV (m/..
217 34.24 3.43 13.4 13.4 36.9 92.4
Error
1 Pump: 1, NATIONAL, 8-P-80
- .p Number Make Model Rod Diameter {(mm) Stroke Length (mm)
1 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 . 216.0
Pump Checks
| o Date: : ISR 4 5 Depth (mKB) i ¢ Qe Flow:fmYmin) : S P (kPay : Strokes:(spm)
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 0.499 5,150 64
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 1.014 17,500 130
Pump Operations
E e Start Date’=: o fe End-Date S s liner Sizer (i) g =P Max (kPa) i #EVBIStk OR (m¥/stk)
1/21/12014 1/21/2014 127.0
_ 1/22/12014 1/22/2014 127.0
Mud Pump: 2, NATIONAL, 8-P-80
Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)
2 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks
Sl i Dates NSk ey - - Depth.{mKB) 5 5, Q Flow (m¥min): . P:(kPa) i Gfrokes (spm)iit
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.647 6,855 83
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.897 15,000 115
Pump Operations
G sioviStart Datelcn oo s : : EndDatessias: “Liner Size:(mm):. i : P Maxi(kPa)zas s m s LV olfStk OR {m3fstk):
1/19/2014 1/19/2014 127.0 15,000
1/21/2014 127.0
Shaker Screens

spegiisl i el el v StaTEDate: : ¥ B End Date : : ScriSz X i ' e SerSz Y . Note

Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500

Number Make Model Diameter (mm)
1|BOS Solutions 5500

Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks

sl R 2 Date; i SRRl [ a o e RPM:(rpm)= :Dens OF (Kg/im®) s QEOR(mIN) Dens UF(kg/m?) = QUF (Limin)>
Y2014 07:00 2.00 1800 1,000.0 0.400 2,100.0 0.200

N .ntrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500

Number Make Model Diameter (mm)
2{BOS Solutions 5500
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Report Date: 1/2/2014

h Dally D”"Ing Depth Pro rezz-p';"lr:)’gozni
ConocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Depth End: 600.00mKB
Canadaw Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
. Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2
irifuge/Cyclone Checks
5 Hrs:(hr): RPM:{rpm) Deéns: OF-{ka/m? QOF{LE/min) Den's UF (kg/m?) QUF(Limin) :
1/19/2014 13:00 3.00 2000 990.0 0.400 1,700.0 0.200
Fluid / Mud Additive Amounts
i : s e Dés Constimed Cost: Sizé Units
Gel 58.0 7.200 40.0[SX
Kelzan: 4.0 360450 =250 I_'SX;
Sawdust 10.0 2.980 7.3[SX
Soda Ash #1:0 14.550 22.68|SX 2
Survey Data
s - EDateE s MD(mKB) Incl(?) AZmAS): 2 TVD (mKB) -Depart(m) NS (m) ] e EW () VS (m) DLS,(°/30m)
1/2/2014 508.00 0.70 0.00 507.98 4.37 4.37 0.00 2.12 0.32
1/2/2014 544.00 0.40 0.00 543.97 4.71 4.71 0.00 2.29 0.25
1/2/2014 571.00 0.50 0.00 570.97 493 4.93 0.00 2.39 0.11
Formations
Shtpnhesiae o Formation:Name: =-DrillTop MD (mKB) *-:Drill-Top (TVD) (mKB).- : - Prog.Top TVD (mKB}:::
Little Bear 31.00 31.00 '_ 31.00
Slater:River: 76.00] - 7600 | 76 .00
Arctic Red 800.50 800.46 76.40
Martin House: = - == = 938.50 7938.44 . 76.40
Imperial 975.50 975.43 76.40
Uppet Canol o 11,665.00 11,658:563 +1,653.40
|Lower Canol —I' 1,700.72 1,689.07 1,694.40
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Report Date: 1/3/2014
Report #: 26

- Da'ly DrI"lng Depth Progress: 11.00m
ConocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Dopth End: 603.00mKEB
Canada ¥ Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
- Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2
fuwi Surface Legal Location MaxWell Job Number License No.
~wUE7665-10126-45 E-76 65-10 126-45 JOB01@2006 EL 470
| Ground Elevation (m) Original KB/RT Elevation {m) Casing Flange Elevation (m) Original Spud Date Days From Spud (days)
268.20 273.40 268.00 12/28/2013 6.73
Job Category Primary Job Type Actual Start Date End Date Final Job Status Final Report?
DRILLING DRILLING ORIGINAL 12/9/2013 00:00 1/23/2014 23:59 DRILLED Yes
Daily Cost Total (Cost) Cumulative Cost (Cost) Total AFE (Cost) AFE+Supp Amt (Cost) AFE / RFE / Maint.# Estimated Days
76,202.91 2,309,583.14 6,820,300.00 6,820,300.00[ 10351817 34.19
Planned Depth (TMD) (mKB) Override TVD (mKB) Head Count Personnel Total Hours (hr) Cum Personnel Total Hours (hr)
2,881.00 47.0 536.00 22,473.00
Avg Connection Gas Avg Background Gas Avg Trip Gas Max H2S (ppm)
Road Condition Weather Temperature (°C) Wind
Ice/Snow Clear -42INW 10 kms.
{Ops and Depth @ Morning Report Wellbore
Cement 603m (TD) of 244.5mm casing. Original Hole

Last 24hr Summary
No incidents or accidents. 13 - HID, 1 - OBS and 0 - ASA (all closed out)

Wiper trip at 592m, ream through tight spots. Drill to 603m (TD), work drill string and circulate hole clean. Pull out of the hole, lay down 6-1/2" and 9" drill collars, rig
up power tongs and run 244.5mm surface casing.

24hr Forecast
Cement 244.5mm surface casing, nipple down diverter, weld on casing bowl, nipple up BOP and pressure test manifold and BOP components.

Daily Contacts
Drilling Superintend, Sheldon Vamplew, 403-999-1302; Drilling Engineer, Mike Greener, 403-771-5039; WS Supervisor, Richard Turgeon, 780-387-1706; WS
Supervisor, Dave Opper, 403-863-8205; Rig Manager, Rick Yavis, 780-718-2962; Command Centre, 403-910-0357

Last Casing String
'|Conductor, 20.00mKB

Time Log
= Ak Tim T : s

CeStartol - et e e e e P Cel StartDepth: | - End' Depth : i

¢ Timeé | End Time | Dur(hr) . - Phase - |+ Op/Code - | Activity. Code |: T-X:{ . Trbl.Code (mKB) “(mKB) £ Operation . -

00:00 [01:30 1.50 |SURFAC |DRILL WPRT [P 592.00 592.00 | Trip out of hole & strap out

50 ]01:45 0.25|SURFAC |RIGMNT SVRG P 592.00 592.00 |Rig service function test crown saver

U1:45 |04:45 3.00 |SURFAC |DRILL WPRT [P 592.00 592.00 | Trip in hole, hit bridge at 336 m clean up hole from 336 m to
345 m and run in hole

04:45 [06:30 1.75|SURFAC |DRILL REAM P 592.00 592.00 [Ream and clean to bottom from 541 m to 592 m

06:30 {07:45 1.25|SURFAC |DRILL DRLG P 592.00 600.00 |Rotary drill 311mm hole from 592m to 600m

07:45 108:00 0.25[SURFAC |DRILL SFTY P 600.00 600.00 |Crew hand over meeting with rig crews, rig manager, Conoco
reps

08:00 |08:30 0.50 [SURFAC |DRILL DRLG P 600.00 603.00 | Rotary drill 311mm hole from 600m to 603m

08:30 |08:45 0.25|SURFAC |RIGMNT [SVRG P 603.00 603.00 |Rig service function test rig smart function test crown saver

08:45 109:30 0.75|SURFAC |DRILL CIRC P 603.00 603.00 [ Circ and condition mud and prepair to come out of hole at
surface

09:30 . |11:15 1.75 | SURFAC |DRILL TRIP P 603.00 603.00 | Trip out of hole to 126m, drill collars, to run casing

11:15 [11:30 0.25 |SURFAC |DRILL SFTY P 603.00 603.00 | Safety meeting reviewed jsa#161 lay down drill collars

11:30 (13:30 2.00 [SURFAC |DRILL PULD P 603.00 603.00 |Lay down BHA, 6" and 9" drill collars

13:30 |14:00 0.50 f[SURFAC |RIGMNT [SVRG P 603.00 603.00 | Clean and prepare floor to run csg

14:00 |16:00 2.00 [SURFAC |CASING RNCS P 603.00 603.00 |Rig up power tongs & laydown truck to run 244.5mm surface
casing/rig out lay down truck due to broken hyd ram

16:00 [16:15 0.25 |SURFAC |RIGMNT SVRG P 603.00 603.00 [Rig service, function, crown saver, operating properly

16:15 |16:30 0.25 |SURFAC |CASING SFTY P 603.00 603.00 | Safety meeting with Hallmark power tongs Reviewed jsa#97
Rig up power tongs, jsa#99 install, 244.5mm float and shoe
and run casing

16:30 [19:00 2.50 |[SURFAC CASING RNCS P 603.00 603.00 |Run surface, 244.5mm, 53.6kg/m,K-55, LT&C casing with
hallmark power tongs

19:00 |19:15 0.25{SURFAC |CASING SFTY P 603.00 603.00 | Crew hand over meeting with rig crews, rig manager, Conoco
reps

119:15 [19:30 0.25|SURFAC |CASING SFTY P 603.00 603.00 | Safety meeting with night crew, jsa #99, running casing

19:30 |00:00 4.50 |SURFAC [CASING RNCS P 603.00 603.00 |Run 244.5mm, 53.6kg/m,K-55, LT@C casing, with Hallmark

power tongs
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V 8 d i
ConocoPhillips
Canadaw

COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45

Daily Drilling

Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2

Report Date: 1/3/2014

Report #: 26

Depth Progress: 11.00m

Depth End: 603.00mKB

Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014

d/Mud Chks: Mud Engineer: Ed Thompson

—

1ime Depth (mKB) Density (kg/m3) Funnel Viscosity (s/L) pH PV Override (Pa*s) YP Override (Pa)
08:00 603.00 1,210.0 95 8.5 27.0 11.5
Low Gravity Solids (%) [MBT (kg/m°) Oil Water Ratio Chlorides (mg/L) Calcium (mg/L) Lime (kg/m?) Potassium (mg/L)
12.9 2,300 120
Electric Stab (V) ECD - Manual Entry (k...|Sand (%) Solids, Corr. (%) T Flowline (°C) HTHP Pressure (kPa) HTHP Filtrate (mL/30...
1,240.0 0.0 13.1 37
API Filtrate (mL/30min) Mud Lost to Surface (m?) Mud Lost to Hole (m?) Daily Mud Field Est (Cost)
i 9.0 17.88
Cum Mud Lost to Surface (m?) Cum Mud Lost to Hole (m°) Cumulative Mud Cost (Cost)
4,406.71
Last BOP Drill
Type Days Last Chk (... |Last Date Days Until Next... [Next Check Date
BOP Drill 6 12/28/2013 -3 12/31/2013
Days Since Lost Time Incident (days) Days Since Recordable Incident (days)
814.00 814.00
Safety Incidents
Date ::Com ‘Category.
Drill String: BHA # 1
Bit Run [Drill Bit Length (m) IADC Bit Duit TFA (incl Noz) (mm?) BHA ROP (m/hr)
1A 311.0mm, J&L, B181332 0.34 1-2-NO-S-1-0-WT-TD 722 121
Nozzles (mm) String Length (m) OD (mm) Max Rotating Hook Load (daN)
15.9/15.9/15.9/12.7 603.00 311.0 55,000
Depth In (MKB) Depth Out (mKB) Avg ROP (m/hr) Depth This Job (m) Total Depth Drilled b...|Job Drill Hrs (hr) Total Drill Hrs (hr)
0.00 603.00 12.1 603.00 603.00 50.00 50.00
Comment
Rotary drill 311mm slick
Drill String Components
o : : +: - ltem:Dés ID{mm) : .OD:{mm) Jsis Len(m)-.n Cum:Len (m):
4" HW 70.0 132.0 51 464.80 603.00
T4t H90 62.0 ,1,62.0J_ 1‘ O.BQ 138.20
. J.C 60.0 160.0 9 84.00 137.40
Jar =760 157.0 1 4.73| 53.40
6" D.C 60.0 160.0 3 27.90 48.67
’Bell sub:o £69.0 | 232:0 1J_ 0.66 2077
9"D.C 71.0 233.0 2 18.50 20.11
,Bit sub ! 700 2550 1 0:93 . 1.61
311mm BIT 72.0 311.0 1 O.34| 0.68
Drilling Parameter: 600.00 - 603.00 mKB
Cum Depth (m) [Cum Drill... |Int ROP (... [Flow Rate...|WOB (daN) |RPM (r... [SPP (kPa) Drill Str Wt (d... | SO Str Wt (daN) |PU Str Wt (daN) |Off-Btm Str W...| Drill Tq
603.00 50.00 6.0 2.200 17,000 110 15,000 55,000 53,000 57,000 55,000 8,800.0
Hydraulic Calculations: . = ‘ : s : : = i : : ke e
Bit Hydraulic Powe...|HP/Area (kW/mm?) % P @ bit (%) Bit Jet Velocity (m/s) |Bit dP (kPa) P Drop Annular (kPa) [Mud Density (kg/m® [ECD End (kg/m?)
64.1 0.00084 12 50.8 1,749.1 143.0 1,210.0 1,234.2
Drill String Volume (m®) |Bit to Shoe Volume (m®) |Vol Shoe to Top (m?®) Min Casing AV (m/min) [Max Casing AV (m/min) [Min Open Hole AV (m/...|Max Open Hole AV (m/..
2.21 34.93 3.43 12.8 12.8 35.3 88.4
Error
Mud Pump: 1, NATIONAL, 8-P-80
Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)
1 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks
iy s Date Depth'(mKBY: 2= *Q Flow.:(m¥min) ~2R:{kPa) i - Strokes{spm) i
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 0.499 5,150 64
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 1.014 17,500 130
Pump Operations
: Start Date o B 8 End-Date:. - . Liner Sizé.(mm) P:Max.(kPa) Vol/Stk OR: (m?/stk)
1/21/2014 1/21/2014 127.0
1/22/2014 1/22/2014 127.0
Mud Pump: 2, NATIONAL, 8-P-80
p Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)
o NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks
R s Daters “#Depth: (mKB): 5 2@ Flow: (mefmin):: s R{kPa) i #1:Strokes{spm)
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.647 6,855 83
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.897 15,000 115
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V Ld .
ConocoPhillips
Canadaw

Daily Drilling

Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2

COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45

Report Date: 1/3/2014
Report #: 26

Depth Progress: 11.00m
Depth End: 603.00mKB

Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014

np Operations

; Start Date:": G End Date +:iliner:-Size (mm) A PiMax (KPa) iz i = VolIStk:OR :(m¥stk)
11/19/2014 1/19/2014 127.0 15,000
1/21/2014 127.0
Shaker Screens
= :Des i Start Date +:Eng Dates SerSz:% Ser Sz, Y. i_ : Note =
Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
Number Make Model Diameter (mm)
1|BOS Solutions 5500
Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks
v g i Date Hrsi{hr) RPM:(rpm) Dens OF:(kg/m?) Q OF:{L/min) Dens UF (kg/m?) Q-UF {Limin) :
1/19/2014 07.00 2.00 1800 1,000.0 0.400 2,100.0 0.200
Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
Number Make Model Diameter (mm)
2|BOS Solutions 5500
Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks
i i Dates : - Hrsi(hr) < 2REM:(rpm} Dens OF: tkg/m?) - . Q.OF (L/min) .o < Dens UE(kg/m?) 2 QUUE(Efmin)
1/19/2014 13:00 3.00 2000 990.0 0.400 1,700.0 0.200
Fluid / Mud Additive Amounts
S ; Des Consumed ., Cost. Size Units:
Sawdust 6.0 2.980 7.3|8X
Survey Data
5 . ;Dates: MD:{mKB) Inok (e | Az (%) TVD{KB) Depart (m) 22 NS (m) 2 EW.(m) VS (m): < DLS (°/30m) -
Formations
G Formation:Narme ;. Diill Top:MD{mKB) < Brilk Top:(TVD){mKB) Prog Top-TVD{(mKB)
Little Bear 31.00 31.00 31.00
SlaterRiver 76:00 76.00} 76.00
Arctic Red 800.50 800.46 76.40
tin:House 03850 93844 7640
‘nriperial 975.50 975.43 76.40
Upper Canol: 1,665.00 1,658.53 165340
Lower Canol 1,700.72 | 1,689.07 1,694.40
Rpt Template Revised: 8/11/2008 Page 3/3 Report Printed: 4/14/2014




Report Date: 1/4/2014
Report #: 27

~wE7665-10126-45

> MH Dally Drllllng Depth Progress: 0.00m
ConocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Dopth End: 605,00mKB
Canadaw Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
- Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2
FUWI Surface Legal Location MaxWell Job Number License No.
E-76 65-10 126-45 JOB01@2006 EL 470

Ground Elevation {m) Original KB/RT Elevation (m) Casing Flange Elevation (m) Original Spud Date Days From Spud (days)
268.20 273.40 268.00 12/28/2013 7.73
Job Category Primary Job Type Actual Start Date End Date Final Job Status Final Report?
DRILLING DRILLING ORIGINAL 12/9/2013 00:00 1/23/2014 23:59 DRILLED Yes
Daily Cost Total (Cost) Cumulative Cost (Cost) Total AFE (Cost) AFE+Supp Amt (Cost) AFE / RFE / Maint.# Estimated Days
329,910.69 2,639,493.83 6,820,300.00 6,820,300.00] 10351817 34.19
Planned Depth (TMD) (mKB) Override TVD (mKB) Head Count Personnel Total Hours (hr) Cum Personnel Total Hours (hr)
2,881.00 47.0 536.00 23,009.00
Avg Connection Gas Avg Background Gas Avg Trip Gas Max H2S (ppm)
Road Condition Weather Temperature {°C) Wind
Ice/Snow Windy -34|SW
'|Ops and Depth @ Morning Report Wellbore
Pressure test manifold. Original Hole

Last 24hr Summary

later run water through d

ehydrator.

No incidents or accidents. 12 - HID, 1 - OBS and 0 - ASA (all closed out)

Run 244.5mm surface casing, tag bottom at 603m, circulate and clean the hole. Cement 244 .5mm surface casing: full returns, 8.0m3 of good cement returns, plug
down at 7:45hrs, pressure test surface casing to 11,500kPA, pressure held ok. Rig out cementers, wait on cement and clean substructure, nipple down diverter,
weld on casing bowl, nipple up BOP, clean mud tanks, strip surface mud using the BOS Ill flocking system, transfer surface mud and clean water to 400bbl tanks to

24hr Forecast

Pressure test manifold and BOP components, conduct an accumulator function test. Pick and make up 222mm directional BHA and run in the hole.

Daily Contacts

Drilling Superintend, Sheldon Vamplew, 403-999-1302; Drilling Engineer, Mike Greener, 403-771-5039; WS Supervisor, Richard Turgeon, 780-387-1706; WS
Supervisor, Dave Opper, 403-863-8205; Rig Manager, Rick Yavis, 780-718-2962; Command Centre, 403-910-0357

Last Casing String
Surface, 603.00mKB

Time Log

A‘;

{

Tl : Tim :

Cetartoa B | s i ep: - :Start Depth End Depth - (" o A

Ae::[ End Time | Dur{hr):| = Phase=" /| .. Op-Code: . | Activity Code{ T=X | * Trbl Code (mKB).. (mKB). """ v S _Opératioh : -

. .00 |02:30 2.50 |SURFAC |CASING RNCS P 603.00 603.00 |Run 244.5mm, 53.57kg/m, K-55, LTC surface casing from
603m to 5.20m with Hallmark power tongs. Total length of
244 .5mm surface casing: 603.83m. Landed at 603m, tagged
bottom at 603m, float at 589.01m.

02:30 [02:45 0.25|SURFAC |RIGMNT |SVRG P 603.00 603.00 |Rig service function test crown saver

02:45 {05:00 2.25|SURFAC |CASING CIRC P 603.00 603.00 | Circulate & condition mud & hole

05:00 |05:15 0.25[SURFAC |CEMENT ([SFTY P 603.00 603.00 |Hold safety meeting with cementers and everyone on location
prior to cementing 244.5mm surface casing.

05:15 106:30 1.25|SURFAC |CEMENT {CMNT P 603.00 603.00 |Rig up Schiumberger cementers to cement 244.5mm surface
casing, pump 5m3 of 1000kg/m3 fresh water, stop and
pressure test line to 21,000kPA (held OK), bleed off pressure.

06:30 |07:00 0.50 {[SURFAC |CEMENT [CMNT P 603.00 603.00 | Then pump 5m3 of 1300kg/m3 MudPush Il pre-flush spacer
and then pump 32 tonnes/29.5m3 (50% excess) of RFC 1740
cement with 0.2% Anti-Foam + 1.0% CaClI2 + 1.1% Low
Temp Fluid Loss + 0.6% Dispersant from 603m to 5.20m.
Drop plug and displace 23.8m3 of fresh water.

07:00 |07:30 0.50 [SURFAC (CEMENT [CMNT P 603.00 603.00 |Bump plug 3,500kPA over final circulating pressure of
6,500kPA at 7:45hrs on January 4th 2014, bleed pressure
and check floats (holding OK). Pressure test casing to
11,500kPA for 10 minutes (holding OK).

07:30 (07:45 0.25[SURFAC |CEMENT [CMNT P 603.00 603.00 | Bleed pressure, flush diverter and rig out cementers. Good
cement returns: 8.0m3.

07:45 |08:00 0.25 [SURFAC |DRILL SFTY P 603.00 603.00 |Crew hand over meeting with rig crews, rig manager, Conoco
reps

08:00 (08:30 0.50 |[SURFAC |CEMENT [CMNT P 603.00 603.00 [flush stack

108:30 {12:00 3.50 [SURFAC |CEMENT [CMNT P 603.00 603.00 [Wait on cement for 4 hrs

12:00 |[14:00 2.00 [SURFAC |WHDBOP [NUND P 603.00 603.00 | Cut conductor, cut surface casing, tear out diverter and dress
casing for casing bowl

~ 0 |16:00 2.00 [SURFAC |WHDBOP |NUND P 603.00 603.00 |Install and weld on casing bowl

- ..J0 |16:15 0.25|SURFAC |RIGMNT |SVRG P 603.00 603.00 | Rig service function test crown saver & motor kills

16:15 118:30 2.25SURFAC |WHDBOP [NUND P 603.00 603.00 | linstall and weld on casing bowl

18:30 |18:45 0.25|SURFAC |WHDBOP [NUND P 603.00 603.00 |Wait on bowl to cool, hook up flair lines and strip back mud

18:45 |[19:00 0.25[SURFAC |WHDBOP [SFTY P 603.00 603.00 | Crew handover meeting with both crews and conoco reps

19:00 |21:45 2.75|SURFAC |WHDBOP [NUND P 603.00 603.00 | Wait on bowl to cool, hook up flair lines and strip back mud
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Report Date: 1/4/12014

il Dally D""Ing Depth Progszgg'r:)ﬁ):ozn:
ConocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Dopth Enc: 603,00mKB
Canadaw Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
- Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2
e Log
B . Timl = : E
* Start . - T E e e depk o L UStart Depth | End Depth : : S o
:Time=: | .End Time | -Dur (hr)- | > -Phase " - Op.Code. - | Activity Code|:T-X.| = Trbl Code |- . (mKB) - o fi o mKB) - o : Operation™ .« =2 % i
21:45 |00:00 2.25|SURFAC |WHDBOP |NUND P 603.00 603.00 | Pick up and nipple up multi-bowl, install and nipple up BOP
Fluid/Mud Chks: Mud Engineer: <Mud Engineer?>
Time Depth (mKB) Density (kg/m?) Funnel Viscosity (s/L) pH PV Override (Pars) YP Override {Pa)
05:00 603.00 1,200.0 53
‘| Low Gravity Solids (%) |MBT (kg/m®) Oil Water Ratio Chlorides (mg/L) Calcium (mg/L) Lime (kg/m%) Potassium (mg/L)

Electric Stab (V) ECD - Manual Entry (k... |Sand (%) Solids, Corr. (%) T Flowline (°C) HTHP Pressure (kPa) HTHP Filtrate (mL/30...
API Filtrate {(mL/30min) Mud Lost to Surface (m?) Mud Lost to Hole (m?) Daily Mud Field Est (Cost)
128.10
Cum Mud Lost to Surface (m?) Cum Mud Lost to Hole (m?) Cumulative Mud Cost (Cost)
4,534.81
Last BOP Drill
Type Days Last Chk (... [Last Date Days Until Next... |Next Check Date
BOP Dirill 7 12/28/2013 -4 12/31/2013
Days Since Lost Time Incident (days) Days Since Recordable Incident (days)
) 815.00 815.00
Safety Incidents
Date - _I Com Category... ¢
Drill String: BHA # <BHA No.?>
Bit Run |Drill Bit Length (m) IADC Bit Dull TFA (incl Noz) (mm?) BHA ROP (m/hr)
Nozzles (mm) String Length (m) OD (mm) Max Rotating Hook Load (daN)

Depth In (mKB)

Depth Out (mKB)

Avg ROP (m/hr)

Depth This Job (m)

Total Depth Drilled b...

Job Drill Hrs (hr)

Total Drill Hrs (hr)

Comment

__.«l String Components

siitem Des _l 1D:{mm) OD{mm) Cdts Lon:(m} U ECumEer: (),
Drilling Parameter: <depthstart> - <depthend> mKB
Cum Depth (m) {Cum Drill... [Int ROP (... |Flow Rate...|WOB (daN) |RPM (r... |SPP (kPa) Drill Str Wt (d... [SO Str Wt (daN) |PU Str Wt (daN) |Off-Btm Str W...|Drill Tq
Hydraulic: Calculations . : B e T o s S ‘ R CE [
Bit Hydraulic Powe...|HP/Area (kW/mm?) % P @ bit (%) Bit Jet Velocity (m/s) |Bit dP (kPa) P Drop Annular (kPa) [Mud Density (kg/m?®) |ECD End (kg/m?)

Drill String Volume (m?)

Bit to Shoe Volume (m?)

Vol Shoe to Top (m?)

Min Casing AV (m/min)

Max Casing AV {m/min)

Min Open Hole AV (m/...

Max Open Hole AV (m/..

Error

Mud Pump: 1, NATIONAL, 8-P-80

Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)
1 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks
Bl e Date; Depth.(mKB) ; : Q Flow (m*min}: i = P:(kPa) Strokes (spin)-
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 0.499 5,150 64
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 1.014 17,500 130
Pump Operations
e e e 2 Start Datess D I e End-Date Liner.Size (mm) i P-Max{(kPa):: Vol/Stk OR:(m3/stk):
1/21/2014 1/21/2014 127.0
1/22/2014 1/22/2014 127.0
Mud Pump: 2, NATIONAL, 8-P-80
Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)
2 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks
i : Date Pepth:{mkB}) T - QFlow.(m¥min) e PitkPa) # Strokes(spm)
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.647 6,855 83
( /2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.897 15,000 115
'Fump Operations
SromEeer i 2 Btart Date Sl s EndDate Liner Size{{mm)z “P:Max (kPa) : Vol/Stk OR:{o3/stk): =
1/19/2014 1/19/2014 127.0 15,000
1/121/2014 127.0
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Report Date: 1/4/2014
Report #: 27

(

C »P/h'"' Dally Drl"lng Depth Progress: 0.00m
ep ro : 0.
onocokhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Depth End: 603.00mKB
Canadaw Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
- Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2
iker Screens
i Des: StartDate End:Pate SerSziX 2808 ZY Note
Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500 :
Number Make Model Diameter (mm)
1{BOS Solutions 5500
Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks
AT s Date: Hrs.{hr):: RPM (rpm). Dens OF: (kg/m?):- 2 QOF {(L/min) DensiUE: (kg/m®) QUEAL/mIn)
1/19/2014 07:00 2.00 1800 1,000.0 0.400 2,100.0 0.200
Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
Number Make Model Diameter (mm)
2|BOS Solutions 5500
| Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks
i soDate o Hrs:(hr): RPM:{rpm) Dens OF:{kg/m?): Q OF:(L/min).x.0i DensUE:(ka/m?) Q UF(EMminy
1/19/2014 13:00 3.00 2000 990.0 0.400 1,700.0 0.200
Fluid / Mud Additive Amounts
e : : Des Gonsumed Cast Size: Unitst:
Desco 2.0 64.050 11.34 |SX
Survey Data
Dates: o MD(inKB): Gy Az () | TVD (mKB) =2:Depart(my NS:(m) HEW.(m) NS Hm) ++/DLS-(°/30m})
Formations
s st Formation:Name: :Drilk Top-MD (mKB) Drill Top:(TVD) {rKB) Prog:TFop-TVD (KB .-
Little Bear 31.00 31.00 31.00
Slater. River 76:00 76.00¢ 76:00
Arctic Red 800.50 800.46 76.40
Martin:House i .938.50 938:44 | 76:40
Imperial 975.50 975.43 76.40
Upper Canol 1,665.00 1:658.53 1:653.:40
sier Canol 1,700.72 1,689.07 1,694.40
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Report Date: 1/5/2014

il Dally DrI"Ing Depth Prog'?:gso'rf)#gozr:
ConocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Depth End: 603.00mKB
Canada ¥ Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2
fuwli Surface Legal Location MaxWell Job Number License No.
wJ0E7665-10126-45 E-76 65-10 126-45 JOB01@2006 EL 470
Ground Elevation (m) Original KB/RT Elevation (m) Casing Flange Elevation (m) Original Spud Date Days From Spud (days)
268.20 273.40 268.00 12/28/2013 8.73
Job Category Primary Job Type Actual Start Date End Date Final Job Status Final Report?
DRILLING DRILLING ORIGINAL 12/9/2013 00:00 1/23/2014 23:59 DRILLED Yes
Daily Cost Total (Cost) Cumulative Cost {Cost) Total AFE (Cost) AFE+Supp Amt (Cost) AFE / RFE / Maint.# Estimated Days
162,793.03 2,792,286.86 6,820,300.00 6,820,300.00/10351817 34.19
Planned Depth (TMD) (mKB) Override TVD (mKB) Head Count Personnel Total Hours (hr) Cum Personnel Total Hours (hr)
2,881.00 47.0 536.00 23,545.00
Avg Connection Gas Avg Background Gas Avg Trip Gas Max H2S (ppm)
Road Condition Weather Temperature (°C) Wind
Ice/Snow Snowing -25|NwW
Ops and Depth @ Morning Report Welibore
Run in hole with 222mm bit and directional tools to drill out. Original Hole
Last 24hr Summary

No incidents or accidents. 8 - HID, 4 - OBS and 0 - ASA (all closed out)

Nipple up BOP, clean mud tanks, strip surface mud using the BOS |lI flocking system, transfer surface mud and clean water to 400bbl tanks to later run water
through dehydrator. Pressure test manifold and BOP components to 1400kPA-low and 20,000kPA-high (Annular: 17,500kPA-high), perform an accumulator function
test. Complete rig and pre-drill out inspection. Fill mud tanks with invert. Pick and make up directional BHA and run in the hole.

24hr Forecast
Run in the hole, tag cement, displace to invert mud, conduct BOP drill and high angle rescue safety meetings, drill out cement float and shoe. Drill 222mm
directional hole with accumulated MWD surveys, rig services, connections and circulation times.

Daily Contacts
Drilling Superintend, Sheldon Vamplew, 403-999-1302; Drilling Engineer, Mike Greener, 403-771-5039; WS Supervisor, Richard Turgeon, 780-387-1706; WS
Supervisor, Dave Opper, 403-863-8205; Rig Manager, Rick Yavis, 780-718-2962; Command Centre, 403-910-0357

Last Casing String
Surface, 603.00mKB

—

Time Log

ot e £ . : enTim -

SR e e o e L : e e P : Start Depth EndDepth=|:! S :

ne. {.End Time | -Dur (hr)']. . < Phase Op.Code’ ;] Activity:Code|.T=X |- .Trbl.Code (mKB) (mKB):- e e Qperation

- ..00 [00:15 0.25|SURFAC [RIGMNT [|SVRG P 603.00 603.00 |Rig service function test, crown saver

00:15 |07:45 7.50 |SURFAC |WHDBOP |NUND P 603.00 603.00 | Pick up and nipple up multi-bowl, install and nipple up BOP
and flare lines

07:45 |08:00 0.25|SURFAC |WHDBOP |[SFTY P 603.00 603.00 [ Crew change and safety meeting, with rig crews, rig manager
and Conoco reps.

08:00 |(08:15 0.25|SURFAC |RIGMNT |SVRG P 603.00 603.00 |Rig service function test motor shut off, ok.

08:15 (08:30 0.25|SURFAC |WHDBOP |[SFTY P 603.00 603.00 | Safety meeting with Schlumbuger pressure testers, rig crew,
Conoco rep, prior to rig up

08:30 (16:00 7.50 |[SURFAC |WHDBOP |BOPE P 603.00 603.00 |Pressure test all manifold valves and chocks, low of
1,400kpa, high 21,000kpa with Schlumbuger, all manifold
valves, all ok.

16:00 (16:15 0.25[SURFAC {RIGMNT [SVRG P 603.00 603.00 [Rig service function test, crown saver & motor kills

16:15 |19:30 3.25|SURFAC |WHDBOP |BOPE P 603.00 603.00 | Pressure test with schlumberger, BOP stack, HCR valves, kill

line, inside BOP, stabbing valve, pipe rams, blind rams at low
1,400kpa., high 21,000kpa., Annular low 1,400kpa., high
17,500kpa. All ok.

19:30 119:45 0.25SURFAC |WHDBOP ([SFTY P 603.00 603.00 [Crew change and safety meeting, with rig crews, rig manager
and Conoco reps.

119:45 |23:15 3.50 [SURFAC |WHDBOP |BOPE P 603.00 603.00 | Accumulator function test, initial pressure-19,500kpa.,

function HCR, pipe rams, annular, final pressure-9,000kpa, re
-charge pump time 3min. 45sec., prepare floor and directional
tools to be picked up, crew hazard hunt and rig inspection,
pre-drill out CAODC complete rig inspection, by AD and

Conoco rep.
23:16 [23:30 0.25[SURFAC |DRILL SFTY P 603.00 603.00 | Safety meeting with Pathfinder directional hands, rig crew,
hoe hand and Conoco rep, on picking up directional tools
23:30 (00:00 0.50 [SURFAC |DRILL PULD P 603.00 603.00 | Pick up and make up, 222mm PDC bit, dog sub, directional
tools
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V L] L
ConocoPhillips
Canadaw

COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45

Daily Drilling

Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2

Report Date: 1/5/2014
Report #: 28

Depth Progress: 0.00m

Depth End: 603.00mKB

Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014

.d/Mud Chks: Mud Engineer: <Mud Engineer?>

Time

Depth (mKB)

Density (kg/m?)

Funnel Viscosity (s/L) pH

PV Override (Pa+s)

YP Override (Pa)

Low Gravity Solids (%)

MBT (kg/n°)

Oil Water Ratio

Chlorides (mg/L) Calcium (mg/L)

Lime (kg/m?)

Potassium (mg/L)

Electric Stab (V)

ECD - Manual Entry (k...

Sand (%)

Solids, Corr. (%) T Flowline (°C)

HTHP Pressure (kPa)

HTHP Filtrate (mL/30...

API Filtrate (mL/30min)

Mud Lost to Surface (m?)

Mud Lost to Hole (m?)

Daily Mud Field Es

(Cost)

Cum Mud Lost to Surface (m?)

Cum Mud Lost to Hole (m?)

Cumulative Mud Cost (Cost)

|Last BOP Drill
Type Days Last Chk (... |Last Date Days Until Next... |Next Check Date
BOP Drill 8 12/28/2013 -5 12/31/2013
Days Since Lost Time Incident (days) Days Since Recordable Incident (days)
816.00 816.00
Safety Incidents
sirivDate com -Catégory.
Drill String: BHA # <BHA No.?>
Bit Run |Drill Bit Length (m) IADG Bit Dull TFA (incl Noz) (mm?) BHA ROP (m/hr)
Nozzles (mm) String Length (m) OD (mm) Max Rotating Hook Load (daN)

Depth In {mKB)

Depth Out (mKB)

Avg ROP (m/hr)

Depth This Job {m)

Total Depth Drilled b...

Job Drill Hrs (hr)

Total Drill Hrs (hr)

Comment

,,,,,,,,, Item Dés:: s | D-{mim) QD (mm) Jis; Len(m) -Cum‘Len{rm)
ling Parameter: <depthstart> - <depthend> mKB
.. ..n Depth (m} |[Cum Drill... |Int ROP (... {Flow Rate...|WOB (daN) |RPM (r... | SPP (kPa) Drill Str Wt (d... | SO Str Wt (daN) [PU Str Wt (daN) [Off-Btm Str W...|Drill Tq
Hydraulic Calculations: = T ey S : L ; s T e ey
Bit Hydraulic Powe...|HP/Area (kW/mm?) % P @ bit (%) Bit Jet Velocity (m/s) |Bit dP (kPa) P Drop Annular (kPa) [Mud Density (kg/m?) |ECD End (kg/m?)

Drill String Volume (m?)

Bit to Shoe Volume (m*)

Vol Shoe to Top (m?)

Min Casing AV (m/min} |Max Casing AV {m/min)

Min Open Hole AV (m/...

Max Open Hole AV (m/..

Error

Mud Pump: 1, NATIONAL, 8-P-80

Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mim) Stroke Length (mm)
1 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks
o Date Depth:(mKB) : Q Flow: (m3/miny): - P(kPa) : : Strokes (spm)
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 0.499 5,150 64
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 1.014 17,500 130
Pump Operations
e Start Daté'; HlEEE v End Dates Liner Sizé:(mm): 3 P:Max (kPa) i . NONSHR-OR (midfstk)i:
1/21/2014 1/21/2014 127.0
1/22/2014 1/22/2014 127.0
Mud Pump: 2, NATIONAL, 8-P-80
Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)
2 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks
= CaEUivhaDagté “=Depth (MKB) pe et Q:Flow: (m3/min): =i PkPayi e i ‘v :StroKes (§pmy)
11/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.647 6,855 83
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.897 15,000 115
Pump Operations
seisl i Blart Dates F Y S End Daté il s Liner.Size (mm):- ol P:Max (kPa) =IOl OR (m¥fstk) sz =
1119/2014 1/19/2014 127.0 15,000
12014 127.0
[Shaker Screens
iy Deg i = StarkDaté “End-Date" = =8¢z X Ser 8z, Y11 i Note
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ConocoPhillips

nada

Daily

Drilling

COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45
Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2

Report Date: 1/5/2014

Report #: 28

Depth Progress: 0.00m
Depth End: 603.00mKB
Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014

( atrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500

Number

1

Make

BOS Solutions

Model
5500

Diameter (mm)

Centrifuge/Cyclone

Checks

= :Date Hrs:(hr):: RPM:(rpmy): : Dens OF: (kg/m?y Q:OF:(k/min}: _| Deris:UE {kg/m®) Q UF (L/miny
-11/19/2014 07:00 2.00 1800 1,000.0 0.400 2,100.0 0.200
Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
Number Make Model Diameter (mm)
2|BOS Solutions 5500
Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks
| : Date: : Hrs (hr) RPM {rpm} = 2::Déns OF (kg/m¥): Q OF (L/min). DPens UF (kg/m?) QUF(L/min)
1/19/2014 13:00 3.00 2000 990.0 0.400-I_ 1,700.0 0.200
Fluid / Mud Additive Amounts
iR Des I_ Consumed . - Cost Sz Units
Survey Data
Date - MD:(mKB): - SERel) Aznii(oy ~TYD:(MKB) Depart:(m)- ‘NS:(m) EW.(im) NS ) 2 DESHE/30m).
Formations
i < Formation Name: Dl Top-MD:(mKB) | Drill Top (TVD)(mKB) Prog Top: TVD:(mMKB): . .=
Little Bear 31.00 | 31.00 31.00
Slater River 76.00 | 76.00 76.00
Arctic Red 800.50 800.46 76.40
Martin:House 938.50 | 03844 76.40
Imperial 975.50 975.43 76.40
|ﬂ)per Canol 1:665.00 165853 |+ - 1"653£_|
Lower Canol 1,700.72 1,689.07 1,694.40

Rpt Template Revised: 8/11/2008
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Report Date: 1/6/2014

S HIH Dal Iy D rl I I I ng Depth ProgreE:P:,Srt;:):Ozng:
ConocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Dopth End: 761.00mKB
Canada ¥ Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2
T Uwi Surface Legal Location MaxWell Job Number License No.
sUOE7665-10126-45 E-76 65-10 126-45 JOBO1@2006 EL 470
Ground Elevation (m) Original KB/RT Elevation {m) Casing Flange Elevation (m) Original Spud Date Days From Spud (days)
268.20 273.40 268.00 12/28/2013 9.73
Job Category Primary Job Type Actual Start Date End Date Final Job Status Final Report?
DRILLING DRILLING ORIGINAL 12/9/2013 00:00 1/23/2014 23:59 DRILLED Yes
Daily Cost Total (Cost) Cumulative Cost (Cost) Total AFE (Cost) AFE+Supp Amt (Cost) AFE / RFE / Maint.# Estimated Days
103,134.43 2,895,421.29 6,820,300.00 6,820,300.00|10351817 . 34.19
Planned Depth (TMD) (mKB) Override TVD (mKB) Head Count Personnel Total Hours (hr) Cum Personnel Total Hours {hr}
2,881.00 48.0 540.00 24,085.00
Avg Connection Gas Avg Background Gas Avg Trip Gas Max H2S (ppm)
125 90 0
Road Condition Weather Temperature (°C) Wind
Ice/Snow Windy -24|SE
Ops and Depth @ Morning Report Wellbore
Drill 222mm intermediate hole at 800m. Last survey at 781m, Inc: 0.71°, Azm: 129.47°. Original Hole

Last 24hr Summary
No incidents or accidents. 10 - HID, 1 - OBS and 0 - ASA (all closed out)

Complete rig and pre-drill out inspection. Fill mud tanks with invert. Pick and make up directional BHA, run in the hole, tag cement, displace to invert mud, conduct
BOP drill and high angle rescue safety meetings, drill out cement float and shoe. Drill 222mm intermediate directional hole from 603m to 761m with accumulated
MWD surveys, rig services, connections and circulation times.

24hr Forecast

Drill 222mm intermediate directional hole with accumulated MWD surveys, rig services, connections and circulation times.

Daily Contacts

Drilling Superintend, Sheldon Vamplew, 403-999-1302; Drilling Engineer, Mike Greener, 403-771-5039; WS Supervisor, Richard Turgeon, 780-387-1706; WS
Supervisor, Dave Opper, 403-863-8205; Rig Manager, Rick Yavis, 780-718-2962; Command Centre, 403-910-0357

Last Casing String

Surface, 603.00mKB

Time Log
o : i : e
Start , : L : ep oo |1 start Depth, [ “End Depth. | ' : L
Time.:|;End Time | -Dur. (hr) Phase Op:Code .| Activity Code | T-X:| .. Trbl Code./ |-+ “(mKB).: (MKBY). o] ; Operation” ., ;
)0 |03:45 3.75|SURFAC |DRILL PULD P 603.00 603.00 |Pick up and make up 222mm Uiterra PDC bit, dog sub, mud
motor and Pathfinder directional tools
03:45 }04:00 0.25|SURFAC |RIGMNT [SVRG P 603.00 603.00 |Rig service function test hydril 14 sec. function crown saver
04:00 {06:45 2.75|SURFAC |DRILL TRIP P 603.00 603.00 |Run 10 stands of HWDP, in hole, lay down 10 jts of HWDP,&
run in 15 stds h.w pick up 8 drill pipe
06:45 |07:00 0.25|SURFAC |DRILL SFTY P 603.00 603.00 |BOP drill with night crew, review warning signs and positions
efc.
07:00 |[07:15 0.25 |SURFAC |DRILL SFTY P 603.00 603.00 | Crew change and safety meeting, with rig crews, rig manager
and Conoco reps.
07:15 |08:00 0.75 |SURFAC |DRILL SFTY P 603.00 603.00 | Safety meeting and rig inspection, hazard hunt and BOP drill
review, with day crew
08:00 [09:15 1.25|SURFAC |RIGMNT |SVRG P 603.00 603.00 |Rig service function test rig smart anticollision function test
crown saver. Review top drive trouble shooting with top drive
hand.
09:15 |[10:45 1.50 |[SURFAC |DRILL PULD P 603.00 603.00 | Pick up drill pipe, run in hole and tag cement
10:45 |13:30 2.75|SURFAC |DRILL CIRC P 603.00 603.00 [Displace 21m3 of water to invert mud system
13:30 |14:00 0.50 |SURFAC |DRILL SFTY P 603.00 603.00 [Pre drill out safety meeting held B.O.P drill held well secure in
90 sec crew in positions review stick diagram check manifold
allignment Function test motor kills
14:.00 |15:15 1.25|SURFAC |CEMENT |DRLG P 603.00 603.00 | Drill out cement cement taged at 586mKB float taged at
589mKB shoe taged at 603mKB
15:15 |16:00 0.75 |INTRM1 DRILL DRLG P 603.00 626.00 | Drill 222mm intermediate hole with, Ulterra bit and dog sub,
Pathfinder mud motor set at 1.83 deg, 7:8 lobe, 5 stage,
70rpm/m3 from 603mKB to 626mKB
16:00 |17:15 1.25 |INTRM1 DRILL DRLG P 626.00 646.00 | Drill 222mm intermediate hole, Ulterra bit and dog sub,
Pathfinder mud motor set at 1.83 deg, 7:8 lobe, 5 stage,
70rpm/m3 from 626mKB to 646mKB
17:16 |17:30 0.25 |INTRM1 RIGMNT {SVRG P 646.00 646.00 |Rig service function test rig smart anti collision function test
crown saver function test pipe rams 9 sec C/O
0 [19:00 1.50 |INTRM1 DRILL DRLG P 646.00 665.00 | Drill 222mm intermediate hole, Ulterra bit and dog sub,
N Pathfinder mud motor set at 1.83 deg, 7:8 lobe, 5 stage,
B 70rpm/m3 from 646mKB to 665mKB
19:00 |19:15 0.25 [INTRM1 DRILL SFTY P 665.00 665.00 | Crew handover meeting conoco reps present
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Report Date: 1/6/2014

h Dal Iy Drl I I I ng Depth Progrel::P?:s’gozn?
ConocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Fepth Ead: 761.00mKD
Canada ¥ Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2
.1e Log
R : L Tim T
Start [ - - - T R : : . ep- Start Deptti [ "*End'Depth TR
~Time - {- End Time |- Dur (Ar) Phase Op Code | Activity.Code| T-X|::TrblCode (mKB):: ~ |« (mKBY ] . s e dQperation S
19:15 |23:15 4.00 | INTRM1 DRILL DRLG P 665.00 761.00 W 222 mm intermedediate hole, Ulterra bit and dog sub,
Pathfinder mud motor set at 1.83 deg, 7:8 lobe, 5 stage,
70rpm/m3 from 665 m to 761 m
23:15 23:30 0.25 |INTRM1 DRILL SRVY P 761.00 761.00 | Directional surveys and connection
23:30 (00:00 0.50 |INTRM1 DRILL DRLG P 761.00 761.00 |Changed out liners in pump # 1 from 5 1/2 "to 5 " liners
Fluid/Mud Chks: Mud Engineer: Corey Clark
Time Depth (mKB) Density (kg/m?) Funnel Viscosity (s/L) pH PV Override (Pa+s) YP Override (Pa)
16:00 646.00 950.0 50 0.0 4.0
Low Gravity Solids (%) [MBT (kg/m?) Oil Water Ratio Chlorides (mg/L) Calcium (mg/L) Lime (kg/m?) Potassium (mg/L)
6.9 78122 114,259 39 20
Electric Stab (V) ECD - Manual Entry (k...|Sand (%) Solids, Corr. (%) T Flowline (°C) HTHP Pressure (kPa) HTHP Filtrate (mL/30...
400.0 993.9 8.0 741 13 6.0
API Filtrate (mL/30min) Mud Lost to Surface (m?) Mud Lost to Hole (m?) Daily Mud Field Est (Cost)
3.00 0.00 3,809.40
Cum Mud Lost to Surface (m?) Cum Mud Lost to Hole (m®) Cumulative Mud Cost (Cost)
3.00 8,344.21
Last BOP Drill
Type Days Last Chk (... |Last Date Days Until Next... |Next Check Date
BOP Dirill 0 1/6/2014 5 1/11/2014
Days Since Lost Time Incident (days) Days Since Recordable Incident (days)
817.00 817.00
Safety incidents
-Date 4 b e I g Com ! i i b : A 5 : : Category
Drill String: BHA # 2
Bit Run |Drill Bit Length (m) IADC Bit Duil TFA (incl Noz) (mm?) BHA ROP (m/hr)
1 222.0mm, 616, 21191 0.25 1-4-CT-G-3-0-WT-BHA 924 17.2
zles (mm) String Length (m) OD (mm) Max Rotating Hook Load (daN)
~.J14.0/14.0/14.0/14.0/14.0 1,599.00 222.0 65,000
Depth In (nKB) Depth Out (mKB) Avg ROP (m/hr) Depth This Job (m) Total Depth Drilled b...|Job Drill Hrs (hr) Total Drill Hrs (hr)
603.00 1,588.00 17.2 985.00 1,588.00 57.25 57.25

‘| Comment
222mm Ulterra PDC bit, dog sub, Pathfinder mud motor set at 1.83 deg, 7:8 lobe, 5 stage, 70rpm/m3, NM Pony sub monel, MWD flex collar, 2 x NM flex Monels.

Drill String Components

el SRINEE SRR e “Mem Des’ i B : D (mm) e e 0D (mm) : Jts: ockenm)e v pE] s sCumiken(m)as
Drill pipe - Stands 65.0 101.6 1 9.40 1,599.00
Drilpipe -+Stands. .=, = s E o 10650 ..101:6 62| 1.172.38 1 1,580.60
4 HW 70.0 132.0 37 344.73 T 417.22]
dars e : ‘ 60.0 161:0. = 1 513 Cuile 72,49
AW 70.0 132.0 3 27.54 67.36
6.75%X/0 : : : e : : . = 59.0 +168.0 1 +.0.80 39.82
[675" NM Flex Mon } ' — 1 70.0 T71.0 5 17.@% 39.02
6:75"Gap/Sub = Chia . o i :88.0 = 162:0 aof - 0:564 i 21,54
6.75" Flex Monel ‘ 70.o‘|_ 171.0 1 EF 21.00
NM:Pony Monel: - A i ‘. Eaa 700 : 17‘1.0J i F 2’._97| 1185
Mud motor 56.0 169.0 1 828 8.68
Bogssub-. it s ] 260010 222,010 Al 015 e e 0:40
Drilling Parameter: 626.00 - 761.00 mKB
Cum Depth (m) |[Cum Drill... |Int ROP (... |Flow Rate...|WOB (daN) |RPM (r... | SPP (kPa) Drill Str Wt (d... [SO Str Wt (daN) |PU Str Wt (daN) |Off-Btm Str W...|Drill Tq
158.00 7.50 20.0 1.400 7,000 30 9,500 44,000 43,000 45,000 44,000 8,500.0
‘Hydraulic Calculations /0o Sl e e L : e S e - i sy Bl ; .
Bit Hydraulic Powe...|HP/Area (kW/mm?) % P @ bit (%) Bit Jet Velocity (m/s) |Bit dP (kPa) P Drop Annular (kPa) | Mud Density (kg/m*) |ECD End (kg/m®)
7.9 0.00021 4 25.3 340.1 187.8 950.0 975.2
Drill String Volume (m?) |Bit to Shoe Volume (m®) |Vol Shoe to Top (m°) Min Casing AV (m/min) |[Max Casing AV (m/min) |Min Open Hole AV (m/...|Max Open Hole AV (m/..
2.73 3.55 18.01 43.4 52.5 55.9 88.9
Error

Pump: 1, NATIONAL, 8-P-80

Fump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)
1 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks

s rnnss i aDate s e EDepth (mKB) sl i i +Q Flow. {m%min) i i : <P (kPa): SimaE «:Sfrokési{spm).
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00-| 0.499 5,160 64
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. I Report Date: 1/6/2014
G Hl Daily Drilling Dot proqrex P oH: 28
ep gress: .00m
onocoritlips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Depth End: 761.00mkB
Canadaw Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
- Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2
np Checks
. ; Date: Depth (MKB): Q. Flow:(im%min) : P-(kPa) Strokes (spm)
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 1.014 17,500 130
Pump Operations
5 : Start:Date +End Date [iinér:Size.{mm) .~ =zP:Max{kRa) VoliStk OR (m?/stk)=
1/21/2014 1/21/2014 127.0
1/22/2014 1/22/2014 127.0
Mud Pump: 2, NATIONAL, 8-P-80
Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)
2 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks
'_ i CibraDateT Depth.{mKB) o QFlow (m¥min) PikPa) : 'Strokes (spm): =
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.647 6,855 83
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.897 15,000 115
Pump Operations
o Start:Date: : : “End-Date Liner:Size:(mim) i+:P Max:{(kPa) o 7 VOl/Stk OR‘(m3/stk)
1/19/2014 1/19/2014 127.0 15,000
1/121/2014 127.0
Shaker Screens
S Des: Start Date End:Date Scr. 8z X “8erSz Y. Note
Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
Number Make Model Diameter (mm)
1|BOS Solutions 5500
Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks
Ay 3 Date Hrs:(hr) RPM:(rpm) ;i Dens:OF - (kgim?) Q OF:(l/min) Dens UF:(ka/m?): QUEAEMINy: 7 o
1/19/2014 07:00 2.00 1800 1,000.0 0.400 2,100.0 0.200
Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
Number Make Model Diameter (mm)
2|BOS Solutions 5500
trifuge/Cyclone Checks
o :Date Hrs(hr).. - REM.{rpm) Dens. OF (kg/m2) = Q OF (L/min) Dens UF (kg/m?) < Q:UF:(Efmin)
1/19/2014 13:00 3.00 2000 990.0 0.400 1,700.0 0.200
Fluid / Mud Additive Amounts
SR ’ ; . Al - Des - _Consumed Cost ] Size i ipMnits
- |Barite 10.0 17.040 40.0|SX
INVERT- 3.0 1:063-330 1.0{M3
Truvis 3.0 149.670 250[SX
Survey Data
B iDaite MD;(mKB): - 5] el ) CiAzm ()]s “TVD (mKB) - Dipart:(in) NS (m) < W) VS i) DLSE/30m) i
1/6/2014 627.50 0.31 12414 627.47 5.09 5.09 0.13 2.36 0.38
1/6/2014 704.46 0.62 137.27 704.43 4.70 4.66 0.58 1.75 0.13
Formations
L “ Formation Name: i Dyill Top MD:{mKB) Drill:Top(TVD).(nMKB) Prog Top TVD(MKB) . =
Little Bear 31.00 31.00 31.00
‘Slater River 76:00 76.00 " 76.00
Arctic Red 1 800.50 800.46 76.40
Martin House: - l “222038:50 93844 |- 76140
| ¢ = ' ;
Imperial 975.50 l 975.43 76.40
Upper-Ganol: 1,665:00 1.:658.53" 1.653/40
Lower Canol 1,700.72 1,694.40
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Report Date: 1/7/2014

h Dally DrI"Ing Depth Progre'::!):’{tsigoa;:
ConocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Dopth Eng: 4,179,00mKEB
Canada w Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
g Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2
TUWI Surface Legal Location MaxWell Job Number License No.
300E7665-10126-45 E-76 65-10 126-45 JOB01@2006 EL 470
Ground Elevation (m) Original KB/RT Elevation (m) Casing Flange Elevation {m) Original Spud Date Days From Spud (days)
. 268.20 273.40 268.00 12/28/2013 10.73
Job Category Primary Job Type Actual Start Date End Date Final Job Status Final Report?
DRILLING 'DRILLING ORIGINAL 12/9/2013 00:00 1/23/2014 23:59 DRILLED Yes
Daily Cost Total (Cost) Cumulative Cost (Cost) Total AFE (Cost) AFE+Supp Amt (Cost) AFE / RFE / Maint.# Estimated Days
86,623.83 2,982,045.12 6,820,300.00 6,820,300.00|10351817 34.19
Planned Depth (TMD) (mKB) Override TVD (mKB) Head Count Personnel Total Hours (hr) Cum Personnel Total Hours (hr)
2,881.00 55.0 612.00 24,697.00
Avg Connection Gas Avg Background Gas Avg Trip Gas Max H2S (ppm)
68 46 0
Road Condition Weather Temperature (°C) Wind
Ice/Snow Snowing -20IN
Ops and Depth @ Morning Report Welibore
Drill 222mm intermediate hole at 1293m. Last survey at 1236.50m, Inc: 1.81°, Azm: 176.76°. Original Hole

Last 24hr Summary
No incidents or accidents. 6 - HID, 4 - OBS and 0 - ASA (all closed out)

Drill 222mm intermediate directional hole from 761m to 1179m with accumulated MWD surveys, rig services, connections and circulation times. WOB: 6-8,000kDaN,
RPM - 35 (Motor RPM - 112), Differential pressure: 3000-3500kPa, Pump rate: 1.6 m3/min. Torque: 1800 - 2400ft/lbs, Rotate: 414.0m - 99.0% / Slide: 4.0m - 1.0%,
ROP: 26.5m/hr.

24hr Forecast

Drill 222mm intermediate directional hole with accumulated MWD surveys, rig services, connections and circulation times.

Daily Contacts

Drilling Superintend, Sheldon Vamplew, 403-999-1302; Drilling Engineer, Mike Greener, 403-771-5039; WS Supervisor, Richard Turgeon, 780-387-1706; WS
Supervisor, Dave Opper, 403-863-8205; Rig Manager, Rick Yavis, 780-718-2962; Command Centre, 403-910-0357

Last Casing String

Surface, 603.00mKB

Time Log
el : : Tim |- : :
Start § T s i ep-| 1 g Start Depth End Depth .| : : e
" "mie . [ EndTime [ Durhr) | - Phaseii | Op Code. .| Activity. Code:T-X.|  Trbl.Code {mKB) - (mKB) ) e : Operation i : B
10 {00:15 0.25 |INTRM1 RIGMNT  |SVRG P 761.00 761.00 |Rig service function test crown saver, function hydril o/c 14
: sec
00:15 |04:15 4.00 |[INTRM1 RIGMNT  [RGRP P 761.00 761.00 |Changed out liners in pump # 1 from 5 1/2 " to 5 " liners &
moduole seal in pump # 2 middle
04:15 [07:30 3.25[INTRM1 DRILL DRLG P 761.00 875.00 | Drill 222 mm intermedediate hole, Ulterra bit and dog sub,
Pathfinder mud motor set at 1.83 deg, 7:8 lobe, 5 stage,
70rpm/m3 from 761 m to 875 m
07:30 |07:45 0.25 [INTRM1 DRILL SRVY P 875.00 875.00 | Directional survey and connections
07:45 108:00 0.25 |INTRM1 DRILL SFTY P 875.00 875.00 | Crew change and safety meeting, with rig crews, rig manager
and Conoco reps.
08:00 |(08:30 0.50 [INTRM1 DRILL DRLG P 875.00 894.00 | Drill 222mm intermediate hole, ulterra it and dog sub,

pathfinder mud motor set at 1.83deg,7:8 lobe, 5 stage,
70rpm/m3 from 875m to 894m

08:30 [08:45 0.25{INTRM1 RIGMNT [SVRG P 894.00 894.00 | Rig service function test rig smart anti collision function test
crown saver function test H.C.R 3 sec O/C Grease all moving
parts check fluid levels in Floor motor and HPU unit function
test flair ignitor

08:45 |14:00 5.25 | INTRM1 DRILL DRLG P 894.00 989.00 | Drill 222mm intermediate hole, ulterra it and dog sub,
pathfinder mud motor set at 1.83deg,7:8 lobe, 5 stage,
70rpm/m3 from 894mKB to 989mKB

14:00 |15:00 1.00 |INTRM1 DRILL CIRC P 989.00 989.00 | Circulate 2 bottoms up and prepair to do a formation test
16:.00 |15:15 0.25|INTRM1 DRILL FIT P 989.00 989.00 | Formation integrity test hold pressure @ 2500 kpa for 10 min
15:15 |16:00 0.75 {INTRM1 DRILL DRLG P 989.00 1,016.00 [ Drill 222mm intermediate hole, ulterra bit and dog sub,

pathfinder mud motor set at 1.83deg,7:8 lobe, 5 stage,
70rpm/m3 from 989mKB to 1016mKB

16:00 |16:30 0.50 [ INTRM1 DRILL DRLG P 1,016.00 1,027.00 | Drilt 222mm intermediate hole, ulterra bit and dog sub,
pathfinder mud motor set at 1.83deg,7:8 lobe, 5 stage,
70rpm/m3 from 1016mKB to 1027mKB

0 [17:15 0.75 {INTRM1 RIGMNT |SVRG P 1,027.00 1,027.00 [ Rig service function test rig smart anti collision function test
crown saver function test pipe rams 9 sec C/O Grease all
moving parts Change oil on HPU unit
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. I Report Date: 1/7/2014
C \ A Daily Drilling Dot Proare S SrLE 30
ep rogress: .00m
onocornilips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Depth End: 1,179.00mKE
Canadaw Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2
.ie Log
3 Tim .
Start = o S o e P Start Depth End:Depth :
Time: <} End:Time | :Dur:(hr)..|: - -:Phase: . 'Op.Code Activity Cade m Trbl.Code (mKB) {mKB):=: i Operation .

17:15 {17:30 0.25 |INTRM1 DRILL DRLG P 1,027.00 1,037.00 [ Drill 222mm intermediate hole, ulterra bit and dog sub,
pathfinder mud motor set at 1.83deg,7:8 lobe, 5 stage,
70rpm/m3 from 1027mKB to 1037mKB

17:30 [19:00 1.50 {INTRM1 DRILL DRLG P 1,037.00 1,064.00 | Drill 222mm intermediate hole, ulterra bit and dog sub,
pathfinder mud motor set at 1.83deg,7:8 lobe, 5 stage,

) 70rpm/m3 from 1037mKB to 1064 mKB.

19:00 [19:15 0.25 | INTRM1 DRILL SFTY P 1,064.00 1,064.00 | Crew change and safety meeting, with rig crews, rig manager
and Conoco reps.

19:15 |23:45 4.50 |INTRM1 DRILL DRLG P 1,064.00 1,179.00 [ Drill 222mm intermediate hole, ulterra bit and dog sub,
pathfinder mud motor set at 1.83deg,7:8 lobe, 5 stage,
70rpm/m3 from 1064mKB to 1179 mKB.

23:45 (00:00 0.25 |INTRM1 DRILL SRVY P 1,179.00 1,179.00 | Directional survey and connections

Fluid/Mud Chks: Mud Engineer: Corey Clark

Time Depth (mKB) Density (kg/m®) Funnel Viscosity (s/L) pH PV Override (Pa-s) YP Override (Pa)

14:00 1,008.00 920.0 46 8.0 3.5

Low Gravity Solids (%) |MBT (kg/m°) Oil Water Ratio Chlorides (mg/L) Calcium (mg/L) Lime (kg/m?) Potassium (mg/L)

4.4 81/19 147,126 44 20

Electric Stab (V) ECD - Manual Entry (k...|Sand (%) Solids, Corr. (%) T Flowline (°C) HTHP Pressure (kPa) HTHP Filtrate (mL/30...

410.0 957.0 4.0 4.5 30 6.0

API Filtrate (mL/30min) Mud Lost to Surface (m?) Mud Lost to Hole (m°) Daily Mud Field Est (Cost)

3.00 0.00 8,137.80

Cum Mud Lost to Surface (m?) Cum Mud Lost to Hole {m?) Cumulative Mud Cost (Cost)

6.00 16,482.01

Last BOP Drill

Type Days Last Chk (... |Last Date Days Until Next... |Next Check Date

BOP Drill 1 1/6/2014 4 1/11/2014

Days Since Lost Time Incident (days) Days Since Recordable Incident (days)

818.00 818.00
ety Incidents
- rDateiy Com: Category:

Drill String: BHA # 2

Bit Run | Drill Bit Length (m) IADC Bit Duil TFA (incl Noz) (mm?) BHA ROP (m/hr)

1 222.0mm, 616, 21191 0.25 1-4-CT-G-3-0-WT-BHA 924 17.2

Nozzles (mm) String Length (m) OD (mm) Max Rotating Hook Load (daN)

14.0/14.0/14.0/14.0/14.0/14.0 1,599.00 222.0 65,000

Depth In (mKB) Depth OQut (mKB) Avg ROP (m/hr) Depth This Job (m) Total Depth Drilled b...|Job Drill Hrs (hr) Total Drill Hrs (hr)

603.00 1,588.00 17.2 985.00 1,588.00 57.25 57.25

Comment

222mm Ulterra PDC bit, dog sub, Pathfinder mud motor set at 1.83 deg, 7:8 lobe, 5 stage, 70rpm/m3, NM Pony sub monel, MWD flex collar, 2 x NM flex Monels.

‘| Drill String Components

sl . < item;Des: ID:(mim) OD:(mm) Jts § i srleni(m)i v Cumilient(m)

Drill pipe - Stands 65.0 101.6 1 9.40 1,599.00

Drill:pipe = Stands 2650 101.6 62 1172:38| - 1,589:60

4" HW 70.0 132.0 37 344.73 417.22

Jars i 60:0 1618 | s 5.13 7249

4" HW 70.0 32.0 3 27.54 67.36

675" XI0 - 59:0 168,01 el -0:80 1239.82

6.75" NM Flex Mon 70.0 171.0 2 17.48 39.02

6.75!; Gap:Sdb 88:0: 162.0_' 1} 0.54 2154

6.75" Flex Monel 70.0 171.0 1 9.35 21.00

NM:-Pony Monel G700 174.0 1 297 11.65

Mud motor 56.0 | 169.0 1 8.28 8.68

[Dogsub- - 600 ©.222.0 1 0.15 ~.0:40

Drilling Parameter: 1,016.00 - 1,179.00 mKB

Cum Depth (m) |[Cum Drill... |Int ROP (... |Flow Rate...|WOB (daN) |RPM (r... |SPP (kPa) Drill Str Wt (d... [ SO Str Wt (daN) |PU Str Wt (daN) |Off-Btm Str W...{Drill Tq

< ’ 576.00 23.25 27.2 1.670 7,000 30 12,500 53,000 51,000 55,000 53,000 8,100.0
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V @] L]
ConocoPhillips
Canadaw

Daily Drilling
COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45
Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2

Report Date: 1/7/2014
Report #: 30

Depth Progress: 418.00m

Depth End: 1,179.00mKB

Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014

Iraulic Calculations : o T
bit Hydraulic Powe...|HP/Area (kW/mm?) % P @ bit (%) Bit Jet Velocity (m/s) | Bit dP (kPa) P Drop Annular (kPa) |Mud Density (ka/m?®) |ECD End (kg/m?)
13.0 0.00034 4 30.1 468.7 173.8 920.0 935.0
'| Drill String Volume (m®) |Bit to Shoe Volume (m?) Vol Shoe to Top (m3) Min Casing AV (m/min) |Max Casing AV (m/min) |Min Open Hole AV {m/...|Max Open Hole AV (m/..
4.12 14.89 19.46 51.8 51.8 54.6 106.1
Error
Mud Pump: 1, NATIONAL, 8-P-80
Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)
1 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks
: EDate Dépth {mKB): Q:Flow.(m3/miin): P:(kPa) W =Strokés (spm)
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 0.499 5,150 64
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 1.014 17,500 130
Pump Operations
SoEiaEe s oohh ) StartDate : End Date Liner - Size (Mim) P.Max:{(kPa)= < i - MONSTK:OR(m¥/stk)
1/21/2014 1/21/2014 127.0
1/22/2014 1/22/2014 127.0
Mud Pump: 2, NATIONAL, 8-P-80
Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)
2 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks
e i sicDate : Depth:(mKB):: i : 3 Q Flow.(m¥min): P:(kPa): i Strokes:(spm)
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.647 6,855 83
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.897 15,000 115
Pump Operations
e Start Date S e -End‘Date . nLiner. Size (mpa)i i P.Max:(kPa). “Vol/Stk':OR {m¥stk)
1/19/2014 1/19/2014 127.0 15,000
1/21/12014 127.0
Shaker Screens
Des Start Date - EndDate Ser'Sz-X SerSziY: I aNote
Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
Number Make Model Diameter (mm)
1|BOS Solutions 5500
Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks
Ak A Date::: Hrs (hr) .RPM (rpm) Detis.OF (kg/m®) : v 'Q OF{Limin) Dens UF:(kg/m?):: QUF(L/miny
1/19/2014 07:00 2.00 1800 1,000.0 0.400 2,100.0 0.200
Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
Number Make Model Diameter (mm)
2|BOS Solutions 5500
Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks
: i Daté 2y Hrsihr) RPM (rpm) Dens OF: (kg/m?) Q OF (L/min) Dens UF.(tkg/m?) ~-Q UE(E/min)
1/19/2014 13:00 3.00 2000 990.0 0.400 1,700.0 0.200
Fluid / Mud Additive Amount
B e e s T DB Consumed Cost: g, o - Size ; Ynits.
Barite 5.0 17.040 40.0 |SX
QAL.CIUM CHLERIDE : 36;0 43.920 40:0.[SX
INVERT 3.0 1,063.330 1.0{M3
OPTISEAL L : _ - o 5.0 96.20,0‘ e 260 ,SX
Truvis ‘ 5.0 149.670 25.0SX
Versacoatitif:T B 20 883570 55.0|BBL
Versatrol 6.0 47.500 50.0[SX
Survey Data
o .Date 7 - MD{mKB): . nel (s cAZm) s [ STV (KB) Depart (i) = [ = NS{m) EW{m). - VS (m) - DESHE/30m) -
1712014 781.46 0.71 129.47 781.42 4.24 4.05 1.23 0.89 0.05
1/7/2014 896.50 1.28 113.56 896.45 428 3.09 2.96 -1.09 0.16
1/7/12014 970.50 0.88 161.56 970.43 458 2.26 3.99 -2.39 0.32
1/7/2014 1,008.50 1.02 147.85 1,008.43 4.64 1.71 4.31 -2.93 0.12
2014 1,046.85 1.19 133.05 1,046.77 4.92 1.15 478 -3.62 0.26
v.12014 1,084.50 1.50 124.45 1,084.41 5.51 0.61 5.47 -4.49 0.29
11712014 1,122.50 1.10 145.78 1,122.40 6.09 0.02 6.09 -5.31 0.49
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Daily Drilling

Report Date: 1/7/2014
Report #: 30

>~
H I H Depth Progress: 418.00m
ConocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 o e oo 0omis
Canada ¥ Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2
.mations
o ¢ Formation'Name Diill: Top-MD {mKB) Drlll: Top (TVD):{(mKB) : Prog:Top:TVD (mKB) .

Little Bear 31.00 31.00 31.00
Slater. River 76.00 s ~ 76.00 76:00
Arctic Red 800.50 800.46 76.40
Martin:House 938.50 938.44 76.40
Imperial 975.50 975.43 76.40
[Upper Canol 1,665.00 1,658:53 [_ 1,65340
Lower Canol 1,700.72 1,689.07 | 1,694.40

Rpt Template Revised: 8/11/2008

" Page 4/4

Report Printed: 4/14/2014




Report Date: 1/8/2014
Report #: 31

V H|H Dally D""Ing Depth Progress: 329.00m
ConocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Depth End: 1,08.00mKEB
Canadaw Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
B Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2
1 UWI Surface Legal Location MaxWell Job Number License No.
300E7665-10126-45 E-76 65-10 126-45 JOB01@2006 EL 470

Ground Elevation (m) Original KB/RT Elevation (m) Casing Flange Elevation (m) Original Spud Date Days From Spud (days)
268.20 273.40 268.00 12/28/2013 11.73
Job Category Primary Job Type Actual Start Date End Date Final Job Status Final Report?
DRILLING DRILLING ORIGINAL 12/9/2013 00:00 1/23/2014 23:59 DRILLED Yes
Daily Cost Total (Cost) Cumulative Cost (Cost) Total AFE (Cost) AFE+Supp Amt (Cost) AFE / RFE / Maint.# Estimated Days
122,564.36 3,104,609.48 6,820,300.00 6,820,300.00/10351817 34.19
Planned Depth (TMD) {(mKB) Override TVD (mKB) Head Count Personnel Total Hours (hr) Cum Personnel Total Hours (hr)
2,881.00 55.0 612.00 25,309.00
Avg Connection Gas Avg Background Gas Avg Trip Gas Max H2S (ppm)
44 30 0
Road Condition Weather Temperature (°C) Wind
Ice/Snow Cloudy -24|N.
Ops and Depth @ Morning Report Wellbore
Drill 222mm intermediate directional hole at 1555m. Original Hole

Last 24hr Summary

No incidents or accidents. 9 - HID, 1 - OBS and 0 - ASA (all closed out)

Drill 222mm intermediate directional hole from 1179m to 1508m with accumulated MWD surveys, rig services, connections and circulation times. WOB: 6-

8,000kDaN, RPM - 35 (Motor RPM - 112), Differential pressure: 3000-3500kPa, Pump rate: 1.6 m3/min. Torque: 1800 - 2400ft/Ibs, Rotate: 282m - 86% / Slide: 47m
- 14%, ROP: 15.7m/hr, Last survey at 1531.5mMD, inclination= 9.81°, azimuth= 264.58°, TVD - 1530.7m. We are 0.3m below and 1.42m left the line - 1.2° behind in
angle - 12.2m center to center - BURR: 4.5° to the 7° per 30m mark at 1630mMD, KOP: 1466mMD.

24hr Forecast

Drill 222mm intermediate directional hole with accumulated MWD surveys, rig services, connections and circulation times.

Daily Contacts

Drilling Superintend, Sheldon Vamplew, 403-999-1302; Drilling Engineer, Mike Greener, 403-771-5039; WS Supervisor, Richard Turgeon, 780-387-1706; WS
Supervisor, Dave Opper, 403-863-8205; Rig Manager, Rick Yavis, 780-718-2962; Command Centre, 403-910-0357

Last Casing String
Surface, 603.00mKB

Time Log
; . Tim G
art A S . g ; epl Start Depth "End Depth
ne; .| End.Time:| i Durhr)-|:. . Phase |- OpCode: - |‘Activity Code =X} Trbl Code (mKBY: s ((MKBYE : x - Operation : o

[UU:00 |00:15 0.25[INTRM1 RIGMNT  |SVRG P 1,179.00 1,179.00 [ Rig service function test, crown saver and hydril 14 se

00:15 |(07:30 7.25 |INTRM1 DRILL DRLG P 1,179.00 1,331.00 [ Drill 222mm intermediate hole, ulterra bit and dog sub,
pathfinder mud motor set at 1.83deg,7:8 lobe, 5 stage,
70rpm/m3 from 1179 mKB t01331 mKB.

07:30 |07:45 0.25 [INTRM1 DRILL SRVY P 1,331.00 1,331.00 | Directional survey and connections

07:45 |08:00 0.25 [INTRM1 DRILL SFTY P 1,331.00 1,331.00 [ Crew change and safety meeting, with rig crews, rig manager
and Conoco reps.

08:00 |(08:45 0.75[INTRM1 DRILL DRLG P 1,331.00 1,350.00 [ Drill 222mm intermediate hole, ulterra bit and dog sub,
pathfinder mud motor set at 1.83deg,7:8 lobe, 5 stage,
70rpm/m3 from 1331 mKB to 1350mKB.

08:45 [09:00 0.25 |INTRM1 RIGMNT |SVRG P 1,350.00 1,350.00 [Rig service function test rig smart anti collision system
function test crown saver function test pipe rams 8 sec C/O
function test flair ignitor grease ail moving parts check engine
fluid levels in floor motor HPU and pumps

09:00 (13:15 4.25INTRM1 DRILL DRLG P 1,350.00 1,417.00 [ Drill 222mm intermediate hole, ulterra bit and dog sub,
pathfinder mud motor set at 1.83deg,7:8 lobe, 5 stage,
70rpm/m3 from 1350 mKB to 1417mKB.

13:15 (13:30 0.25 |INTRM1 DRILL SFTY P 1,417.00 1,417.00 [ Safety meeting with NEB personal and B.O.P drill well secure
in 70 sec crew in positions

13:30 |15:30 2.00 | INTRMA1 DRILL DRLG P 1,417.00 1,449.00 [ Drill 222mm intermediate hole, ulterra bit and dog sub,
pathfinder mud motor set at 1.83deg,7:8 lobe, 5 stage,
70rpm/m3 from 1417 mKB to 1449 mKB.

16:30 [16:00 0.50 | INTRM1 DRILL SRVY P 1,449.00 1,449.00 | Accumulated directional survey time

16:00 [16:45 0.75{INTRM1 DRILL DRLG P 1,449.00 1,464.00 [ Drill 222mm intermediate hole, ulterra bit and dog sub,
pathfinder mud motor set at 1.83deg,7:8 lobe, 5 stage,
70rpm/m3 from 1449 mKB to 1464 mKB.

16:45 [17:00 0.25 |INTRM1 RIGMNT |SVRG P 1,464.00 1,464.00 [Rig service function test rig smart anti collision system
function test crown saver function test H.C.R 3sec O/C
function test flair ignitor grease all moving parts check engine
fluid levels in floor motor HPU and pumps

17:00 |19:00 2.00 {INTRMA1 DRILL DRLG P 1,464.00 1,480.00 | Drill 222mm intermediate hole, ulterra bit and dog sub,
pathfinder mud motor set at 1.83deg,7:8 lobe, 5 stage,
70rpm/m3 from 1464 mKB to 1480mKB.

19:00 [19:15 0.25[INTRM1 DRILL SFTY P 1,480.00 1,480.00 [ Crew change and safety meeting, with rig crews, rig manager
and Conoco reps.
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. I Report Date: 1/8/2014
C \ A Daily Drilling Dot progrex o 31
epth Progress: .00m
onocoFnillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Depth End: 1,508.00mKB
Canada % Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
g Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2
.e Log
: : |- Tim : : e

Start - . eP-| + Start Depth End Depth. | sl

= Time: |.End Time |-Dur.(hr) Phase Op Code" | Activity Code|-T-X |- TrblCode | (mMKB) (mKB):: = S - . Qperation:: - -

19:15 [23:15 4.00 | INTRM1 DRILL DRLG P 1,480.00 1,508.00 | Drill 222mm intermediate hole, ulterra bit and dog sub,
pathfinder mud motor set at 1.83deg,7:8 lobe, 5 stage,
70rpm/m3 from 1480 mKB to 1508 mKB.

23:15 |00:00 0.75[INTRM1 DRILL SRVY P 1,508.00 1,508.00 | Accumulated time for dir surveys

Fluid/Mud Chks: Mud Engineer: Corey Clark

Time Depth (mKB) Density (kg/m®) Funnel Viscosity (s/L) pH PV Override (Pa+s) YP Override (Pa)

14:00 1,434.00 975.0 48 11.0 4.0

Low Gravity Solids (%) |MBT (kg/m3) Qil Water Ratio Chlorides (mgi/L) Calcium (mg/L) Lime (kg/m?) Potassium (mg/L)

4.7 84/16 156,915 39 16

Electric Stab (V) ECD - Manual Entry (k...|Sand (%) Solids, Corr. (%) T Flowline (°C) HTHP Pressure (kPa) HTHP Filtrate (mL/30...

: 510.0 1,016.0 3.0 6.6 42 6.0

API Filtrate (mL/30min) Mud Lost to Surface (m?) Mud Lost to Hole (m?) Daily Mud Field Est (Cost)

13.00 5.00 22,657.33

Cum Mud Lost to Surface (m?) Cum Mud Lost to Hole (m®) Cumulative Mud Cost (Cost)

19.00 5.00 39,139.34

Last BOP Drill

Type Days Last Chk (... |Last Date Days Until Next... [Next Check Date

BOP Diill 0 1/8/2014 5 1/13/2014

Days Since Lost Time Incident (days) Days Since Recordable Incident (days)

819.00 819.00

Safety Incidents

: i Datel Com Categary

Drill String: BHA # 2

Bit Run |Drill Bit Length (m) IADC Bit Dull TFA (incl Noz) (mm?) BHA ROP (m/hr)

1 222.0mm, 616, 21191 0.25 1-4-CT-G-3-0-WT-BHA 924 17.2

Nozzles (mm) String Length (m) OD (mm) Max Rotating Hook Load (daN)

~ 1/14.0/14.0/14.0/14.0/14.0 1,599.00 222.0 65,000

th In (mMKB) Depth Out (mKB) Avg ROP (m/hr) Depth This Job (m) Total Depth Drilled b...|Job Drill Hrs (hr) Total Drill Hrs (hr)
603.00 1,5688.00 17.2 985.00 1,588.00 57.25 57.25

Comment

222mm Ulterra PDC bit, dog sub, Pathfinder mud motor set at 1.83 deg, 7:8 lobe, 5 stage, 70rpm/m3, NM Pony sub monel, MWD flex collar, 2 x NM flex Monels.

Drill String Components

e “Iterm Desi {D:(min): OD:(mh) Jts: Leén{(m). o oumLenm)z gt

Drill pipe - Stands 65.0 101.6 1 9.40 1,599.00

D‘riI‘l pjpe-Stands eha 65.0( « 101.6 62 1’,‘172.38 1,589.60

4" HW 70.0 132.0 37 34473 417.22

Jars‘ 60.0 161:6| - 513 72.49

4" HW 70.0 132.0 3 27.54 67.36

675" X/O 59.0 - 168.0 1 + 0:80 | 39.82

6.75" NM Flex Mon 70.0 171.0 2 17.48 39.02

6.75"‘Gaijub i :8§.Qf ; 1620 1 10.54 21:54

6.75" Flex Monel 70.0 171.0 1 9.35 21.00

NM Pony:Monel 170.0 1710 1 297.| 11:65

Mud motor 56.0| 169.0 | 1 8.28 8.68

IEog sub HRETLRLEE e e S 8001 s 222.0| : 1 0:15 0:46

Drilling Parameter: 1,449.00 - 1,508.00 mKB

Cum Depth (m) [Cum Drill... |Int ROP (... |Flow Rate..,|WOB (daN) |RPM (r... |SPP (kPa) Drill Str Wt (d... [SO Str Wt (daN) [PU Str Wt (daN) |Off-Btm Str W...|Drill Tq

905.00 4425 8.7 1.700 6,000 30 14,500 62,000 60,000 64,000 62,000 2,550.0

Hydrauli¢ Calculations 2 e : Dt e E T B e

Bit Hydraulic Powe...|HP/Area (KW/mm?) % P @ bit (%) Bit Jet Velocity (m/s) |Bit dP (kPa) P Drop Annular (kPa) |Mud Density (kg/m®) |ECD End (kg/m?)

14.6 0.00038 30.7 514.7 2743 975.0 993.6

Drill String Volume (m?) |Bit to Shoe Volume (m®) {Vol Shoe to Top (m°) Min Casing AV (m/min) |Max Casing AV (m/min) {Min Open Hole AV (m/...|Max Open Hole AV (m/..

5.21 24.96 19.46 52.8 52.8 55.6 108.0

Error

1Muyd Pump: 1, NATIONAL, 8-P-80
p Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)

- NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0

Pump Checks

: Dl - Date: . .Depthi{mKB):.: : S QUFlow: (m/min)es s s P.(kPa): S Strokes.(spm).

1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 0.499 5,150 64

1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 1.014 17,500 130
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ConocoPhillips
Canadaw

COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45

Daily Drilling

Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2

Report Date: 1/8/2014
Report #: 31

Depth Progress: 329.00m
Depth End: 1,508.00mKB
Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014

( .np Operations

Sy Start Date ; : End.Date’. Liner=Size:(mm) P-Max (kPa)- Vol/Stk: OR-(m?/stk)
1/21/2014 1/21/2014 127.0
1/22/2014 1/22/2014 127.0
Mud Pump: 2, NATIONAL, 8-P-80
Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)
2 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks
L Date DPepth:(mKB) Q Flow (m¥min) =070 P.(kPa) Sfrokes (spm).
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.647 6,855 83
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.897 15,000 115
Pump Operations
EE = - “Start Date i i EndDate Liner Size (mm) : P Max.(kRa) Vol/Stk:OR: (m¥stk)
1/19/2014 1/19/2014 127.0 15,000
1/21/2014 127.0
Shaker Screens
DPes: Start Date =iEnd:Datel Scr.Sz. X 8er'SziY. Note:
-|Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
Number Make Model Diameter (mm)
1|BOS Solutions 5500
Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks
e “Date i : Hrsi(hiy RPM:{rpm)- - Dens OF:(kg/m?) Q OF:(E/min) <+ Dens UF{kg/m?) Q:UFE: (L:/min)
1/19/2014 07:00 2.00 1800 1,000.0 0.400 2,100.0 0.200
Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
Number Make Model Diameter (mm)
2|BOS Solutions 5500
Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks
Sl sl e Dater & Hrs:(hr) RPM (rpm) Dens OF:tkg/m%) QOF{(L/min): .. Densg: UE: (Kg/im?) QUF{(/min)
- 192014 13:00 3.00 2000 990.0 0.400 1,700.0 0.200
«d / Mud Additive Amounts
s e Ry SRR -.Des Consimed: Cost: Size 2Unitsc. o
CALCIUM CHLORIDE 15.0 43.920 40.0|SX
INVERT. = 18:0 1,063.330;): 1.0:[M3
Lime 50.0 7.170 20.0|SX
OPTISEAL 5.0] - 96.200 i 2260 8X
Travis 6.0 149.670 ~ 25.0]5X
Versacoat HE: i 1:0 883570 55:01BBL:
Versatrol 4" 50 47.500 50.0[SX
Survey Data
oo Dateii *:MD{mKB) el (%) AZI{®).: TVD (mKBY Depart (m) NS:(m) EW:(m) VS (m) . - DLSH/30m)
1/8/2014 1,160.50 1.19 131.15 1,160.40 6.61 -0.54 6.59 -6.02 0.24
1/8/2014 1,198.50 212 145.56 1,198.38 7.41 -1.38 7.28 -7.04 0.80
1/8/12014 1,236.50 1.81 176.76 1,236.36 8.13 -2.55 7.72 -7.99 0.87
1/8/2014 1,274.50 1.41 163.67 1,274.34 8.67 -3.60 7.88 -8.64 0.43
1/8/2014 1,312.50 1.90 156.64 1,312.33 9.47 -4.63 8.26 -9.47 0.42
1/8/2014 1,351.50 212 141.06 1,351.30 10.68 -5.78 8.97 -10.65 0.45
1/8/2014 1,389.50 2.90 172.66 1,389.27 12.00 -7.28 9.54 -11.87 1.23
1/8/2014 1,426.50 2.78 175.74 1,426.22 13.32 -9.11 9.72 -12.92 0.16
1/8/2014 1,446.00 4.20 204.66 1,445.69 13.93 -10.23 9.46 -13.23 3.41
1/8/2014 1,464.50 2.70 229.77 1,464.15 14.21 -11.13 8.84 -13.13 3.40
1/8/2014 1,474.50 4.02 247.44 1,474.14 14.14 -11.41 8.34 -12.83 4,99
1/8/2014 1,483.50 4.60 257.05 1,483.11 13.93 -11.61 7.70 -12.37 3.08
1/8/2014 1,493.50 6.32 262.42 1,493.07 13.58 -11.78 6.76 -11.63 5.38
Formations
iyt “:;Formation Name 2Dl Top MDAMKB).. . DrlTop:(TVE):(mKB):: “ProgTop TVD{mKB) g
Little Bear 31.00 31.00 31.00
=1 River: 76.00 - 76.00 76.00
p— ic Red 800.50 800.46 76.40
Mattin House " e 938.50 1193844 7640
Imperial ‘|7 975.50 975.43 76.40
Upper Ganol - i L 01e6500] - 165853 165340
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Daily Drilling

Report Date: 1/8/2014
Report #: 31

>~
H [ H Depth Progress: 329.00m
CO“OCO"(’)*;:\L';E: COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Dopth End: 1,508.00mKE
3 Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
- Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2 '
( mations

x = Formatfon:Name: Drill Top-MD:(mKB}): 2 “Drill Top (TVD)(MKB):#+ Prog:=Top-TVD{mKB):+

‘[ Lower Canol 1,700.72 . 1,689.07 |_ 1,694.40
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Report Date: 1/9/2014

b v H Dally Drllllng Depth Progrszgf)&%oﬁ
ConocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Dopih End 1,558.00mKB
Canada % Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
- Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2
I UwI Surface Legal Location MaxWell Job Number License No.
300E7665-10126-45 E-76 65-10 126-45 JOB01@2006 EL 470
Ground Elevation (m) Original KB/RT Elevation (m) Casing Flange Elevation (m) Original Spud Date Days From Spud (days)
268.20 273.40 268.00 12/28/2013 12.73
Job Category Primary Job Type Actual Start Date End Date Final Job Status Final Report?
DRILLING DRILLING ORIGINAL 12/9/2013 00:00 1/23/2014 23:59 DRILLED Yes
‘[ Daily Cost Total (Cost) Cumulative Cost (Cost) Total AFE (Cost) AFE+Supp Amt (Cost) AFE / RFE / Maint.# Estimated Days
101,242.18 3,205,851.66 6,820,300.00 6,820,300.00] 10351817 34.19
Planned Depth (TMD) (mKB) Qverride TVD (mKB) Head Count Personnel Total Hours (hr) Cum Personnel Total Hours (hr)
2,881.00 55.0 612.00 25,921.00
Avg Connection Gas Avg Background Gas Avg Trip Gas Max H2S (ppm)
52 45 25 0
Road Condition Weather Temperature (°C) Wind
Ice/Snow Cloudy -27|NW
Ops and Depth @ Morning Report Wellbore
Slip and cut drill line. Original Hole

Last 24hr Summary
No incidents or accidents. 5 - HID, 0 - OBS and 0 - ASA (all closed out)

Drill 222mm intermediate directional hole from 1508m to 1588m with accumulated MWD surveys, rig services, connections and circulation times. WOB: 6-
8,000kDaN, RPM - 35 (Motor RPM - 112), Differential pressure: 3000-3500kPa, Pump rate: 1.6 m3/min. Torque: 1800 - 2400ft/Ibs, Rotate: 27.5m - 30% / Slide:
63.5m - 70%, ROP: 7.0m/hr. Last survey at 1580mMD, inclination= 15.60°, azimuth= 270.75°, TVD - 1678.02m. We are 3.2m below and 18.63m left the line - 0.7°
behind in angle - 30° behind in azimuth - 15.72m center to center - BURR: 5.5° to the 7° per 30m mark at 1630mMD. Pull out of the hole, laydown mud motor, bit
and dog sub. Change bit, mud motor and check MWD tool.
24hr Forecast
Finish slip and cut, run in the hole. Drill 222mm intermediate directional hole with accumulated MWD surveys, rig services, connections and circulation times.
Daily Contacts
Drilling Superintend, Sheldon Vamplew, 403-999-1302; Drilling Engineer, Mike Greener, 403-771-5039; WS Supervisor, Richard Turgeon, 780-387-1706; WS
Supervisor, Dave Opper, 403-863-8205; Rig Manager, Rick Yavis, 780-718-2962; Command Centre, 403-910-0357
Last Casing String
|Surface, 603.00mKB

[ Time Log
it Tif A . IR :
atoil o T el e e e Pl i Start Depthii | -End Depth |- : :
~-fime | EndTime| Dur(hr) | - Phase = |- Op'Code . |Activity Code] T-X| “Trbl. Code | " (mKB):.« |- (mKBY: el . HOperation el
00:00 [00:15 0.25 [INTRM1 RIGMNT  {SVRG P 1,508.00 1,508.00 |Rig service function test hydril 14 sec and crown saver
00:15 |06:45 6.50 |INTRM1 DRILL DRLG P 1,508.00 1,565.00 | Drill 222mm intermediate hole, ulterra bit and dog sub,
pathfinder mud motor set at 1.83deg,7:8 lobe, 5 stage,
70rpm/m3 from 1508 mKB to 1565 mKB.
06:45 [07:45 1.00 [INTRM1 DRILL SRVY P 1,565.00 1,565.00 [Accumulated time for directional surveys
07:45 108:00 0.25 [INTRM1 DRILL SFTY P 1,565.00 1,565.00 [ Crew change and safety meeting, with rig crews, rig manager
and Conoco reps.
08:00 |11:00 3.00 |INTRM1 DRILL DRLG P 1,565.00 1,578.00 [ Drill 222mm intermediate hole, ulterra bit and dog sub,

pathfinder mud motor set at 1.83deg,7:8 lobe, 5 stage,
70rpm/m3 from 1565 mKB to 15678 mKB.

11:00 |11:30 0.50 | INTRM1 RIGMNT  |SVRG P 1,578.00 1,578.00 |Rig service function test rig smart system, function test crown
saver, function test pipe rams 8sec c/o, grease all moving
parts, function test flare stack, check engine fluid levels in the
HPU, floor motor and pumps, change oil on pump #1

11:30 |15:00 3.50 | INTRM1 DRILL DRLG P 1,578.00 1,599.00 [ Drill 222mm intermediate hole, ulterra bit and dog sub,
pathfinder mud motor set at 1.83deg,7:8 lobe, 5 stage,
70rpm/m3 from 1578 mKB to 1599 mKB.

[15:00 |16:00 1.00 |INTRM1 DRILL SRVY P 1,599.00 1,599.00 | Accumulated directional surveys

16:00 |17:00 1.00 | INTRM1 DRILL CIRC P 1,599.00 1,599.00 | Circulate bottoms up prior to formation fit test

17:00 |17:15 0.25[INTRM1 DRILL FIT P 1,599.00 1,599.00 | Fit test to 4500 kpa hold for 10 min., held good

17:15 |17:30 0.25[INTRM1 RIGMNT  |SVRG P 1,5699.00 1,599.00 |Rig service function test H.C.R 3sec O/C function test rig
smart function test crown saver

17:30 |19:00 1.50 |INTRMA1 DRILL TRIP [ 1,599.00 1,599.00 | Trip out of hole to change bit with flow checks at 1502m,

19:00 |19:15 0.25 | INTRM1 DRILL SFTY P 1,599.00 1,599.00 [ Crew change and safety meeting, with rig crews, rig manager
and Conoco reps.

19:15 [00:00 4.75 |[INTRM1 DRILL TRIP P 1,599.00 1,599.00 | Trip out of hole with flow checks, to change out PDC bit and
mud motor

Rpt Template Revised: 8/11/2008 Page 1/3 Report Printed: 4/14/2014




(

Report Date: 1/9/2014
Report #: 32

AT Dally DrI"Ing Depth Progress: 80.00m
ConocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Dopth End. 1,585.00mKE
Canada % Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
‘” Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2
. .id/Mud Chks: Mud Engineer: Corey Clark
Time Depth (mKB) Density (kg/m3) Funnel Viscosity (s/L) pH PV Override (Pa+s) YP Override (Pa)
13:45 1,597.00 1,000.0 53 13.0 3.5
Low Gravity Solids (%) |MBT (kg/m®) Oil Water Ratio Chlorides (mg/L) Calcium (mg/L) Lime (kg/m?3) Potassium (mg/L)
4.8 85/15 197,729 47 15
Electric Stab (V) ECD - Manual Entry (k...|Sand (%) Solids, Corr. (%) T Flowline (°C) HTHP Pressure (kPa) HTHP Filtrate (mL/30...
570.0 1,049.0 3.1 6.8 49 5.0
API Filtrate (mL/30min) Mud Lost to Surface (m?) Mud Lost to Hole (m®) Daily Mud Field Est (Cost)
6.00 1.00 18,745.15
Cum Mud Lost to Surface (m?) Cum Mud Lost to Hole (m®) Cumulative Mud Cost (Cost)
25.00 6.00 57,884.49
Last BOP Drill
‘ Type Days Last Chk (... {Last Date Days Until Next... |Next Check Date
BOP Dirill 1 1/8/2014 4 1/13/2014
Days Since Lost Time Incident (days) Days Since Recordable Incident (days)
820.00 820.00
Safety Incidents
:Date- Com: Category: &
Drill String: BHA # 2
Bit Run |Drill Bit Length (m) IADC Bit Dull TFA (incl Noz) (mm?) BHA ROP (m/hr)
1 222.0mm, 616, 21191 0.25 1-4-CT-G-3-0-WT-BHA 924 17.2
Nozzles (mm) String Length (m) OD (mm) Max Rotating Hook Load (daN)
114.0/14.0/14.0/14.0/14.0/14.0 1,599.00 222.0 65,000
Depth In (mKB) Depth Out (mKB}) Avg ROP (m/hr) Depth This Job (m) Total Depth Drilled b...|Job Drill Hrs (hr) Total Drill Hrs (hr)
603.00 1,588.00 17.2 985.00 1,588.00 57.25 57.25

Comment
222mm Ulterra PDC bit, dog sub, Pathfinder mud motor set at 1.83 deg, 7:8 lobe, 5 stage, 70rpm/m3, NM Pony sub monel, MWD flex collar, 2 x NM flex Monels.

Drill String Components

: : Iter:Des: ID:{mm) QD (mm) =dts - 'Len (m) Cum Len' (m). <
/Drill pipe - Stands 65.0 101.6 1 9.40 1,599.00
“pipe -_Stands . 65.0 1016, 62 1;172:38 1;589.60
-~ HW 70.0 132.0 37 344.73 417.22
Jars 60:0 =161.0 il 513[. 97249
14" HW 70.0 132.0 3 27.54 67.36
6.75" X/O ! . -59.0 e 168:0 : 1 0.80 39.82
,_6.75" NM Flex Mon 70.0 171.0 2 17.48 39.02
675" -Gap:-Sub: 88.0 1620 1 -0:54 21.54
6.75" Flex Monel 70.0 171.0 1 9.35 21.00
I_l\/_l onvny Monel 70.0 ; =170 =1 2297 |+ 1‘1;.65
Mud motor 56.0 169.0 1 8.28 8.68
I_Dog subs - : i 60.01 = 222.0 1 0.15. 0.40
Drilling Parameter: 1,565.00 - 1,588.00 mKB
Cum Depth (m) {Cum Drill... |Int ROP (... [Flow Rate...|WOB (daN) |RPM (r... | SPP (kPa) Drill Str Wt (d... [SO Str Wt (daN) |PU Str Wt (daN) [Off-Btm Str W...| Drill Tq
985.00 57.25 3.5 1.700 7,000 30 14,800 65,000 63,000 67,000 65,000 2,800.0
Hydraulic Calculations R : s - = LD . O
Bit Hydraulic Powe...|HP/Area (kW/mm?) % P @ bit (%) Bit Jet Velocity (m/s) |Bit dP (kPa) P Drop Annular (kPa) [Mud Density (kg/m®) [ECD End (kg/m?)
14.6 0.00038 3 30.7 514.7 289.2 975.0 993.6
Drill String Volume (m?) |Bit to Shoe Volume {(m?®) |Vol Shoe to Top (m?) Min Casing AV (m/min) |Max Casing AV (m/min) [Min Open Hole AV (m/...|Max Open Hole AV (m/..
5.48 27.41 19.46 52.8 52.8 55.6 108.0
Error
Mud Pump: 1, NATIONAL, 8-P-80
Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)
1 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks
: i e soeDater s Depth (MKB):iissiasiis Q Flow:(m3/min).” i) P.(kPa) A : :-Strokes{spm)
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 0.499 5,150 64
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 1.014 17,500 130
| Pump Operations
S StartDate o s »sEndiDater i |_ Liner Size-{mm);:siiii P. Max (kPa) “NoliStk OR (m?/stk)::
12014 1/21/2014 127.0
1}22/2014 1/22/2014 127.0
Mud Pump: 2, NATIONAL, 8-P-80
Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)
2 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Rpt Template Revised: 8/11/2008 Page 2/3 Report Printed: 4/14/2014




Report Date: 1/9/2014

V H1H Daily Dri"ing Depth Pro rI::g'osr:J%O:::
ConocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Doni vt s, OOmIE
Canadaw Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2
( np Checks
= : ~:Date Depth:{mKB) : Q Flow: {ri*/min) : ‘P (kPa) . Strokés:(spm);.
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.647 6,855 83
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.897 15,000 115
Pump Operations
; ; i :Start Date= 2 - End:Date == Liner:Size {mim) o-P:Maxi(kPa) - : VolfStk OR (m®/stk)
1/19/2014 1/18/2014 127.0 15,000
1/21/2014 127.0
Shaker Screens
3 : Desss = Start Date End Date SerSziX SerSz Y. Note
Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
Number Make Model Diameter (mm)
1{BOS Solutions 5500
Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks
R Date: Hrs (hr)": . RPM.{rpm) --Dens OF (kg/m?): s QUOF(mINy i Dens:UE:(kg/m?) Q:UEH(k/min)
11/19/2014 07:00 2.00 1800 1,000.0 0.400 2,100.0 0.200
Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
Number Make Model Diameter (mm)
2|BOS Solutions 5500
Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks
i wiDates i et Hrs:(hr) RPM{(rpm) «='Dens OF.(kg/m?) : < QOF: (Lfmin)i i Dens YR (kg/me) QUF:(Edmin) g
1/19/2014 13:00 3.00 2000 990.0 0.400 1,700.0 0.200
Fluid / Mud Additive Amounts
el L . : Des Consumed i Cost L Size e oy
Barite 300.0 17.040 40.0 |SX
Barite' = , ~ 30:0 517:040 40.0SX
|CALCIUM CHLORIDE 23.0 43.920 40.0 |SX
[INVERT:: : 7.0 1,063:330 1.4 1.0( M3
" e 81.0 7170 20.0[SX
TISEAL: 10.0J_ -96.200 25.01SX
Versacoat HF 3.0 883.570 55.0 |[BBL
I_\/ers,atrol 10:0 47.500 500 [SX 4
Survey Data
Date::=: MD:(MKB) =z nel (%) AZIT %) TVD (mKB) = Départ (m) 4 NS:(i) EW (1) - VS{my DLS:(*/30m)
1/9/2014 1,503.00 7.1 268.46 1,502.50 13.14 -11.86 5.66 -10.70 3.34
1/9/2014 1,512.50 8.09 268.37 1,511.92 12.68 -11.90 4.40 -9.62 3.09
111912014 1,522.00 8.62 267.36 1,621.32 12.32 -11.95 3.02 -8.44 1.74
1/9/2014 1,5631.50 9.81 264.58 1,530.69 12.15 -12.06 1.50 -7.16 4.01
1/9/2014 1,541.00 10.78 267.18 1,540.04 12.18 -12.18 -0.19 -5.74 3.40
1/9/2014 1,550.50 11.62 269.47 1,549.36 12.40 -12.23 -2.03 -4.16 3.00
1/9/2014 1,560.00 12.59 269.78 1,5658.65 12.89 -12.24 -4.03 -2.42 3.07
1/9/2014 1,5669.50 14.41 271.28 1,5667.89 13.72 -12.22 -6.24 -0.47 5.85
1/9/2014 1,580.00 15.60 270.75 1,578.03 15.12 -12.17 -8.96 1.93 3.42
Formations
R :; Formation:Name “-Drill Top: MD (mKB).8 DrilTop: (TVD):(mKB) 5:ProgiTop:TVD (mKB)::
Little Bear 31.00 SWF 31.00
Slafter,River,¢1,, L 76.00:] w0 = i 76001 iz = 77600
Arctic Red 800.50 800.46‘!¥ 76.40
‘Martin-House,: .- 938150 : 938.44| fal 76.40
imperial 975.50 ' 975.43 76.40
Upper-Canoli ¢11,665.00 165853 165340
Lower Canol 1,700.72 1,689.07 1,694.40
{
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Report Date: 1/10/2014
Report #: 33

AT Dally D""Ing Depth Progress: 103.00m
ConocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Dopth End: 1,691.00mKB
Canada ¥ Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
. Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2
1 UwWIl Surface Legal Location MaxWell Job Number License No.
300E7665-10126-45 E-76 65-10 126-45 JOB01@2006 EL 470
Ground Elevation (m) Original KB/RT Elevation (m) Casing Flange Elevation (m) Original Spud Date Days From Spud (days)
268.20 273.40 268.00 12/28/2013 13.73
Job Category Primary Job Type Actual Start Date End Date Final Job Status Final Report?
DRILLING DRILLING ORIGINAL 12/9/2013 00:00 1/23/2014 23:59 DRILLED Yes
Daily Cost Total (Cost) Cumulative Cost (Cost) Total AFE (Cost) AFE+Supp Amt (Cost) AFE / RFE / Maint.# Estimated Days
109,595.18 3,315,446.84 6,820,300.00 6,820,300.00{ 10351817 34.19
Planned Depth (TMD)} (mKB) Override TVD (mKB) Head Count Personnel Total Hours (hr) Cum Personnel Total Hours (hr)
2,881.00 54.0 600.00 26,521.00
Avg Connection Gas Avg Background Gas Avg Trip Gas Max H2S (ppm)
500 205 25 0
Road Condition Weather Temperature (°C) Wind
Ice/Snow Clear -40|N 15 kms
Ops and Depth @ Morning Report Wellbore
Trip out of the hole to dial up mud motor. Original Hole

Last 24hr Summary

No incidents or accidents. 4 - HID, 0 - OBS and 0 - ASA (all closed out)
Make up directional BHA, run in the hole and drill 222mm intermediate directional hole from 1588m to 1691m with accumulated MWD surveys, rig services,
connections and circulation times. WOB: 6-14,000kDaN, RPM - 35 (Motor RPM - 112), Differential pressure: 3000-3500kPa, Pump rate: 1.6 m3/min. Torque: 1800 -
2400ft/Ibs, Rotate: 15m - 15% / Slide: 82.5m - 85%, ROP: 12.3m/hr. Last survey at 1683.5mMD, inclination= 31.2°, azimuth= 312.66°, TVD - 1673.53m. We are
1.11m below and 20.55m left the line - 4.55° behind in angle - 12.50° behind in azimuth - 22.32m center to center - BURR: 8.4°/30m

24hr Forecast

Pull out of the hole, dial up mud motor, change bits, run in the hole, drill 222mm intermediate directional hole with accumulated MWD surveys, rig services,
connections and circulation times.

Daily Contacts

Drilling Superintend, Sheldon Vamplew, 403-999-1302; Drilling Engineer, Mike Greener, 403-771-5039; WS Supervisor, Richard Turgeon, 780-387-1706; WS
Supervisor, Dave Opper, 403-863-8205; Rig Manager, Rick Yavis, 780-718-2962; Command Centre, 403-910-0357

Last Casing String
Surface, 603.00mKB

Time Log

s T -
artoof : . . . i lepel : Start Depth End Depth* : fae
ne: :|'End Time | .- Dur (hr) Phase: +-Op:Code Activity Code| T=X:}-Trbl Code (mKB) (mKB) RPN : Operation: 1 -

vu:00 (00:15 0.25 [INTRM1 RIGMNT  |SVRG P 1,599.00( 1,599.00 [Rig service function test blind rams and crown saver

00:15 [00:30 0.25 [INTRM1 DRILL SFTY P 1,599.00( 1,599.00 | Safety meeting with Pathfinder, change out mud motor

00:30 [03:30 3.00 [INTRM1 DRILL PULD P 1,5699.00( 1,599.00 |Change out mud motor, check MWD tool and make up bit # 2,

. Smith FHi18B, insert bit

03:30 |05:15 1.75 |INTRM1 DRILL TRIP P 1,599.00( 1,599.00 {Run in hole to the top of HWDP

05:15 [05:30 0.25 | INTRM1 DRILL SFTY P 1,599.00 1,599.00 | Safety meeting with crew, on slip and cut drilling line

05:30 (06:15 0.75 [INTRM1 RIGMNT  [SLPC P 1,699.00( 1,599.00 |Slip and cut 30m drilling line

06:15 (07:45 1.50 | INTRM1 DRILL TRIP P 1,5699.00( 1,599.00 |Run in hole, with Smith FHi18B insert bit and Pathfinder mud

. motor set at 1.83deg,7:8 lobe, 5 stage, 70rpm/m3

07:45 |08:00 0.25|INTRM1 DRILL SFTY P 1,699.00 1,599.00 [ Crew change and safety meeting, with rig crews, rig manager
and Conoco reps.

08:00 (08:45 0.75 |[INTRM1 DRILL TRIP P 1,5699.00( 1,599.00 |Run in hole from 799mKB to 950mKB

08:45 {09:00 0.25{INTRM1 DRILL SRVY P 1,599.00( 1,599.00 |Fill pipe and pulse test MWD tool

109:00 |09:15 0.25 |INTRM1 RIGMNT  |SVRG P 1,599.00 1,599.00 [Rig service function test rig smart function test crown saver
function test annular 24 sec C/O grease all moving parts
check fluid levels in floor motor and pump engines

09:15 [11:00 1.75 [INTRM1 DRILL TRIP P 1,599.00{ 1,599.00 | Trip in hole, from 956mKB to 1588mKB Change hole depth
from 1598mKB To 1588mKB

11:00 |15:15 4.25 | INTRM1 DRILL DRLG P 1,599.00( 1,624.00 |Drill 222mm intermediate hole, with Smith FHi18B insert bit
and, Pathfinder mud motor set at 1.83deg,7:8 lobe, 5 stage,
70rpm/m3 from 1599mKB to 1624mKB.

15:15 ]16:00 0.75 [INTRM1 DRILL SRVY P 1,624.00( 1,624.00 | Accumulated directional surveys

16:00 (17:15 1.25 [INTRM1 DRILL DRLG P 1,624.00] 1,636.00 [Drill 222mm intermediate hole, with Smith FHi18B insert bit
and, pathfinder mud motor set at 1.83deg,7:8 lobe, 5 stage,

_ 70rpm/m3 from 1624 mKB to 1636 mKB.

17:15 |17:30 0.25[INTRM1 RIGMNT  |SVRG P 1,636.00 1,636.00 [Rig service function test rig smart function test crown saver
function test H.C.R 3 sec O/C grease all moving parts check
fluid levels in floor motor and pump engines

( 0 [19:00 1.50 [INTRM1 DRILL DRLG P 1,636.00( 1,654.00 |Drill 222mm intermediate hole, with Smith FHi18B insert bit

s and, Pathfinder mud motor set at 1.83deg,7:8 lobe, 5 stage,
70rpm/m3 from 1636 mKB to 1654 mKB.

19:00 |19:15 0.25 | INTRM1 DRILL SFTY P 1,654.00 1,654.00 [ Crew change and safety meeting, with rig crews, rig manager
and Conoco reps.
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Report Date: 1/10/2014

Report #: 33

Shill: Dal Iy D”"Ing Depth Progress: 103.00m
ConocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Denth Eng: 161.00mKD
Canada s Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
- Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2
( e Log
| e Tim : s
“Starts | ; : : : e P i Start Depth: | *End Depth i
.:Time: | EndTime}--Bur(hr) -Phase Op-Code Activity Code | T-X.|.. Trbl'Code -(mKB) - 2(MKB) : Operation.”.- - N O
19:15 [00:00 4.75 | INTRM1 DRILL DRLG P 1,654.00 1,691.00 | Drill 222mm intermediate hole, with Smith FHi18B insert bit
and, Pathfinder mud motor set at 1.83deg,7:8 lobe, 5 stage,
70rpm/m3 from 1654mKB to 1691mKB.
|Fluid/Mud Chks: Mud Engineer: Corey Clark
Time Depth (mKB) Density (ka/m?) Funnel Viscosity (s/L) pH PV Override (Pa*s) YP Override (Pa)
14:30 1,622.00 1,020.0 54 12.0 5.0
Low Gravity Solids (%) |MBT (kg/m?) Oil Water Ratio Chilorides {mgiL) Calcium (mg/L) Lime (kg/m?3) Potassium (mg/L)
5.0 85/15 197,729 47 17
Electric Stab (V) ECD - Manual Entry (k...|Sand (%) Solids, Corr. (%) T Flowline (°C) HTHP Pressure (kPa) HTHP Filtrate (mL/30...
580.0 1,064.0 3.1 7.8 40 5.0
API Filtrate (mL/30min) Mud Lost to Surface (m3) Mud Lost to Hole (m®) Daily Mud Field Est (Cost)
2.00 0.00 2,781.15
Cum Mud Lost to Surface (m?) Cum Mud Lost to Hole (m?) Cumulative Mud Cost (Cost)
27.00 6.00 60,665.64
Last BOP Dirill
| Type Days Last Chk (... |Last Date Days Until Next... [Next Check Date
BOP Dirill 2 1/8/2014 3 1/13/2014
Days Since Lost Time Incident (days) Days Since Recordable Incident (days)
821.00 821.00
Safety Incidents
: Date Com sECategory:
Drill String: BHA # 3
Bit Run |Drill Bit Length (m) IADC Bit Dull TFA (incl Noz) (mm?) BHA ROP (m/hr)
3 222.0mm, FHi18B, RA3594 025 |- 429 8.8
Nozzles (mm) String Length (m) OD (mm) Max Rotating Hook Load (daN)
13.5/13.5/13.5 1,712.22 222.0 66,000
P~nth In (MKB) Depth Out (mKB) Avg ROP (m/hr) Depth This Job (m) Total Depth Drilled b...|Job Drill Hrs (hr) Total Drill Hrs (hr)
1,588.00 1,908.00 52 320.00 1,908.00 61.75 61.75

wwimment

222mm Smith FHi18B insert bit, Pathfinder mud motor set at 1.83 deg, 7:8 lobe, 5 stage, 70rpm/m3, NM Pony sub monel, MWD flex collar, 2 x NM flex Monels.

Drill String Components
i - : Item:Des: JD(mim), OD-(mm)i wits Len:{m) i o7 Cum. Len:(m)
Drill pipe - Stands 68 1,294.72 1,712.22
4 HW 70.0 132:0 37 344 .73 41750
Jars 161.0 7 53| 72.77
4 HW 170.0 132.0 3 27.54 | 67.64
16.75" X/O 59.0 168.01_ 1 0.80 40.10
6.75":NM Elex Mon : +:70:0 171:0 2 1748 :39.30
6.75" Gap Sub — ] 88.0 162.0 1 0.54 21.82
6.75" FlexMonel - L 70.0 171.0 A - 9.35 21:28
NM Pony Monel 70.0 171.0 1 2.97 11.93
Mud motor Mhes | ‘ 169.0( 0 1 846 8.96
222 mm BIT — 1 0.25 0.50
Drilling Parameter: 1,624.00 - 1,691.00 mKB
Cum Depth (m) [Cum Drill... [Int ROP (... [Flow Rate..]JWOB (daN) |RPM (r... |SPP {kPa) Drill Str Wt (d... [SO Str Wt (daN) [ PU Str Wt (daN) [Off-Btm Str W...|Drill Tq
103.00 11.75 8.9 1.700 13,000 30 15,500 66,000 64,000 69,000 66,000 2,480.0
Hydraulic:Calculations: s : : e e AN e = S e
Bit Hydraulic Powe...|HP/Area (kW/mm?) {% P @ bit (%) Bit Jet Velocity (m/s) [Bit dP (kPa) P Drop Annular (kPa) [Mud Density (kg/m®) [ECD End (kg/m°)

Drill String Volume (m?)

Bit to Shoe Volume (m?)

Vol Shoe to Top (m?)

Min Casing AV (m/min)

Max Casing AV (m/min)

Min Open Hole AV (m/...

Max Open Hole AV (m/..

Error

A drill string component contains a null vaiue in OD

Mud Pump: 1, NATIONAL, 8-P-80

Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)
1 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
“ mp Checks
. Date Depth (mKB): .0 i i Q:Flow{m/min):: ; i P:{kPa) e - Strokes:{spm) .-
T17zo/2014 00:00 2,909.00 0.499 5,150 64
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 1.014 17,500 130
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. N Report Date: 1/10/2014
P Dally D”"Ing Depth Pro re:??&%oﬁ
ConocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Dentn e 1:651.00mKB
, Canada ¥ Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
(’ Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2
.np Operations
s 5. 5 Start Date - : v o EndDater s : 5 Liner-Size (mm) = P.Max (kPa) -7 N olfStk OR:{m/stk)
1/21/2014 1/21/2014 127.0
1/22/2014 1/22/2014 127.0
Mud Pump: 2, NATIONAL, 8-P-80
Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)
2 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks
e : Date; 4 Depth/(mKBY condd g QFlow:(m¥/miny: : P (kPa) ; Strokes (spm):
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.647 6,855 83
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.897 15,000 115
{Pump Operations
RlAL L Start Date. . g End Date’ Linér Size (mm) ; = P Maki(kPa) : Vol/Stk OR{(m¥/stk):
1/19/2014 1/19/2014 127.0 15,000
1/21/2014 127.0
Shaker Screens
s Désii; Rt : :Start Date’: e End-Dater s : Ser Sz X . | s 8008z Y % Note
Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
Number Make Model Diameter (mm)
1|BOS Solutions 5500
Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks
: F i Datgpiha i i sl Hrs:(hi): 7 RPM(rpm) Dens:OF (kg/m?): .- QOF(L/min) Dens UF:{kg/m®) & SQUF (Limin) - i
11/19/2014 07:00 2.00 1800 1,000.0 0.400 2,10@' 0.200
Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
Number Make Model Diameter (mm)
2|BOS Solutions 5500
Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks
[ voriDaten s : Hrs (hr) ;7 RPM: (rpm) g Dens OF: (kg/m?): Q:OF(L/miny i :Dens UF:(kg/m®} QUFHE/miny
~"9/2014 13:00 3.00 2000 990.0 0.400 1,700.0 0.200
( « / Mud Additive Amounts
Ll PR ; Desii o s wl Consumed: s Cost L Size sl Wnits: o
CALCIUM CHLORIDE 4.0 43.920 40.0 |SX
INVERT: Sl = i S i 2O ] 063:330 1.0fM3
Sawdust 10.0 2.980 7.3|8X
Truvis: o R : e , 1230 ‘ 1,49.‘6704_ ¢ 25.018X
Survey Data
- Date i, 1w e MDEMKBY T dnel (o)~ | AzmA) TVD;(mKB) Depart () 2] NS{(m). - CEWEmE [ VS (m)le DLS (30m)
1/10/2014 1,599.00 19.40 278.37 1,596.15 18.73 -11.68 -14.64 7.13 6.99
1/10/2014 1,608.50 19.31 287.85 1,605.11 20.82 -10.97 -17.70 10.15 9.92
1/10/2014 1,617.50 19.80 296.44 1,613.60 22.72 -9.83 -20.48 13.14 9.71
1/10/2014 1,627.00 20.19 300.14 1,622.52 24.77 -8.29 -23.34 16.38 4.18
1/10/2014 1,636.50 21.21 303.36 1,631.41 26.99 -6.52 -26.19 19.74 4.83
1/10/2014 1,645.50 22.80 306.18 1,639.75 29.32 -4.60 -28.96 23.09 6.36
11/10/2014 1,655.00 2.48 309.35 1,648.98 30.81 -3.37 -30.62 25.14 64.18
1/10/2014 1,664.50 27.22 309.27 1,658.09 32.54 -1.84 -32.49 27.52 78.13
Formations
o =  Farmation Name & ; NI I Drill:Top:MD (mKB) i SEDHITOR (TVD)(MKB): i 2 | 2 2 Prog TopTVD {mKB)
Little Bear 31.00 31.00 31.00
‘Slater River i o s . 176:.00: e 176100 i 76100
Arctic Red | 800.50 800.46 76.40
Martin House: = : e - : s : :.938.50 93844 . 227640
Imperial ‘ 975.50 975.43 76.40
Upper.Canel = ‘ e 1,665.00 | s 16hBA3 | ' ‘ 1,663.40
[Cower Canol 1700.72 | 1,689.07 1,694.40
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Report Date: 1/11/2014

h s H | H Dally DrI"Ing Depth Progr'::g'o;t;go?::
ConocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Dopth End: 1,726.00mKB
Canada ¥ Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
- Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2
( /uUwi Surface Legal Location MaxWell Job Number License No.
300E7665-10126-45 E-76 65-10 126-45 JOB0O1@2006 EL 470
Ground Elevation (m) Original KB/RT Elevation (m) Casing Flange Elevation (m) Original Spud Date Days From Spud (days)
268.20 273.40 268.00 12/28/2013 14.73
Job Category Primary Job Type Actual Start Date End Date Final Job Status Final Report?
DRILLING DRILLING ORIGINAL 12/9/2013 00:00 1/23/2014 23:59 DRILLED Yes
Daily Cost Total (Cost) Cumulative Cost (Cost) Total AFE (Cost) AFE+Supp Amt (Cost) AFE / RFE / Maint.# Estimated Days
88,691.30 3,404,138.14 6,820,300.00 6,820,300.00) 10351817 34.19
Planned Depth (TMD) (mKB) Override TVD (mKB}) Head Count Personnel Total Hours (hr) Cum Personnel Total Hours (hr)
2,881.00 54.0 600.00 27,121.00
|Avg Connection Gas Avg Background Gas Avg Trip Gas Max H2S (ppm})
410 180 25 0
Road Condition Weather Temperature (°C) Wind
lce/Snow Clear -47|SW 15 kms
Ops and Depth @ Morning Report Welibore
Drill 222mm intermediate directional hole at 1752m. Original Hole

Last 24hr Summary
No incidents or accidents. 13 - HID, 0 - OBS and 0 - ASA (ail closed out)

Drill 222mm intermediate directional hole from 1691m to 1702m, circulate bottoms up, pull out of the hole, dial up mud motor from 1.83° to 2.12° due to the inability
to attain build rates required, check bit, run in the hole and drill 222mm intermediate directional hole from 1702m to 1726m with accumulated MWD surveys, rig
services, connections and circulation times. WOB: 6-14,000kDaN, RPM - 35 (Motor RPM - 112), Differential pressure: 3000-3500kPa, Pump rate: 1.6 m3/min.
Torque: 1800 - 2400ft/Ibs, Rotate: 0.0m - 0.0% / Slide: 24m - 100%, ROP: 4.7m/hr. Last survey at 1731mMD, inclination= 44.19°, azimuth= 306.67°, TVD -
11711.12m. We are 2.73m below and 16.65m left the line - 2.29° behind in angle - 6.67° behind in azimuth - 20.43m center to center - BURR: 8.0°/30m

24hr Forecast

Drill 222mm intermediate directional hole with accumulated MWD surveys, rig services, connections and circulation times.

Daily Contacts

Drilling Superintend, Sheldon Vamplew, 403-999-1302; Drilling Engineer, Mike Greener, 403-771-5039; WS Supervisor, Richard Turgeon, 780-387-1706; WS
Supervisor, Dave Opper, 403-863-8205; Rig Manager, Rick Yavis, 780-718-2962; Command Centre, 403-910-0357

Last Casing String

Surface, 603.00mKB

Time Log
. : i Time :
art= | = : G N K -Stairt Depth End Depth

». (ime=J:End Time|-Bur(hr)-|:: . Phase "= Op'Code! : [/Activity Code |- T-X:|“Trbl Code: |-« {(mKB) (mKB) CEEE o Operation Pana :

00:00 (00:15 0.25 [INTRM1 RIGMNT  |SVRG P 1,691.00 1,691.00 [Rig service function test rig smart crown saver, function pipe
ram's 4 sec

00:15 |[03:30 3.25INTRM1 DRILL DRLG P 1,691.00( 1,702.00 |Drill 222mm intermediate hole, with Smith FHi18B insert bit
and, Pathfinder mud motor set at 1.83deg,7:8 lobe, 5 stage,
70rpm/m3 from 1691 mKB to 1702 mKB.

03:30 |03:45 0.25[INTRM1 DRILL SRVY P 1,702.00 1,702.00 | Accumulated time for dir surveys

03:45 |(04:45 1.00 |INTRMA1 DRILL CIRC P 1,702.00( 1,702.00| Circulate & condition hole, mix weighted pilt

04:45 07:45 3.00 | INTRM1 DRILL TRIP P 1,702.00 1,702.00 [ Trip out of hole to reset mud motor from 1.83 deg. to 2.12
deg. due to the inability to attain proper build rates.

07:45 |08:00 0.25 | INTRM1 DRILL SFTY P 1,702.00 1,702.00 [Crew change and safety meeting, with rig crews, rig manager
and Conoco reps.

08:00 |10:00 2.00 |INTRM1 DRILL TRIP P 1,702.00 1,702.00 | Trip out of hole from 743mKB to 58mKB to reset mud motor
from 1.83 deg. to 2.12 deg. due to the inability to attain proper
build rates. flow checks @ 852m, 510m 87m OOH

10:00 |10:15 0.25 | INTRM1 RIGMNT  |SVRG P 1,702.00 1,702.00 [Rig service function test rig smart anti-collision system,

function test blind rams 8sec close/open, function test crown
saver, grease all moving parts and check fluid levels floor
motor, HPU, and pumps, monitor well

10:15 [10:30 0.25 | INTRM1 DRILL SFTY P 1,702.00 1,702.00 [ Safety meeting with Pathfinder directional services, prior to
working with directional tools

10:30 |11:30 1.00 [INTRM1 DRILL PULD P 1,702.00 1,702.00 [Change bend in the mud motor from 1.83 deg to 2.12deg and
inspect bit
11:30 [11:45 0.25 |INTRM1 DRILL PULD P 1,702.00 1,702.00 | Clean rig floor to prepare to trip in hole
11:45 (14:30 2.75 |INTRM1 DRILL TRIP P 1,702.00( 1,702.00 | Trip in hole from 48mKB to 686mKB
14:30 [15:00 0.50 |INTRM1 DRILL SRVY P 1,702.00 1,702.00 [ Fill pipe and test tool, outside surface casing shoe
15:00 |15:30 0.50 | INTRM1 RIGMNT  |RGRP T [Rig 1,702.00 1,702.00 | Touble shoot mud saver valve on top drive
(' 30 |[16:00 0.50 [ INTRM1 DRILL TRIP P 1,702.00{ 1,702.00 | Trip in hole from 686mKB to 898mKB
... J0 |17:00 1.00 [INTRM1 DRILL TRIP P 1,702.00( 1,702.00 | Trip in hole from 686mKB to 1223mKB
17:00 [17:15 0.25[INTRM1 RIGMNT  |SVRG P 1,702.00 1,702.00 |Rig service function test rig smart anti-collision system,

function test annular 24sec close/open, function test crown
saver, grease all moving parts and check fluid levels floor
motor, HPU, and pumps
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Report Date: 1/11/2014

4 HIH Dal Iy Drl I I I ng Depth Progr'e‘:gf)?:tsfgoe;l‘:
ConocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Derih Enact 26, 00mKB
Canadaw Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014

- Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2

e Log
: 1 Tim :
Start |52 | - - i : ] R Start Depth - |- End Depth ; ; -
:-Time: -|'End:Time |- Dur.(hr) Phase, = :Op'Code’": | Activity.Code| T-X | - Trbl Code (mKB) (mKB). v ;. Operation = 5 L L0
17:15 |19:15 2.00 | INTRM1 DRILL TRIP P 1,702.00 1,702.00 [ Trip in hole from 1223mKB to 1702m, screw into top drive,
' strart pumps, fill pipe and break circulation.

19:16 (19:30 0.25 |INTRM1 DRILL SFTY P 1,702.00 1,702.00 [ Crew change and safety meeting, with rig crews, rig manager
and Conoco reps.

19:30 |23:45 4.25 INTRM1 DRILL DRLG P 1,702.00 1,726.00 | Drill 222mm intermediate hole, with Smith FHi18B insert bit
and, Pathfinder mud motor set at 2.12deg, 7:8 lobe, 5 stage,
70rpm/m3 from 1702 mKB to 1726 mKB.

23:45 {00:00 0.25 |INTRM1 DRILL SRVY P 1,726.00 1,726.00 | Accumulated time for directional surveys

Fluid/Mud Chks: Mud Engineer: Corey Clark

Time Depth (mKB) Density (kg/m?) Funnel Viscosity (s/L) pH PV Override (Pass) YP Override (Pa)

21:30 1,712.00 1,010.0 55 12.0 5.0

Low Gravity Solids (%) [MBT (kg/m?) Oil Water Ratio Chlorides (mg/L) Calcium (mg/L) Lime (kg/m?) Potassium (mg/L})

5.0 85/15 197,729 47 17

Electric Stab (V) ECD - Manual Entry (k... |Sand (%) Solids, Corr. (%) T Flowline (°C) HTHP Pressure (kPa) HTHP Filtrate (mL/30...

580.0 1,053.0 3.1 7.8 36 5.0

API Filtrate (mL/30min) Mud Lost to Surface (m?) Mud Lost to Hole (m?) Daily Mud Field Est (Cost)

4.00 0.00 7,120.27

Cum Mud Lost to Surface (m?®) Cum Mud Lost to Hole (m?) Cumulative Mud Cost (Cost)

31.00 6.00 67,785.91

Last BOP Drill

Type Days Last Chk (... |Last Date Days Until Next... |Next Check Date

BOP Dirill 3 1/8/2014 2 1/13/2014

Days Since Lost Time Incident (days) Days Since Recordable Incident (days)

) 822.00 822.00

Safety Incidents

; saDate: e i S R g Com ; R E R % % i Category

( ‘1 String: BHA # 4
~ &un |Drill Bit Length (m) IADC Bit Dull TFA (incl Noz) (mm?) BHA ROP (m/hr)

3rr 222.0mm, FHi18B, RA3594 0.25 1-3-WT-S-1--CT-TD 429 4.3

Nozzles (mm) String Length (m) OD (mm) Max Rotating Hook Load (daN)

13.5/13.5/13.5 1,908.00 171.0 69,000

Depth In (mKB) Depth Out {mKB) Avg ROP (m/hr) Depth This Job (m) Total Depth Drilled b...|Job Drill Hrs (hr) Total Drill Hrs (hr)

1,588.00 1,908.00 52 320.00 1,908.00 61.75 61.75

Comment
222mm Smith FHi18B insert bit, Pathfinder mud motor set at 2.12 deg (1.91m bit to bend), 7:8 lobe, 5 stage, 70rpm/m3, NM Pony sub monel, MWD flex collar, 2 x

NM flex Monels.
Drill String Components

B R ; 5 Itef:Des £rish el B g DM :0OD:(mm}) i Pt Len, (M) : - Gum:Len:(my) :

Drill pipe - Singles 70.0 101.6 1 6.01 1,908.00

Drilyly,ﬂpﬁipe = Stands - ; e e 70.0 1016 78 G 1‘,484.74 - 1,901:99

4" HW 70.0 132.0 37 344.73 417.25

Jars i . - - i b : 590 1610 1 513 i 7252

THW ' 70.0 W} 3 2754 57.39

6.75"‘)([‘0 W e G : St e 59.0 : 168:0 1 080 T 39.85

6.75" NM Flex Mon 70.0 171.0‘| 2 17.48 39.05
675" Gap Sub - ENE e b o 880 1620 ’ , 1 0.54 2157

6.75" Flex Monel 70.0 171.0 1 9.35 21.03

NM Pony:-Monel | ‘ eyl lhn R : ; w700 | i 171.Q| ] 1} 297 o 11.68

Mud motor 60.0 169.0 | 1 8.46 8.71

Drilling Parameter: 1,702.00 - 1,726.00 mKB

Cum Depth (m) [Cum Drill... [Int ROP (... [Flow Rate...|WOB (daN) |RPM {(r... | SPP (kPa) Drill Str Wt (d... |SO Str Wt (daN) [PU Str Wt (daN) Off-Btm Str W...| Drill Tq

35.00 7.50 5.6 1.600 16,000 30 15,500 67,000 65,000 70,000 67,000
Hydraulic Calculations. - : o SR L : B : : e e i
Bit Hydraulic Powe...|HP/Area (kW/mm?) % P @ bit (%) Bit Jet Velocity (m/s) |Bit dP (kPa) P Drop Annular (kPa) [Mud Density (kg/m®) |ECD End (kg/m?)
58.3 0.00151 14 62.1 2,185.2 305.9 1,010.0 1,028.3

| Drill String Volume (m?) |Bit to Shoe Volume (m?) |Vol Shoe to Top (m?) Min Casing AV (m/min) |Max Casing AV (m/min) [Min Open Hole AV (m/...|Max Open Hole AV (m/..
‘ 6.63 31.64 19.46 49.7 49.7 52.3 101.6

. My

Mud Pump: 1, NATIONAL, 8-P-80

Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)

1 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
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Report Date: 1/11/2014

C 'P/h'll' Daily Drilling Dot proqr oL 34
ep! rogress: 35.00m
onocorhiips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Depth End: 1,726.00mKB
Canada % Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
( Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2
. .np Checks
3 Date “Depthi{mKB).. - Q Flow:(m¥min) P{KPa) ; Strokes (spm):
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 0.499 5,150 64
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 1.014 17,500 130
Pump Operations
ke Start-Date: LT End:Date EinerSize:(mm} P Max(kPa) VolfStk OR (m®/stk)
1/21/2014 1/21/2014 127.0
1/22/2014 1/22/2014 127.0
Mud Pump: 2, NATIONAL, 8-P-80
Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)
2 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks
i , Date Depth:(mKB) - i Q Flow (m®/min):: =P {kPa): .. StroKes (spm)
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.647 6,855 83
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.897 15,000 115
Pump Operations
G Start Date . o End:Date Liner:Size: (mm) . .. P-Max (kPa) AR YoliStk OR{{m?¥/stk)
1/19/2014 1/19/2014 127.0 15,000
1/21/2014 127.0
Shaker Screens
’ B Des Start:Date EndDate SerSz-X Ser8z:Y. -Note
Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
Number Make Model Diameter (mm)
1}BOS Solutions 5500
Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks
ca Date . . Hrs.{hr} RPM:(rpm) Dens OF (kg/m?) QOF (L/min) w7 % Dens:UF (kg/m?) QUF (L/min}
1/19/2014 07:00 2.00 1800 1,000.0 0.400 2,100.0 0.200
| Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
( ber Make Model Diameter (mm)
2|BOS Solutions 5500
Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks
S -Date: :Hrs:(hr) RPM:(rpm) Dens:OF (kg/m?): “Q:OF(L/min) < DensUE:(tkg/m?) Q UF (Limin})
1/19/2014 13:00 3.00 2000 990.0 0.400 1,700.0 0.200
Fluid / Mud Additive Amounts
R T e o : : Des - Consumed Cost S Size s - Units
Barite 40.0 17.040 40.0 |SX
INVERT 4.0 1,063.330 | “10|M3
OPTISEAL 10.0 96.200 25.0|8X
‘Truvis 5.0 +149.670 . 25.0[8X. - .
Versatrol 10.0 47.500 l 50.0 |SX
Survey Data
- Date: % /.- MD{mKB): Inel (%) Azmi2) TVD (mKBY): - Depart (m) NS:{m) EW.-(m) VS (m): DLS:(/30m)
1/11/2014 1,674.00 29.12 310.94 1,666.46 35.93 1.05 -35.92 31.92 6.50
1/11/2014 1,683.50 31.20 312.66 1,674.67 39.70 423 -39.48 36.57 7.11
1/11/2014 1,693.00 33.41 312.66 1,682.70 43.88 7.67 -43.21 41.50 6.98
1/11/2014 1,702.50 36.10 310.68 1,690.51 48.58 11.27 -47.26 46.79 9.21
Formations
E S i Formation Name - Drill TOp:MD (mKB):: "Dl Top (TVD).(mKB) . ProgiTop TVD:(MKB) L
Little Bear 31.00 31.00 31.00
Slater River 76.00|: 76.00 | s 76.00
Arctic Red 800.50 800.46 76.40
Martin House 938.50|." 93844 | 76:40
Imperial 975.50 975.43 76.40
Upper:Cariol s s 1,665.00] -+ .:1,658:63 [ 1165340
Lower Canol | 1,700.72 1,689.07 1,694.40
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Report Date: 1/12/2014
Report #: 35

300E7665-10126-45

A Dally D""Ing Depth Progress: 90.00m
ConocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Dopth End: 1,816.00mis
Canada w Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
3 - Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2
/UWI Surface Legal Location MaxWell Job Number License No.
E-76 65-10 126-45 JOB01@2006 EL 470

Ground Elevation (m) Original KB/RT Elevation (m) Casing Flange Elevation (m) Original Spud Date Days From Spud (days)
268.20 273.40 268.00 12/28/2013 16.73
Job Category Primary Job Type Actual Start Date End Date Final Job Status Final Report?
DRILLING DRILLING ORIGINAL 12/9/2013 00:00 1/23/2014 23:59 DRILLED Yes
Daily Cost Total (Cost) Cumulative Cost (Cost) Total AFE (Cost) AFE+Supp Amt (Cost) AFE / RFE / Maint.# Estimated Days
111,405.34 3,515,543.48 6,820,300.00 6,820,300.00|10351817 34.19
Planned Depth (TMD) (mKB) Override TVD (mKB) Head Count Personnel Total Hours (hr) Cum Personnel Total Hours (hr)
2,881.00 54.0 600.00 27,721.00
Avg Connection Gas Avg Background Gas Avg Trip Gas Max H2S (ppm)
640 160 0
Road Condition Weather Temperature (°C) Wind
lce/Snow Clear -45|W. 15 kms
Ops and Depth @ Morning Report Wellbore
Drill 222mm intermediate directional hole at 1832m. Original Hole

Last 24hr Summary

No incidents or accidents. 11 - HID, 2 - OBS and 0 - ASA (all closed out)

Drill 222mm intermediate directional hole from 1726m to 1816m with accumulated MWD surveys, rig services, connections and circulation times. WOB: 6-
18,000kDaN, RPM - 35 (Motor RPM - 112), Differential pressure: 500-1200kPa, Pump rate: 1.6 m3/min. Torque: 0ft/lbs, Rotate: 0.0m - 0% / Slide: 90m - 100%,
ROP: 4.6m/hr, Last survey at 1807mMD, inclination= 63.1°, azimuth= 308.96°, TVD - 1756.4m. We are 2.91m below and 1.2m left of the 1777mTVD target line -
1.12° behind in angle - 8.9° behind in azimuth - 16.6m center to center - BURR: 9.0° for 1777mTVD target, BURR: 7.86° for 1780mTVD target.

24hr Forecast

Drill 222mm intermediate directional hole with accumulated MWD surveys, rig services, connections and circulation times.

Daily Contacts

‘| Drilling Superintend, Sheldon Vamplew, 403-999-1302; Drilling Engineer, Mike Greener, 403-771-5039; WS Supervisor, Richard Turgeon, 780-387-1706; WS
Supervisor, Dave Opper, 403-863-8205; Rig Manager, Rick Yavis, 780-718-2962; Command Centre, 403-910-0357

Last Casing String
Surface, 603.00mKB

Time Log

: Tim |- | E
] v T e Pl vev i |- StartDepth - | - End Depth - L ,
18| End Time| Dur (hr) Phase.’ "/,|. " Op Code & | Activity: Code| T:-X:| - .irbl.Code. | = (mKBY) (mKB) e Operation:: N N
vu:00 |00:45 0.75 [INTRM1 DRILL DRLG P 1,726.00( 1,731.00 [ Drill 222mm intermediate hole, with Smith FHi18B insert bit
and, Pathfinder mud motor set at 2.12deg, 7:8 lobe, 5 stage,
70rpm/m3 from 1726 mKB to 1731 mKB.

00:45 (01:00 0.25 [INTRM1 RIGMNT SVRG P 1,731.00 1,731.00 [Rig service function test rig smart anti-collision system,
function test pipe ram's 4sec to close function test crown
saver, grease all moving parts and check fluid levels floor
motor, HPU, and pumps

01:00 |(06:00 5.00 [INTRM1 DRILL DRLG P 1,731.00( 1,749.00 [ Drill 222mm intermediate hole, with Smith FHi18B insert bit
and, Pathfinder mud motor set at 2.12deg, 7:8 lobe, 5 stage,
70rpm/ma3 from 1731 mKB to 1749 mKB.

06:00 [07:15 1.25 |INTRM1 RIGMNT [RGRP |T |[Rig 1,749.00( 1,749.00 |Change out 5" head & liner in pump # 2 lube side

07:15 |07:45 0.50 [INTRM1 DRILL SRVY P 1,749.00[ 1,749.00 | Accumulated time for directional surveys

07:45 |08:00 0.25[INTRM1 DRILL SFTY P 1,749.00 1,749.00 [ Crew change and safety meeting, with rig crews, rig manager
and Conoco reps.

08:00 108:15 0.25 |INTRM1 RIGMNT [RGRP |T |[Rig 1,749.00| 1,749.00 [Change liner wash basket on pump #2

08:15 [11:15 3.00 {INTRM1 DRILL DRLG P 1,749.00( 1,768.00 | Drill 222mm intermediate hole, with Smith FHi18B insert bit
and, Pathfinder mud motor set at 2.12deg, 7:8 lobe, 5 stage,
70rpm/m3 from 1749 mKB to 1768 mKB.

11:15 [11:30 0.25[INTRM1 RIGMNT  [SVRG P 1,768.00 1,768.00 |Rig service function test rig smart anti collision system
function test crown saver function test, Annular 18 sec
close/open, grease all moving and non moving parts, check
fluid levels in floor motor, switch over light plants.

11:30 [15:30 4.00 | INTRM1 DRILL DRLG P 1,768.00| 1,787.00 |Drill 222mm intermediate hole, with Smith FHi18B insert bit
and, Pathfinder mud motor set at 2.12deg, 7:8 lobe, 5 stage,
70rpm/m3 from 1768 mKB to 1787 mKB.

15:30 [16:00 0.50 [INTRMA1 DRILL SRVY P 1,787.00| 1,787.00 |Accumulated directional surveys

116:00 [16:15 0.25 |INTRM1 RIGMNT SVRG P 1,787.00 1,787.00 |Rig service function test rig smart anti collision system
function test crown saver function test, H.C.R 3 open/close,

) grease all moving and non moving parts, check fluid levels in

( floor motor, pump engines, HPU

.15 119:00 2.75|INTRM1 DRILL DRLG P 1,787.00] 1,796.00 | Drill 222mm intermediate hole, with Smith FHi18B insert bit
and, Pathfinder mud motor set at 2.12deg,7:8 lobe, 5 stage,
70rpm/m3 from 1787 mKB to 1796 mKB.

19:00 |19:15 0.25 |INTRM1 DRILL SFTY P 1,796.00 1,796.00 [ Crew change and safety meeting, with rig crews, rig manager
and Conoco reps.
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Report Date: 1/12/2014

NM flex Monels.

h Dal Iy Drllllng Depth Progrlzseg'ogf)igo‘?nsl
ConocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Depiih End. 1816.00mKD
Canada ¥ Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2
( .e Log
E : : lTim, e fi=
~EStart e - : e L e eP- Start Depth |- “End-Depth
Jime:=; |.End Time | Dut(hr) =Phase Op.Code ‘Activity Code | T=X|- Trbl Code (mKB)+ (mKB) : Opeération:: R :

19:156 [23:30 4,25 |INTRM1 DRILL DRLG P 1,796.00 1,816.00 [ Drill 222mm intermediate hole, with Smith FHi18B insert bit
and, Pathfinder mud motor set at 2.12deg,7:8 lobe, 5 stage,
70rpm/m3 from 1796 mKB to 1816 mKB.

23:30 |00:00 0.50 [INTRM1 DRILL SRVY P 1,816.00 1,816.00 [ Accumulated time for directional surveys

Fluid/Mud Chks: Mud Engineer: Corey Clark

Time Depth (mKB) Density (kg/m?) Funnel Viscosity (s/L) pH PV Override (Pa-s) YP Override (Pa)

16:00 1,788.00 1,020.0 56 14.0 5.0

Low Gravity Solids (%) |MBT (kg/m°) Oil Water Ratio Chlorides {mg/L) Calcium (mg/L) ‘|Lime (kg/m?) Potassium (mg/L)

57 85/15 221,336 53 17

Electric Stab (V) ECD - Manual Entry (k...[Sand (%) Solids, Corr. (%) T Flowline (°C) HTHP Pressure (kPa) HTHP Filtrate (mL/30...

590.0 1,065.0 3.0 8.1 51 5.0

API Filtrate (mL/30min) Mud Lost to Surface {(m?) Mud Lost to Hole {m?) Daily Mud Field Est (Cost)

4.00 0.00 9,161.31

Cum Mud Lost to Surface (m?) Cum Mud Lost to Hole (m?) Cumulative Mud Cost (Cost)

35.00 6.00 76,947.22
|Last BOP Drill

Type Days Last Chk (... |Last Date Days Until Next... |Next Check Date

BOP Dirill 4 1/8/2014 1 1/13/2014

Days Since Lost Time Incident (days) Days Since Recordable Incident (days)

823.00 823.00

Safety Incidents

i :Date? : 2 Come-# Category:

Drill String: BHA # 4

Bit Run [Drill Bit Length (m) IADC Bit Dull TFA (incl Noz) (mm?) BHA ROP (m/hr)

3rr 222.0mm, FHi18B, RA3594 0.25 1-3-WT-8-1--CT-TD 429 4.3

Nozzles (mm) String Length (m) OD (mm) Max Rotating Hook Load (daN)

;" 5/13.5/13.5 1,908.00 171.0 69,000
( h In (mKB}) Depth Out (mKB) Avg ROP (m/hr) Depth This Job (m) Total Depth Drilled b...|Job Drill Hrs (hr) Total Drill Hrs (hr)
1,5688.00 1,908.00 5.2 320.00 1,908.00 61.75 61.75
Comment

222mm Smith FHi18B insert bit, Pathfinder mud motor set at 2.12 deg (1.91m bit to bend), 7:8 lobe, 5 stage, 70rpm/m3, NM Pony sub monel, MWD flex collar, 2 x

Drill String Components

e o : |tern Desiii i 1D (mm) oD (mim): < Jts i i LON (i) CumLen:(m)::
Drill pipe - Singles 70.0 101.6 1 6.01 1,908.00
Drill:pipe -:Stands: 7 - 70:0 1016 78 - 1,484;74 . 1,901:99
4" HW 70.0 132.0 37 344.73 417.25
Jars 59:0 1610 1 5.13 72.52
4" HW 70.0 132.0 3 27.54 67.39
I_6.75" X0 ; 59.0 . 168.0 - 1 0.8010: 39.85
6.75" NM Flex Mon 70.0 171.0 2 17.48 39.05
6.75: Gap-Sub i «288.& 162:0 1 0:54: 2457
6.75" Flex Monel 70.0 171.0 1 9.35 21.03
NM Pony Monel “70:0 171.0° . 1 20 2:97 1168
Mud motor 60.0 169.0 1 8.46 8.71
Drilling Parameter: 1,787.00 - 1,816.00 mKB
Cum Depth (m) |[Cum Dirill... |Int ROP (... |Flow Rate...|WOB (daN) |RPM {r... | SPP (kPa) Drill Str Wt (d... [SO Str Wt (daN) |PU Str Wt (daN) |Off-Btm Str W...|Drill Tq
125.00 27.25 41 1.700 17,000 30 16,000 68,000 66,000 70,000 68,000
Hydraulic Calculations::: = i G D T e T - L R e S
Bit Hydraulic Powe...|HP/Area (kW/mm?) % P @ bit (%) Bit Jet Velocity (m/s) |Bit dP (kPa) P Drop Annular (kPa) |Mud Density (kg/m®) |ECD End (kg/m?)
70.6 0.00182 16 66.0 2,491.3 453.0 1,020.0 1,046.2
Drill String Volume (m?) |Bit to Shoe Volume (m®) |Vol Shoe to Top (m?) Min Casing AV (m/min) [Max Casing AV (m/min) |Min Open Hole AV (m/...[Max Open Hole AV (m/..
6.98 34.39 19.46 52.8 52.8 : 55.6 108.0
Error
Mud Pump: 1, NATIONAL, 8-P-80
"~ " pNumber Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)
(_\ NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks
PeriEseineraniai i Date: Depth(mKB) #Q Flow:tm®*min) A Pi{kPa) e Strokes (spm):
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 0.499 5,150 64
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 1.014 17,500 130
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Report Date: 1/12/2014

Report #: 35

A Dally DrI"ing Depth Progress: 90.00m
ConocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Dori B 44, 00mKB
Canada % Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
( Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2
.np Operations
iz Start:Date EndDate Liner Size (mm) ¢ P-Maxi(kPa) VolfStk- OR (m@/stk): =
1/21/2014 1/21/2014 127.0
1/22/2014 1/22/2014 127.0
Mud Pump: 2, NATIONAL, 8-P-80
Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)
2 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks
Date ‘Depthi(mKB) o Q Flow (mi*/min) P.(kPa) Strokes (spm)
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.647 6,855 83
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.897 15,000 115
Pump Operations
e sStartDate -End‘Bate Lingr:Size: (mim) P:Max:(kPa) : - V/ollStk OR {m®/stk)
1/19/2014 1/19/2014 127.0 15,000
1/21/2014 127.0
Shaker Screens
Des . Start Date: End:Date Ser8ziX Scr$z.Y. Note
Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
Number Make Model Diameter (mm)
1|BOS Solutions 5500
Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks
i i Date Hrs (hr) - N i :RPM (rpm}) ::Déns OF:(kg/m®) QOF (L/min) Dens UF (kg/m?):: Q UF:{t/min)
1/19/2014 07:00 2.00 1800 1,000.0 0.400 2,100.0 0.200
Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
Number Make Model Diameter (mm)
2|BOS Solutions 5500
Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks
Lo i = Date: Hrs(hr) RPM (rpm). o | vDens OF (kg/m?) Q:OF(E/miny Dens:UF:(kg/m?) 15k Q UF {L/min)
©7'9/2014 13:00 3.00 2000 990.0 0.400 1,700.0 0.200
( .d / Mud Additive Amounts
: . : s . Des Constimed . Cost : Size SUnits:
CALCIUM CHLORIDE 25.0 43.920 40.0|8X
INVERE =4.0 1,063:330 1:0M3 -
OPTISEAL 10.0 96.200 25.0|8X
Truvis:: 5.0 149.670 < 25.0:]8X
Versacoat HF 2.0 883.570 55.0[BBL
Versatrol 7:0 47.500 50.018X
Survey Data
i Date MD(mKB):: Ineli(). 2 AZM (2 TVDH{mKB) Depart (m) NS (m): EW-(m): VS:(ih) DLS(7/30m)
1/12/2014 1,712.00 38.62 308.96 1,698.06 53.81 14.96 -51.68 52.45 8.61
1/12/2014 1,721.50 41.71 305.96 1,705.32 59.55 18.68 -56.55 58.51 11.51
1/12/2014 1,759.50 50.91 309.66 1,731.50 85.95 35.52 -78.27 85.67 7.44
1/12/2014 1,769.00 52.32 310.15 1,737.40 93.156 40.30 -83.98 92.98 4.61
1/12/2014 1,778.50 55.50 312.17 1,742.99 100.56 45.35 -89.76 100.49 11.29
1/12/2014 1,788.00 57.58 311.87 1,748.23 108.23 50.66 -95.64 108.21 6.62
Formations
Sl Formation:Name Drill Top MD.(mKB}) =5 DAETopA(TVD) (mKB): 8 Prog Top TVD.(mKB)
Little Bear 31.00 31.00 31.00
Slater-River J_ 76.00 -76:00 7600
Arctic Red 800.50 800.46 76.40
IMiﬁn House " " i - 938.50 93844 76.40
Imperial 975.50 975.43 76.40
Upper:Canol: ; 1;6__65.00 1,658.53 | 1’::,'_653.40
Lower Canol 1,700.72 1,689.07 1,694.40
(
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Report Date: 1/13/2014
Report #: 36

» HIH Dally D”"Ing Depth Progress: 84.00m
ConocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Dopth End: 1.800.00mKa
Canadaw Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
: Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2
/ UWI Surface Legal Location MaxWell Job Number License No.
300E7665-10126-45 E-76 65-10 126-45 JOB01@2006 EL 470

Ground Elevation (m)

Original KB/RT E|

evation (m)

Casing Flange Elevation {m)

Original Spud Date

Days From Spud (days)

268.20 273.40 268.00 12/28/2013 16.73
Job Category Primary Job Type Actual Start Date End Date Final Job Status Final Report?
DRILLING DRILLING ORIGINAL 12/9/2013 00:00 1/23/2014 23:59 DRILLED Yes
Daily Cost Total (Cost) Cumulative Cost (Cost) Total AFE (Cost) AFE+Supp Amt (Cost) AFE / RFE / Maint.# Estimated Days
102,743.95 3,618,287.43 6,820,300.00 6,820,300.00[10351817 34.19
Planned Depth (TMD) (mKB) Override TVD (mKB) Head Count Personnel Total Hours (hr) Cum Personnel Total Hours (hr)
2,881.00 54.0 600.00 28,321.00
Avg Connection Gas Avg Background Gas Avg Trip Gas Max H2S (ppm)
630 220 0
Road Condition Weather Temperature (°C) Wind
Ice/Snow Cloudy -28| SE 15kms
Ops and Depth @ Morning Report Wellbore
Circulate and clean hole prior to tripping out of hole to log open hole. Original Hole

Last 24hr Summary

No incidents or accidents. 5 - HID, 1 - OBS and 0 - ASA (all closed out)

Drill 222mm intermediate directional hole from 1816m to 1900m with accumulated MWD surveys, rig services, connections and circulation times. WOB: 14-
26,000kDaN, RPM - 25 (Motor RPM - 112), Differential pressure: 500-1200kPa, Pump rate: 1.6 m3/min. Torque: 7500-9000ft/Ibs, Rotate; 27m - 32% / Slide: 57m -
68%, ROP: 4.1m/hr. Last survey at 1889.5mMD, inclination: 86.61°, azimuth: 302.26°, TVD: 1776.19mTVD. Projection at bit: Intermediate TD- 1908mMD,
inclination: 89.46°, azimuth: 302.0°, TVD: 1776.82mTVD.

24hr Forecast

run 177.8mm intermediate casing.

Circulate and clean hole, trip out of the hole, lay down directional tools, rig up loggers, run open hole logs, pull wear bushing, rig up power tongs and laydown truck,

Daily Contacts

Drilling Superintend, Sheldon Vamplew, 403-999-1302; Drilling Engineer, Mike Greener, 403-771-5039; WS Supervisor, Richard Turgeon, 780-387-1706; WS
Supervisor, Dave Opper, 403-863-8205; Rig Manager, Rick Yavis, 780-718-2962; Command Centre, 403-910-0357

Last Casing String
Surface, 603.00mKB

o—

Time Log
; iy Tim e e e
art : S : 9 e éP: : “Start Depth EndDepth : e .
Time" | End-Time | Duri(hr) | : = Phase . Op.Code. | Activity Code | T-X| : Trbl. Cadel:,| < {mKB) FL(mKB): L = Operation i - g

00:00 (02:45 2.75|INTRM1 DRILL DRLG P 1,816.00 1,825.00 | Drill 222mm intermediate hole, with Smith FHi18B insert bit
and, Pathfinder mud motor set at 2.12deg, 7:8 lobe, 5 stage,
70rpm/m3 from 1816mKB to 1825mKB.

02:45 |(03:00 0.25[INTRM1 RIGMNT  [SVRG P 1,825.00 1,825.00 | Rig service function test rig smart anti collision system
function test crown saver function test, H.C.R 3 open/close,
grease all moving and non moving parts, check fluid levels in
floor motor, pump engines, HPU

03:00 |[03:30 0.50 | INTRM1 DRILL ELOG P 1,825.00 1,825.00 | Relog gamma from 1815 m to 1826 m

03:30 |07:15 3.75|INTRM1 DRILL DRLG P 1,825.00( 1,839.00|Drill 222mm intermediate hole, with Smith FHi18B insert bit
and, Pathfinder mud motor set at 2.12deg, 7:8 lobe, 5 stage,
70rpm/m3 from 1825mKB to 1839mKB.

07:15 |07:45 0.50 {INTRM1 DRILL SRVY P 1,839.00 1,839.00 | Accumulated time for surveys

07:45 |08:00 0.25|INTRM1 DRILL SFTY P 1,839.00 1,839.00 | Crew change and safety meeting, with rig crews, rig manager
and Conoco reps.

08:00 |(09:30 1.50 [INTRM1 DRILL DRLG P 1,839.00 1,844.00 [ Drill 222mm intermediate hole, with Smith FHi18B insert bit

' and, Pathfinder mud motor set at 2.12deg, 7:8 lobe, 5 stage,
70rpm/m3 from 1839mKB to 1844mKB.

09:30 |09:45 0.25|INTRM1 RIGMNT SVRG P 1,844.00 1,844.00 | Rig service function test rig smart anti collision system
function test crown saver function test annular 18 sec
close/open, Grease all moving and non moving parts, check
fluid level in floor motor and pump engines

09:45 [10:00 0.25|INTRM1 DRILL SFTY P 1,844.00 1,844.00 [ B.O.P drill well secure in 90 sec crew in positions. Function
test flair stack ignitor function test motor Kkills.

10:00 |15:30 5.50 | INTRM1 DRILL DRLG P 1,844.00 1,863.00 | Drill 222mm intermediate hole, with Smith FHi18B insert bit
and, Pathfinder mud motor set at 2.12deg, 7:8 lobe, 5 stage,
70rpm/m3 from 1844mKB to 1863mKB.

15:30 |{16:00 0.50 | INTRM1 DRILL SRVY P 1,863.00 1,863.00 | Accumulated directional surveys

|1A:00 [16:15 0.25 | INTRMA1 RIGMNT |SVRG P 1,863.00 1,863.00 [ Rig service function test rig smart anti collision system

: function test crown saver function test pipe rams 6 sec

- close/open Grease all moving and non moving parts,check
fluid level in floor motor and pump engines

16:15 [20:00 3.75[INTRM1 DRILL DRLG P 1,863.00 1,882.00 | Drill 222mm intermediate hole, with Smith FHi18B insert bit
and, Pathfinder mud motor set at 2.12deg, 7:8 lobe, 5 stage,
70rpm/m3 from 1863mKB to 1882mKB.
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Report Date: 1/13/2014

C Vh'll' Daily Drilling Dot prog PO 38
epth Progress: 84.00m
onocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Depth End: 1,900.00mKB
Canada ¥ Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2
€ Log
: HE I 1im B e
Start a : MRt b sleP- E Start'‘Depth End Depth
Time: |- End Time }.- Dur (hr) Phase Op Code ;::| Activity Code |-T=X:|.:Trbl Code - (mKB) (mKB) ; : . Operation s S
20:00 |20:15 0.25|INTRMH1 DRILL SFTY P 1,882.00 1,882.00 [ B.O.P drill well secure in 90 sec crew in positions. Function
test flair stack ignitor function test motor kills.
20:15 |23:30 3.25|INTRM1 DRILL DRLG P 1,882.00 1,900.00 [ Drill 222mm intermediate hole, with Smith FHi18B insert bit
s and, Pathfinder mud motor set at 2.12deg, 7:8 lobe, 5 stage,
70rpm/m3 from 1882mKB t01900 mKB.
23:30 (00:00 0.50 |INTRM1 DRILL SRVY P 1,900.00 1,900.00 | Accumulated directional surveys
Fluid/Mud Chks: Mud Engineer: Corey Clark
Time Depth (mKB) Density (kg/m®) Funnel Viscosity (s/L) pH PV Override (Pars) YP Override (Pa)
15:00 1,864.00 1,015.0 59 14.0 5.0

Low Gravity Solids (%)

MBT (kg/m?)

QOil Water Ratio

Chlorides (mg/L)

Calcium (mg/L)

Lime (kg/m?)

Potassium (mg/L)

4.8 85/15 242,546 55 17
Electric Stab (V) ECD - Manual Entry (k...|Sand (%) Solids, Corr. (%) T Flowline (°C) HTHP Pressure (kPa) HTHP Filtrate (mL/30...
710.0 1,061.0 3.1 7.6 53 4.5
API Filtrate {(mL/30min) Mud Lost to Surface {m?) Mud Lost to Hole (m?) Daily Mud Field Est (Cost)
4.00 0.00 10,041.92
Cum Mud Lost to Surface (m?) Cum Mud Lost to Hole (m?) Cumulative Mud Cost (Cost)
39.00 6.00 86,989.14
Last BOP Drill
Type Days Last Chk (... | Last Date Days Until Next... |Next Check Date
BOP Dirill 0 1/13/2014 5 1/18/2014
Days Since Lost Time Incident (days) Days Since Recordable Incident (days)
824.00 824.00
Safety Incidents
i iDate Com - - Category
Drill String: BHA # 4
Bit Run |Drill Bit Length (m) IADC Bit Dull TFA (incl Noz) (mm?) BHA ROP (m/hr)
222.0mm, FHi18B, RA3594 0.25 1-3-WT-8-1--CT-TD 429 4.3
_ zles (mm) String Length (m) OD (mm) Max Rotating Hook Load (daN)
13.5/13.5/13.5 1,908.00 171.0 69,000
Depth In (mKB) Depth Out (mKB) Avg ROP (m/hr) Depth This Job (m) Total Depth Drilled b...[Job Drill Hrs (hr) Total Drill Hrs (hr)
1,588.00 1,908.00 5.2 320.00 1,908.00 61.75 61.75
Comment
222mm Smith FHi18B insert bit, Pathfinder mud motor set at 2.12 deg (1.91m bit to bend), 7:8 lobe, 5 stage, 70rpm/m3, NM Pony sub monel, MWD flex collar, 2 x
NM flex Monels.
Drill String Components
ST . : ltem Des ID;{mm) QD (mm) Jis . ‘Len{m): Cum:Len{m)
Drill pipe - Singles 70.0 101.6 1 6.01 1,908.00
Drill pipe =:Stands ; | 70.0 101.6 78 17484.74 1,901.99
4" HW 70.0 132.0 37 344.73 417.25
Jars 59.0 1610 e 513 7252
4" HW 70.0 132.0 3 27.54 67.39
6.75"X/0. : 59.0 168.0 1 0.80 39.85°
6.75" NM Flex Mon . 70.0 171.0 2 17.48 39.05
6.75" Gap Sub 58801 oy 162:0 1 0564 L 21.57
6.75" Flex Monel 70.0 171.0 1 9.35 21.03
NM Pony.Monel: 70.0 2171:0 1 2.97 - .11:68
Mud motor 60.0 169.0 1 8.46 8.71
Drilling Parameter: 1,863.00 - 1,900.00 mKB
Cum Depth (m) |Cum Drill... [Int ROP (... |[Flow Rate..{WOB (daN) [RPM (r... | SPP (kPa) Drill Str Wt (d... | SO Str Wt (daN) | PU Str Wt (daN) [Off-Btm Str W...|Drill Tq
209.00 47.75 5.3 1.700 20,000 20 16,000 69,000 66,000 72,000 69,000 8,900.0
Hydraulic Calculations e . B s . : L e s . e
Bit Hydraulic Powe...|HP/Area (kW/mm?) % P @ bit (%) Bit Jet Velocity (m/s) |Bit dP (kPa) P Drop Annular (kPa) { Mud Density (kg/m®) |ECD End (kg/m?)
70.2 0.00181 15 66.0 2,479.1 375.6 1,015.0 1,036.5
Drill String Volume (m?) |Bit to Shoe Volume (m?) |Vol Shoe to Top (m?) Min Casing AV (m/min) |Max Casing AV (m/min) |Min Open Hole AV (m/...|Max Open Hole AV (m/..
7.30 36.96 19.46 52.8 52.8 55.6 108.0
Error
.. 4 Pump: 1, NATIONAL, 8-P-80
Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)
1 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks
Sl ~=Date Depth (nKB) D 200 Q Flow (miimin) i P:(kP4) 5 ] Strokes (sprh).::
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 0.499 5,150 64
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Report Date: 1/13/2014

h P Daily Drilling Depth Progross: 84.00m
ConocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Dopih End: 1,900.00mKB
Canada ¥ Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
- Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2
‘_‘ 1p Checks
: Date Depth (mKB) : : .Q Flow:(m¥min) z P {kPa) ’ . Strokes (spim)”
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 1.014 17,500 130
Pump Operations
Giins Start Date e i End Date Liner:Size (mm) -P Max {(kPa). Vol/Stk OR (m¥stk)
1/21/2014 1/21/2014 127.0
1/22/2014 1/22/2014 127.0
Mud Pump: 2, NATIONAL, 8-P-80
Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)
2 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks
o Date - Dépth (MKB) - :Q Flow (m¥min) &7 . P (kPa) : Strokes (spm)
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.647 6,855 83
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.897 15,000 115
Pump Operations
b A Start Date G End Date i Liner-Size (mm) . P.Max (kPa) Vol/Stk OR-(m?fstk) -
1/19/2014 1/19/2014 127.0 15,000
1/21/12014 127.0
Shaker Screens
5 Des . Start Date -7 End Daté : Scr.Sz X SerSz. Y Note .
Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
Number Make Model Diameter (mm)
1|BOS Solutions 5500
Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks
R JouDate Hrs {(hr) RPM.(rpm) Dens OF . (kg/m®)-: Q OF:(Limin) Dens UF (kg/m?) Q UF(L/min)
1/19/2014 07:00 2.00 1800 1,000.0 0.400 2,100.0 0.200
Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
Number Make Model Diameter (mm)
- 2(BOS Solutions 5500
‘ trifuge/Cyclone Checks
e ;Date Hrs (hr) i RPM {rpm) Dens OF (kg/m®) ; Q OF (L/min) .Dens UE(kg/m?} 2 QUR(LmIND
1/19/2014 13:00 3.00 2000 990.0 0.400 1,700.0 0.200
Fluid / Mud Additive Amounts
T Deés’ 1.Consumied Cost i Size . Uriits
CALCIUM CHLORIDE 18.0 43.920 40.01SX
INVERT 4.0 1,063.:330 1.0|M3
Truvis 20.0 149.670 25.0|8X
Versacoat HE 2.0 883.570 +:55,0 1BBL
Versatrol 5.o—|_ 47.500 50.0[SX
Survey Data
e Date’- “:MD.(mKB): Incl (°) | AzmA0) TVD.{mKB}. - - :Depart (m) NS:(m) EW (m) SVS(m) DLS (3/30m)
1/13/2014 1,731.00 4419 306.67 1,712.27 65.74 22.51 -61.76 64.93 7.98
1/13/2014 1,797.50 60.41 310.28 1,753.12 116.17 56.00 -101.78 116.17 9.92
1/13/2014 1,807.00 63.10 308.96 1,757.62 124.40 61.34 -108.23 124.40 9.25
1/13/2014 1,816.50 66.10 308.78 1,761.69 132.88 66.72 -114.91 132.85 9.49
1/13/2014 1,825.00 69.51 308.34 1,764.91 140.67 71.63 -121.06 140.61 12.12
1/13/2014 1,835.00 73.49 307.55 1,768.08 150.07 77.46 -128.54 149.98 12.15
1/13/2014 1,845.00 76.71 307.55 1,770.65 159.68 83.35 -136.20 159.53 9.66
1/13/2014 1,854.50 79.10 305.56 1,772.64 168.93 88.88 -143.66 168.74 9.73
1/13/2014 1,864.00 80.20 304.07 1,774.35 178.26 94.21 -151.33 178.04 5.79
1/13/2014 1,873.50 82.02 303.67 1,775.81 187.64 99.44 -159.13 187.39 5.88
Formations
G ZFormation Name i:Drill TopMD {mKB) " Drill Top {TVD) (MKB) Prog Top TVD (mKB)! .,
Little Bear 31.00 31.00 31.00
Slater River 76:00 ©76.00 . 76,00
Arctic Red 800.50 800.46 76.40
Martin House 938.50( 938.44 76.40
arial 975.50 975.43 76.40
\Upper Canol - 1,665.00} 1,658,653 1,653.40
Lower Canol 1 ,700.72‘" 1,689.07 1,694.40
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Report Date: 1/14/2014
Report #: 37

- HTH Dally D""Ing Depth Progress: 8.00m
ConocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Db End: 1,908, 00mKB
Canada g Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
- Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2
) uwi Surface Legal Location MaxWell Job Number License No.
3U0E7665-10126-45 E-76 65-10 126-45 JOBO1@2006 EL 470

Ground Elevation (m)

Original KB/RT Elevation (m)

Casing Flange Elevation (m)

Original Spud Date

Days From Spud (days)

268.20 273.40 268.00 12/28/2013 17.73
Job Category Primary Job Type Actual Start Date End Date Final Job Status Final Report?
DRILLING DRILLING ORIGINAL 12/9/2013 00:00 1/23/2014 23:59 DRILLED Yes
Daily Cost Total (Cost) Cumulative Cost (Cost) Total AFE (Cost) AFE+Supp Amt (Cost) AFE / RFE / Maint.# Estimated Days
189,894.92 3,808,182.35 6,820,300.00 6,820,300.00| 10351817 34.19
Planned Depth {TMD) (mKB) Override TVD (mKB) Head Count Personnel Total Hours (hr) Cum Personnel Total Hours (hr)
2,881.00 54.0 600.00 28,921.00
Avg Connection Gas Avg Background Gas Avg Trip Gas Max H2S (ppm)
365 170 28 0
Road Condition Weather Temperature (°C) Wind
Ice/Snow Snowing -26|NW 15kms
Ops and Depth @ Morning Report Wellbore
Run 177.8mm intermediate casing at 590m. Fill every 20 joints and break circulation every 600m+/-, Original Hole

Last 24hr Summary

top drive.

No incidents or accidents. 13 - HID, 4 - OBS and 0 - ASA (all closed out)

Drill 222mm intermediate directional hole from 1900m to 1908m. Projection at bit: Intermediate TD- 1908mMD, inclination: 89.46°, azimuth: 302.0°, TVD:
1776.82mTVD. Circulate, wiper trip to 1466m (KOP), circulate 2 bottoms up and clean hole, trip out of the hole, lay down directional tools, rig up loggers. Run open
hole logs with Schlumberger, log 1 run: AIT-PEX-BHC-TLD2-ECRD to 1814m (65°) at 18:15hrs. Pull wear bushing, slip and cut drill line, change out saver sub on

24hr Forecast

Run 177.8mm intermediate casing, tag bottom, circulate bottoms up, lay down tag joint, make up and land mandrel hanger and landing joint, circulate, rig up
cementers, cement 177.8mm intermediate casing, rig out cementers, pick and make up lateral BHA.

Daily Contacts

Drilling Superintend, Sheldon Vamplew, 403-999-1302; Drilling Engineer, Mike Greener, 403-771-5039; WS Supervisor, Richard Turgeon, 780-387-1706; WS
Supervisor, Dave Opper, 403-863-8205; Rig Manager, Rick Yavis, 780-718-2962; Command Centre, 403-910-0357

Last Casing String
Surface, 603.00mKB

{

| Time Log
. Tim .
it ; : : ; : ep:| i Start Depth End Depth Y
dfne’ | End-Time | - Dur (hr)’ Phase . Op Code Activity Code | J-X:| . Trbl Code -(mKB) (mKB) e £ : : wOperation; . Vi e
00:00 |(00:30 0.50 [INTRM1 DRILL DRLG P 1,900.00( 1,901.00 | Drill 222mm intermediate hole, with Smith FHi18B insert bit
and, Pathfinder mud motor set at 2.12deg, 7:8 lobe, 5 stage,
70rpm/m3 from 1900mKB t01901 mKB.
00:30 |00:45 0.25|INTRM1 RIGMNT  |SVRG P 1,901.00 1,901.00 [ Rig service function test rig smart anti collision system
function test crown saver function test H.C.R 3sec open/close
Grease all moving and non moving parts,check fluid level in
floor motor and pump engines
00:45 |(02:30 1.75 [INTRMA1 DRILL DRLG P 1,901.00 1,908.00 | Drill 222mm intermediate hole, with Smith FHi18B insert bit
and, Pathfinder mud motor set at 2.12deg, 7:8 lobe, 5 stage,
70rpm/m3 from 1901mKB to1908mKB.
02:30 |03:15 0.75 | INTRM1 DRILL CIRC P 1,908.00 1,908.00 | Circulate bottoms up, prepair to do a wiper trip to 1466mKB
03:15 [03:30 0.25|INTRM1 DRILL SFTY P 1,908.00 1,908.00 [Held safety meeting with crew on tripping out of hole
03:30 |05:00 1.50 | INTRM1 DRILL TRIP P 1,908.00 1,908.00 | Trip out of hole from 1908mKB to 1466mKB flow checks
@1816m,1466m
05:00 |(05:45 0.75[INTRM1 DRILL TRIP P 1,908.00( 1,908.00 |Run back in hole
05:45 |07:00 1.25 | INTRM1 DRILL CIRC P 1,908.00 1,908.00 | Circulate and prepare to trip out of the hole to lay down
directional tools
07:00 107:15 0.25[INTRM1 DRILL SFTY P 1,908.00 1,908.00 [ Crew change and safety meeting, with rig crews, rig manager
and Conoco reps.
07:15 |08:00 0.75[INTRM1 DRILL CIRC P 1,908.00 1,908.00 | Circulate and prepair to trip out of the hole to lay down
directional tools
08:00 |08:15 0.25|INTRM1 RIGMNT |SVRG P 1,908.00 1,908.00 [Rig service function test rig smart anti collision system
function test crown saver function test pipe rams 5 sec
open/close Grease all moving and non moving parts,check
fluid level in floor motor and pump engines
08:15 [13:15 5.00 | INTRMA1 DRILL TRIP P 1,908.00 1,908.00 [ Trip out of hole to lay down directional tools and open hole
log Flow check at 1815m/958m/419m/74m
13:15 [13:30 0.25[INTRM1 DRILL SFTY P 1,908.00( 1,908.00 | Safety meeting Schlumberger directional Reviewed jsa#161
: lay down DC ‘
rv.30 [14:30 1.00 | INTRM1 DRILL PULD P 1,908.00 1,908.00 [ Lay down directional tools F/C OOH close/open blind rams 5
sec
14:30 |15:15 0.75|INTRM1 DRILL PULD P 1,908.00| 1,908.00 | Pull wear bushing
16:115 |15:30 0.25[INTRM1 EVALFM  |SFTY P 1,908.00| 1,908.00 | Safety meeting w/Schlumberger loggers reviewed jsa#153
Rig to and log well
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Report Date: 1/14/2014
Report #: 37

c »P/h'll' Dal Iy Drl I I I ng Depth Progress: 8.00m
onocorniiips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Depth End: 1,908.00mKB
Canada ¥ Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
- Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2
‘\ 2 Log
[ ; o [Tm| :
Start . eP- : ; Start Depth End Depth: HeN
“Time | End Time:| -Dur (hr) Phase Op Code Activity Code| -T-X| . Trb| Code (MKB) (mKB) : . Qperation .
15:30 [16:00 0.50 [INTRM1 EVALFM |ELOG P 1,908.00 1,908.00 [Wire line open hole log with Schlumberger. Run logs: AIT-
PEX-BHC-TLD2-ECRD to 1814m (65°) at 18:15hrs.
16:00 (16:15 0.25 [INTRM1 RIGMNT  [SVRG P 1,908.00 1,908.00 [Rig service, function test crown saver, brake linkage
16:15 |[21:00 4.75 | INTRM1 EVALFM |ELOG P 1,908.00 1,908.00 [ Open hole wire line logs with Schlumberger
21:00 |22:30 1.50 [ INTRMA1 EVALFM |ELOG P 1,908.00 1,908.00 [Rig out wire line equitment, clean and tidy floor
22:30 |23:15 0.75|INTRM1 DRILL PULD P 1,908.00 1,908.00 | Pick up stand of drill pipe and run in and puli wear bushing
2315 |23:45 0.50 | INTRM1 RIGMNT SLPC P 1,908.00 1,908.00 | Slip and cut 25m off drilling line, reset crown saver
23:45 |00:00 0.25 | INTRMA1 RIGMNT |RGRP T |Rig 1,908.00 1,908.00 [ Change out mud saver valve on top drive
Fluid/Mud Chks: Mud Engineer: Corey Clark
Time Depth (mKB) Density (kg/m?) Funnel Viscosity (s/L) pH PV Override (Pa°s) YP Override (Pa)
15:00 1,908.00 1,015.0 59 14.0 5.0
Low Gravity Solids (%) (MBT (kg/m°) Oil Water Ratio Chlorides (mg/L) Calcium (mg/L) Lime (kg/m?) Potassium (mg/L)

—

5.5 86/14 263,512 58 16
Electric Stab (V) ECD - Manual Entry (k...|Sand (%) Solids, Corr. (%) T Flowline (°C) HTHP Pressure (kPa) HTHP Filtrate (mL/30...
720.0 1,061.0 3.2 9.0 26 4.5
API Filtrate (mL/30min}) Mud Lost to Surface (m?) Mud Lost to Hole (m?) Daily Mud Field Est (Cost)
3.00 0.00 4,212.39
Cum Mud Lost to Surface (m?) Cum Mud Lost to Hole (m?) Cumulative Mud Cost (Cost)
42.00 6.00 91,201.53
Last BOP Drill
Type Days Last Chk (... |Last Date Days Until Next... | Next Check Date
BOP Diill 1 1/13/2014 4 1/18/2014
Days Since Lost Time Incident (days) Days Since Recordable Incident (days)
825.00 825.00
Safety Incidents
Date Com Gategory
( | String: BHA # 4
Bit Run |Drill Bit Length (m) IADC Bit Dull TFA (incl Noz) (mm?) BHA ROP (m/hr)
3rr 222.0mm, FHi18B, RA3594 0.25 1-3-WT-8-1--CT-TD 429 4.3
Nozzles (mm) String Length (m) OD (mm) Max Rotating Hook Load (daN)
13.5/13.5/13.5 1,908.00 171.0 69,000
Depth In (mKB) Depth Out (mKB) Avg ROP (m/hr) Depth This Job (m) Total Depth Drilled b...[Job Drill Hrs (hr) Total Drill Hrs (hr)
1,588.00 1,908.00 5.2 320.00 1,908.00 61.75 61.75
Comment
222mm Smith FHi18B insert bit, Pathfinder mud motor set at 2.12 deg (1.91m bit to bend), 7:8 lobe, 5 stage, 70rpm/m3, NM Pony sub monel, MWD flex collar, 2 x
NM flex Monels.
Drill String Components
St ; Item Des 1D:(mm) 0D (mm) RN Y g Sivlend(m) Cdm Leh (m)
Drill pipe - Singles 70.0 101.6 1 6.01 1,908.00
Drill pipe = Stands 70.0 10461 .. T8 1,484.74/|° 1,901.99
4" HW 70.0 132.0 37 344.73 417.25
Jars .o 59.0 1610} 11 BA3[ 72.52
4" HW 70.0 132.0 3 27.54 67.39
6.75"X/10 59.0 168.0 1 0.80 39.85
6.75" NM Flex Mon 70.0 171.0 2 17.48 39.05
6.75" Gap Sub 88.0 162.0 A . ..20.54 2157
6.75" Flex Monel 70.0 171.0 1 9.35 21.03
[NM Pony Monel 70.0 7ol 2.97 1168
Mud motor 60.0 169.0 W-I 8.46 8.71
Drilling Parameter: 1,900.00 - 1,908.00 mKB
Cum Depth (m) [Cum Drill...|Int ROP (... |Flow Rate..|WOB (daN) |RPM (r... | SPP (kPa) Drill Str Wt (d... | SO Str Wt (daN) | PU Str Wt (daN) |Off-Btm Str W...|Drill Tq
217.00 50.00 3.6 1.700 20,000 20 16,700 69,000 65,000 72,000 69,000 7,200.0
Hydrauli¢ Galculations 1 0 v 00 “ ey e VL CnETe e e '
Bit Hydraulic Powe...|HP/Area (kW/mm?) % P @ bit (%) Bit Jet Velocity (m/s) |Bit dP (kPa) P Drop Annular (kPa) |Mud Density (kg/m® [ECD End (kg/m°)
70.2 0.00181 15 66.0 2,479.1 377.2 1,015.0 1,036.6
~ ™ String Volume (m®) |Bit to Shoe Volume (m?) |Vol Shoe to Top (m?) Min Casing AV (m/min) |Max Casing AV (m/min} [Min Open Hole AV (m/...|Max Open Hole AV (m/..
7.33 37.20 19.46 52.8 52.8 55.6 108.0
‘Error
Mud Pump: 1, NATIONAL, 8-P-80
Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm}) Stroke Length (mm)
1 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
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Report Date: 1/14/2014
Report #: 37

C "ISh'“' Dally Drl "Ing Depth Progress: 8.00m
onocorniliips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Depth End: 1,908.00mKB
Canada ¥ Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
- Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2
(_ 1p Checks
e : Date = - ~Dépth (mKB) e Q:Flow (m?/min) P:(kPa) Strokes{spm)
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 0.499 5,150 64
1/20/2014 00:00 2,909.00 1.014 17,500 130
Pump Operations
. B Start Date HE ~ . EndDate Liner Size (mm) P Max (kPa) Vol/Stk'OR (m¥/stk)
1/21/2014 1/21/2014 127.0
112212014 1/22/2014 127.0
Mud Pump: 2, NATIONAL, 8-P-80
Pump Number Make Model Rod Diameter (mm) Stroke Length (mm)
2 NATIONAL 8-P-80 140.0 216.0
Pump Checks
- S euDatel Depth (mKB) : Q Flow (m¥min) - P(kPa) : Strokes (spm)
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.647 6,855 83
1/19/2014 00:00 2,513.00 0.897 15,000 115
Pump Operations
e Start Date X f L ‘EndDéte | Liner Size (mm) : P:Max (kPg) i Vol/Stk OR (m?/stk)
1/19/2014 1/19/2014 127.0 15,000
1/21/2014 127.0
Shaker Screens
s T Des Start Date =~/ End Date SerSz X, ScrSz Y Note”
Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
Number Make Model Diameter (mm)
1|/BOS Solutions 5500
Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks
- Date Hrs (hr) RPM (rpm) ‘Dens OF (kg/m®) Q OF (L/min): =0 Dens UF (kg/m?) 2 QUE (Emin): :
1/19/2014 07:00 2.00 1800 1,000.0 0.400 2,100.0 0.200
Centrifuge/Cyclone: HGS Centrifuge, BOS Solutions, 5500
" +ber Make Model Diameter (mm)
g 2|BOS Solutions 5500
Centrifuge/Cyclone Checks
L ““Date il “Hrs (hr) RPM (rpm). Dens OF (kg/m?) QOF{L/min) " : Dens UF (kg/m?) - QUE (Umiin)
1/19/2014 13:00 3.00 2000 990.0 0.400 1,700.0 0.200
Fluid / Mud Additive Amounts
L Lo Des ‘Gonsumed 2| Cost ; -Size - Units
Barite 60.0 17.040 40.0 |SX
INVERT . =3.0 1,063,330 1.0 M3
Survey Data
= ‘Date MD(mKB): . Inel (%) CAZI(®) S TVD(mKB) Depart (m) NS:(m) ~EW:{(m) VS-(m) " DLS(3/30m)
1/14/2014 1,883.00 84.71 302.88 1,776.91 197.08 104.62 -167.02 196.80 8.85
1/14/2014 1,889.50 86.61 302.26 1,777.40 203.56 108.11 -172.48 203.27 9.22
Formations
n iFormation Name Drill Top:MD.(mKB) Drill Top.(TVD) {mKB}) , Prog Top TVD (mKB)
Little Bear 31.00 31.00 31.00
SlaterRiver . - . 76.00 76.00 76.00
Arctic Red 800.50 800.46 76.40
Martin House ] 938.50 93844 - 76:40
Imperial 975.50 975.43 76.40
Upper Canol 1,665.00 1,658:53 1,6563.40
Lower Canol 1,700.72 1,689.07 1,694.40
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Report Date: 1/15/2014

b q[H Dal Iy Drl I I : ng Depth Progl?:s;r:)’goﬁ
ConocoPhillips COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45 Depth End: 1,908.00mKE
Canada;- Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014
- Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2
! uwi Surface Legal Location MaxWell Job Number License No.
300E7665-10126-45 E-76 65-10 126-45 JOB0O1@2006 EL 470
Ground Elevation (m) Original KB/RT Elevation (m) Casing Flange Elevation (m) Original Spud Date Days From Spud (days)
268.20 273.40 268.00 12/28/2013 18.73
Job Category Primary Job Type Actual Start Date End Date Final Job Status Final Report?
DRILLING DRILLING ORIGINAL 12/9/2013 00:00 1/23/2014 23:59 DRILLED Yes
Daily Cost Total (Cost) Cumulative Cost {Cost) Total AFE (Cost) AFE+Supp Amt (Cost) AFE / RFE / Maint.# Estimated Days
339,249.78 4,147,432.13 6,820,300.00 6,820,300.00{ 10351817 34.19
Planned Depth (TMD) (mKB) Override TVD (mKB) Head Count Personnel Total Hours (hr) Cum Personnel Total Hours (hr)
2,881.00 54.0 600.00 29,521.00
Avg Connection Gas Avg Background Gas Avg Trip Gas Max H2S (ppm)
170 27 0
Road Condition Weather Temperature (°C) Wind
Ice/Snow Cloudy -20|W 10 kms
Ops and Depth @ Morning Report Wellbore
Attempt to set Stream-Flo packoff seal assembly above mandrel hanger. Original Hole

Last 24hr Summary
No incidents or accidents. 8 - HID, 3 - OBS and 0 - ASA (all closed out)

Change out saver sub on top drive, rig up power tongs and laydown truck, run 177.8mm intermediate casing, tag bottom at 1908mMD, circulate bottoms up, lay
down tag joint, make up and land mandrel hanger and landing joint, circulate, rig up cementers, cement 177.8mm intermediate casing (plug down at 22:01hrs on
January 15/.14 - Full pre-flush returns: 8m3 of CW8 and 8m3 of MudPushll Spacer, cement at surface by calculated volume results), rig out cementers, lay down
landing joint.

24hr Forecast
Lift BOP, fix Strem-Flo mandrel hanger issue, set Stream-Flo packoff seal assembly and pressure test, make up BHA, run in the hole, drill out cement, float and
shoe, drill 156mm lateral hole with accumulated MWD surveys, rig services, connections and circulation times.

Daily Contacts
Drilling Superintend, Sheldon Vamplew, 403-999-1302; Drilling Engineer, Mike Greener, 403-771-5039; WS Supervisor, Richard Turgeon, 780-387-1706; WS
Supervisor, Dave Opper, 403-863-8205; Rig Manager, Rick Yavis, 780-718-2962; Command Centre, 403-910-0357

Last Casing String
Intermediate, 1,908.00mKB

| Time Log
. Tim iy :
it - s e e eRe -| i Stait Depth End Depth i
me. %} End Time | “Dur (hr) Phase:: - Op-Codei: -] Activity.Code| T-X| 1 Trbl Code | (MKB) - (mKB) C i Operation...”

00:00 |01:15 1.25[INTRM1 RIGMNT |RGRP T |Rig 1,908.00 1,908.00 | Change out mud saver valve

01:15 (02:30 1.25 [INTRM1 CASING RNCS P 1,908.00 1,908.00 [Rig up Hallmark power tongs and Trottier laydown truck

02:30 |02:45 0.25 | INTRM1 CASING SFTY P 1,908.00 1,908.00 [ Safety meeting on running tong with Hallmark tong service
and lay down truck hands

02:45 |07:45 5.00 [ INTRM1 CASING RNCS P 1,908.00f 1,908.00 |[Make up 1-177.8mm float shoe, 1-joint of 177.8mm,
38.69kg/m, P-110, LTC intermediate casing and 1-177.8mm
float collar.

07:45 |08:00 0.25|INTRM1 CASING SFTY P 1,908.00 1,908.00 | Crew change and safety meeting, Rig manager and Conoco
Reps where present

08:00 |(08:15 0.25{INTRMA1 RIGMNT  |SVRG P 1,908.00 1,908.00 |Rig service, check brake linkage

08:15 {17:00 8.75[INTRM1 CASING RNCS P 1,908.00{ 1,908.00 |Run 149-joints of 177.8mm, 38.69kg/m, P-110, LTC
intermediate casing from 1908m to 5.20m. Run 32 x Volant
Hydroform centralizers from 1511m to 1908m, run 10
Weatherford Micro Seal Packers from 1415m to 1535m then
run 36 Topco bow spring centralizers, fill every 20 joints and
break circulation every 700m, tag bottom at 1908mMD. Total
length of 177.8mm intermediate casing: 1907.17m. Landed at
1907m, tagged bottom at 1908m, float at 1895.07m.

17:00 |18:45 1.75 [INTRM1 CASING CIRC P 1,908.00 1,908.00 | Circulate bottoms up, laydown tag joint, make up mandrel
hanger and landing joint. Land mandrel hanger and circulate.

18:45 |19:00 0.25|INTRM1 CEMENT [SFTY P 1,908.00 1,908.00 [Hold safety meeting with Schlumberger cementers prior to
cementing 177.8mm intermediate casing.
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Conocgl"",hillips

Canadas

Daily Drilling

COPRC DODO CANYON E-76 65-10 126-45

Rig: Beaver Drilling Ltd. 2

Report Date: 1/15/2014
Report #: 38

Depth Progress: 0.00m
Depth End: 1,908.00mKB
Rig Release Date: 1/23/2014

2Log

“start -

Time: |:End:Time

Dur ¢hr)

Phase

“0Op Code

Activity.Code

Tim
€P-

7-x |- Trbl Code

Start Depth
: (MiKB)

End Depth
(MmKB)

Operation

19:00 |23:00

4.00

INTRMA1

CEMENT

CMNT

P

1,908.00

1,908.00

Rig up Schlumberger cementers to cement 177.8mm
intermediate casing, pump 8m3 of 1000kg/m3 CW8 pre-flush,
stop and pressure test line to 21,000kPA (held OK), bleed off
pressure, then pump 8m3 of 1200kg/m3 MUDPUSH Il pre-
flush spacer and then pump 20 tonnes/24.8m3 (30% excess)
of HILITE 1400 Lead cement with 0.2% Anti Foam + 0.6%
Fluid Loss + 0.6% Low Temp Dispersant + 60L/tonne Gas
Control Agent + 0.3% Antisettling from 1369m to 5.20m then
pump 13 tonnes/9.8m3 (30% excess) of 1900kg/m3
Conventional Class G Tail Cement with 0.6% Fluid Loss +
0.5% Dispersant + 0.2% Anti Foam + 0.2% Retarder +
72Ltonne Gas Control Agent from 1908m to 1369m. Drop
plug and displace 37.8m3 of invert. Bump plug 3,500kpa over
final circulating pressure of 6,500kpa at 22:01hrs on January
15th 2014, bleed pressure and check floats (holding OK).
Pressure test casing to 18,500kpa for 10 minutes (holding
OK). Bleed pressure and rig out cementers. Full pre-flush
returns: 8m3 of CW8 and 8m3 of MudPushll Spacer, cement
at surface by calculated volume results.

23:00 (23:45

0.75

INTRM1 DRILL

RURD

1,908.00

1,908.00

Lay down landing joint.

23:45 |(00:00

0.25

INTRMA1 DRILL

RURD

Non-rig
Surface
Eap

1,908.00

1,908.00

Attempt to set Stream-Flo packoff seal assembly above
mandrel hanger.

Fluid/Mud Chks: Mud Engineer: Corey Clark

Time
15:20

Depth (mKB)
1,908.00

Density (kg/im°)

1,0565.0

Funnel Viscosity (s/L)

pH
68

PV Override (Pas)
14.0

YP Override (Pa)
5.0

!.ow Gravity Solids (%)

MBT (kg/m°)

Oil Water Ratio

Chlorides (mg/L})

Calcium (mg/L)

Lime (kg/m?) Potassium (mg/L)

86/14 263,512 58 16
,tric Stab (V) ECD - Manual Entry (k...|Sand (%) Solids, Corr. (%) T Flowline (°C) HTHP Pressure (kPa) HTHP Filtrate (mL/30...
700.0 1,061.0 3.2 9.0 32 4.5
API Fiitrate (mL/30min) Mud Lost to Surface (m?) Mud Lost to Hole (m?) Daily Mud Field Est (Cost)
2.00 0.00 2,126.66
Cum Mud Lost to Surface (m?) Cum Mud Lost to Hole (m°) Cumulative Mud Cost (Cost)
44.00 6.00 93,328.19
Last BOP Drill
Type Days Last Chk (... |Last Date Days Until Next... |Next Check Date
BOP Drill 2 1/13/2014 3 1/18/2014
Days Since Lost Time Incident (days) Days Since Recordable Incident (days)
826.00 826.00
Safety Incidents
Date =Com Category.
Drill String: BHA # <BHA No.?>
Bit Run |Drill Bit Length (m) IADC Bit Dull TFA (incl Noz) (mm?) BHA ROP (m/hr)
Nozzles (mm) String Length {m) OD (mm) Max Rotating Hook Load (daN)
Depth In (mKB) Depth Out (mKB) Avg ROP (m/hr) Depth This Job (m) Total Depth Drilled b...|Job Drill Hrs (hr) Total Drill Hrs (hr)
Comment
Drill String Components
£ e <% ltem Des 1D -{rrmn) 0D {mm) S solen{m) “22-Cum Len(m)
Drilling Parameter: <depthstart> - <depthend> mKB
Cum Depth (m) [Cum Drill...|Int ROP (... |Flow Rate..|WOB (daN) |RPM (r... | SPP (kPa) Drill Str Wt (d... [ SO Str Wt (daN) | PU Str Wt (daN) |Off-Btm Str W...| Drill Tq
Hydraulic Calculations 5 ¢ plios o ne ) . o : : S e
HP/Area (kW/mm?) % P @ bit (%) Bit Jet Velocity (m/s) | Bit dP (kPa) P Drop Annular (kPa) |Mud Density (kg/m® |ECD End (kg/m?)

Bit Hydraulic Powe...

.+ String Volume {(m?)

Bit to Shoe Volume (m?)

Vol Shoe to Top {m?)

Min Casing AV (m/min)

Max Casing AV (m/min)

Min Open Hole AV (m/...|Max Open Hole AV (m/..

Error
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